BID # 0071-13

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF VEHICLES

By:
Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
808 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162
Contact: Stephanie Welise, QPA

| _Number of Bids Received | | Vendor Name and Address |
III Hertrich Fleet Services; 1427 Bay Rd., Milford, DE 19963-6129
Larson Ford, Inc.; 1150 Ocean Ave., Lakewood, NJ 08701

Mid-Atlantic Truck Centre, Inc.; 525 Linden Ave. West,
Linden, NJ 07036
Route 23 Automall, LLC; 1301 Route 23, Butler, NJ 07405

(SEE TALLY SHEETS FOR BIDS AS OPENED AND PUBLICLY READ)




PROPOSAL 1

1628- 21301-13 BIDS BY | TEM - SUNMMARY 12/ 18/ 13 PAGE
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL LARSON FORD, | NC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M D- ATLANTI C TRUC
00127899, 13 27899. 13| 24995. 00 24895. 00| 25945, 00 25845, 00

002 5000. 00 5000. 00| 5000. 00 5000. 00| 3700.00 3700. 00|
TOTALS 22899, 13| 19995. 00| 22245, 00|



PROPOSAL 1

1628- 21301- 13 Bl DS BY | TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
01 1 EA 2014 ( OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRIVE 1/2 TON SUPER CAE Pl CKUP W TH
8 FT BED, AS SPECIFIED

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 27899. 13 27,899.13

43087 LARSOMN FORD, | NC. 248985, 00 24,995, 00

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERMW CES 25945, 00 25, 945, 00

55178 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BI D
ooz 1 EA TRADE IN OF:

MCPS PT#9139; SERI AL NO. #1FTWK30676EABG322
MIDEL 2006 FORD F- 350 SUPER DUTY Pl CKUP
TRUCK. M LEAGE: 108, 287 (AS OF 8/31/13)

0B454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 5000. 00 5§, 000, 00-
43087 LARSON FORD, | NC, 5000. 00 5, 000. 00-
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 3700. 00 3, 700, 00-

56179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | MC MO Bl D

12/18/13

PAGE



PROPOSAL 2

1629- 21301-13 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMVRRY 12/ 1813
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL LARSON FORD, | NC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M D- ATLANTI C TRUC
00124010. 00 24010. 00} 22430. 00  22430. 00| 22226.00  22226. 00

002 2500.00  2500.00] 3000.00 3000. 00| 2300. 00 2300. 00| I
TOTALS 21510, 00| ! 19430, 00| 19926. 00| |

P AGE



PROPOSAL 2

1828- 21301-13 BIDS BY | TEM 12/18/13
PRI CE ANDUNT
001 1 EA 2014 (OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRIVE 1/2 TON PICKUP WTH 8 FT BED,

AS SPECIFIED
ROUTE 23 AUTONMALL 24010, 00 24,010,
LARSON FORD, | NC. 22430. 00 22,430,
HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 22226. 00 22, 228.
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, 1NC NO

1 EA TRADE IN OF:
MCPS PT#9041 SERI AL NO #1FTNF20LX3EA37848
MODEL 2003 FORD F- 260 SUPER DUTY PI CKUP
TRUCK. M LEAGE 22,997.8 (AS OF 8/19/13)

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 2500. 00 2, 500,
LARSON FORD, | NC. 3000. 00 3, 00O,
HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 2300. 00 2, 300.
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC NO

PAGE



PROPOSAL 3

1630- 21301-13 BI DS BY I TEM 12/ 18/ 13 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
001 1 EA 2014 ({OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) TWD WHEEL

08454
43087
53681

DRIVE 1/2 TON PICKUP WTH B FT BED, AS

SPECI FI ED
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 23350. 13 23, 380.13
LARSON FORD, | MNC. 20202. 00 20, 202. 00
HERTRI CH FLEET SERMVI CES 20586, 00 20, 586. 00
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, INC NO BI D

1 EA TRADE IN OF:
MCPS PT#7174 SERI AL NO #1GDJC34REBXFO13622
MODEL 1998 GMC C500 MASOM BODY DUMP TRUCK
M LEAGE: 42,602 (AS OF B/31/13)

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 5500, 00 5, 600. 00-
LARSON FORD, | NC. 500, 0O 500. 00-
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 2000, 00 2, 000. 00-
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC NO Bl D

1 EA 2014 {OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR] TWD WHEEL
DRIVE 1/2 TON PICKUF WTH B FT BED, AS

SPECI FI ED
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 23350, 13 23, 360. 13
LARSON FORD, | NC. 20202. 00 20, 202, 00
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES 205886, 00 20, 586. 00
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BI D

1 EA TRADE IN OF:
NMCPS PT#7231 SERI AL NO #1GTCS14W118231949

MODEL 2001 GNC SONOMA Pl CKUP TRUCK

M LEAGE 70, 240 AS OF 8/31/13
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 3000, 00 3, 000, 00-
LARSON FORD, 1 NC, 500. 00 500, 00-

HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI| CES 1300. 00 1, 200, 00-



PROPOSAL 3

1630- 21301-13 Bl DS BY | TEM 12/18/13 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
66179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, INC NO Bl D
005 1 EA 2014 (OR CURRENT PRODUCTION YEAR} TWD WWHEEL

DRIVE 1/2 TON PICKUP WTH 8 FT BED, AS

SPECI Fl ED
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 23260, 13 23, 350. 13
LARSON FORD, 1 NC, 20202, 00 20, 202. 00
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 20586. 00 20, 5B6. 00
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BID

1 EA TRADE IN OF:
NCPS PT#7215 SERI AL NO #1FTNF20LB1EB2B114
MODEL 2001 FORD F- 250 Pl CKUP TRUCK
M LEAGE: 101, 224.6 (AS OF 8/31/13)

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 3500. 00 3, 500, 00-
LARSON FORD, | NC. 2000. 00 2, 000, 00-
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES 1300. 00 1, 300, 00-
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, 1NC NO BID

1T EA 2014 (OR CURRENT PRODUCTI OM YEAR) TWD VHEEL
DRIVE 1/2 TON PICKUP WTH 8 FT BED, AS

SPECI Fl ED
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 23350, 13 23, 350. 13
LARSON FORD, | NC. 20202, 00 20, 202. 00
HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 20586. 00 20, 586. 00
M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BI D

1 EA TRADE I N OF:
MCPS PT#7232 SERI AL NO #1GTCS14WK18233477
MODEL 2001 FOR SONOMA Pl CKUP TRUCK
M LEAGE: 68,038 { AS OF 8/31/13)



PROPOSAL 3

1830- 21301-13

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

43087 LARSON FORD, I NC.

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES

55179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |MNC

BI DS BY | TEM 12/18/13 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
1500. 00 1, 500, 00-
500. 00 500. 00-
1600. 00 1, 600. 00-



PROPOSAL 3

1630- 21301-13 BIDS BY I TEM - SUMVARY 12/18/13 PAGE
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL LARSON FORD, | NC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M DO- ATLANTI C TRUC
12

00123360, 23350, 13| 20202. 00 20202. 00| 205886, 00 205886. 00
002 5500, 00 5600. 00| 500. 00 500. 00| 2000. 00 2000. 00|
00323350. 13 23350, 13| 20202. 00 20202, 00| 20586, 00 205886. 00|
004 3000. 00 3000. 00| 500,00 500. 00| 1300. 00 1300. 00|

00523350, 13 23350, 13|20202.00 20202, 00|20586.00 20586, 00|
008 3500.00  3500.00| 2000.00 2000. 00| 1300. 00 1300. 00|
0D0723350. 13 23350.13|20202.00 20202. 00| 20586. 00  20586. 00|
008 1500.00 1500, 00| 500, 00 500, 00| 1600. 00 1600. 00|

TOTALS 79900. 52| 77308, 00| 76144, 00|



PROPOSAL 4

1631- 21301- 13 BIDS BY | TEM - SUMMRRY 12/18/13 PAGE
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL LARSON FORD, "I NC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M D- ATLANTI C TRUC
00132338, 82 32338.82(31985.00 31985, 00| 30822, 00 30822, Q0

002 2500.00  2600.00| 5675.00 5675. 00| '3200. 00 3200. 00|
003 |31985. 00 31985, 00|30822. 00  30822. 00|
004 | 9000. 00 9000. 00| 6300. 00 6§300. 00|

TOTALS 29838, 82| 49295, 00| 52144, 00|



PROPOSAL 4

1831- 21301-13 BIDS BY | TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
om 1T EA 2014 (OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRI VE, HEAVY-DUTY 1- TON Pl CKUP TRUCK
W TH SNOWPLOW ATTACHWENT

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 32338. 82 32, 338. 82

43087 LARSON FORD, 1 NC. 31985. 00 31, 986. 00

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 30822, 00 30, 822. 00

56170 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC NO BI D
002 1 EA TRADE I N OF:

MCPS PT#9045, SERI AL #1FTSF31L93EA3TRED
2003 FORD F- 250 SUPER DUTY 4X4 Pl CKUP TRUCK
WTH 8 FOOT VESTERMN UNI MOUNT SNOW PLOW

M LEAGE AS OF 8/6/12 - 85,204, 7 M LES

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 2500. 00 2, 500, 00-

43087 LARSON FORD, |INC. 5675. 00 5, 675. 00-

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 3200. 00 3, 200. 00-

56179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BID
003 1 EA 2013 {OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRI VE, HEAVY DUTY 1- TON Pl CKUP TRUCK
W TH SNOWPLOW ATTACHNVENT

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BID

43087 LARSON FORD, | NC. 31985. 00 31, 985. 00

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES 30822, 00 30, 822, 00

55178 M D- ATLANT| C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO BI D
004 1 EA  TRADE IN OF:

NCPS PT#9177, SERI AL #1FTW31598BECB7468
2008 FORD F- 360 SUPER DUTY, 4X4 Pl CKUP
TRUCK W TH B FOOT WESTERN SNOW PLOW

MLEAGE AS OF 11/1/13 - 95,119.0 M LES

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL MO EI D
43087 LARSON FORD, | NC. 9000. 00 g, 000. 00-

12/18/13 PAGE



PROPOSAL &4

1631- 21301- 13 BI DS BY | TEM 12/18/13 ° PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 6300. 00 6, 300, 00-

55179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO Bl D



PROPOSAL 5
1632- 21301- 13 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMVARY 12/18/13 PAGE
ROUTE 23 AUTONMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTﬂHﬁLLl LARSON FORD, | MC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M D- ATLANTI C TRUC
00132743. 76 32743, 76| 39487, 00 39487, 00| 37481, 00 37481. 00

002 3000.00  3000.00| 500.00 600. 00| 3500.00 3500, 00|
00332743. 76 32743.76|39487.00 39487.00|37481.00  37481.00|
004 2500,.00 2500.00| 500.00 500. 00| 1300. 00 1300, 00|

TOTALS 59887, 52| 77974, 00| 70162, 00|



PROPOSAL 5

1632- 21301- 13 BIDS BY | TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
om 1 EA 2014 [ OR CURRENT FRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRI VE, DUAL REAR VHEEL CAB & CHASSI S
WTH 3° MASON BODY DUNP AND COMPLETE SNOW
FLOW PACKAGE, AS SPECI F| ED

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMBLL 32743. 76 32,743. 76

43087 LARSON FORD, | NC. 39487, 00 39, 487. 00

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 37481, 00 37, 481. 00

55179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC NO Bl D
oo2 1 EA  TRADE | N OF:

MCPS PT#7175, SERI AL #1GDJK34RXFO14958
MODEL 1899 GMC K3500 MASON BODY DUNP TRUCK
WTH 8.5 FOOT UNI - NOUNT SNOW PLOW

M LEAGE: 40,480.0 (AS OF 10/ 3/13)

0B454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 3000. 00 3. 000. 00-

43087 LARSON FORD, |NC. 500. 00 500. 00-

53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES 3500. 00 3, 500. 00-

55179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC NO Bl D
003 1 EA 2014 {OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) FOUR

WHEEL DRI VE, DUAL REAR VWHEEL CAB & CHASSI S
WTH 9'° MASON BODY DUMP AND CONPLETE SMOW
PLOW PACKAGE, AS SPECI FIED

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMBLL 32743 786 32,743, 76

43087 LARSON FORD, 1 NC, 39487. 00 39, 487. 00

E3681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES a7481. 00 37, 481. 00

56179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, 1NC WO BI D
o044 1 EA TRADE IN OF:

NCPS PT#7119, SERI AL #2FDKF37HXRCATS181
MODEL 1994 FORD F- 350 MASON BODY DUNP TRUCK
WTH 8 8" UNI - MDUNT VESTERN SNOWPLOW

M LEAGE: 30,42B.6 (AS OF 10/3/13)

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL 2500. 00 2, 800, 00-

12418/ 13 P AGE



PROPOSAL 5

1632- 21301- 13

43087 LARSON FORD, 1 NC.
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES
55179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC

BI DS

PRI CE

§00. 00
1300. 00

BY | TEM 12/18/13 P AGE

ANDUNT

500, 00-
1, 300. 0O-



PROPOSAL 6

1633- 21301-13 BI DS BY | TEM 12/18/13 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
0o 1T EA 2014 {OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) TWO DOOR

08454
43087

CONVENTI ONAL CAB AND CHASSIS, 4 X 2
(6 VHEEL CONF| GURATION) W TH 10' (6 CU ¥D}
DUNP BODY AND 10 FOOT SNOW PLOW PACKAGE

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BI D
LARSON FORD, | NC. NO BID
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES NO Bl D

M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, INC 122925, 00 122,925, 00

1 EA  TRADE [N OF:
NCPS PT#9050, SER| AL #1HTWAAANX3ZJOSBEE0
2002 | NTERNATI ONAL 7300 DI ESEL DUNP TRUCK,
WTH 10 FOOT VESTERN UNI MDUNT PRO SNOW FLOW
M LEAGE: 50, 301.0 MLES AS OF 10/14/13

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL MO BI D
LARSON FORD, | NC. NO BI D
HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES NO BI D

M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC 10000, 00 10, 000, 00-

1 EA  ADDI TI ONAL OPTI ON #1:

EXTENDED BASE CHASSIS WARRANTY TO 36 NONTHS
OR B0, 000 M LES

ROUTE 23 AUTOMBLL NO BID
LARSON FORD, | NC. NC BI D
HERTRI CH FLEET SERVI CES NG Bl D

M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC 1600, 00 1, 600, 00

1 EA  ADDI TI ONAL OPTION #2:
EXTENDED ENGI NE WARRANTY 7 YEARS OR 100, 000

MLES OR 3, 600 HOURS | NCLUD| NG 1| NJECTORS
AND TURBO

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BID
LARSOM FORD, 1 NC. NO BID



PROPOSAL 6

1633- 21301-13 Bl DS BY | TEM 12/ 18113 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES NO Bl D
65179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | MNC 2100. 00 2,100. 00
005 1 EA  ADDI Tl ONAL OPTI ON #3:

EXTENDED ALLI SON TRANSM S5 ON WARRANTY TO
60 MONTHS AND UNLI M TED M LES

0B454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BI D
43087 LARSON FORD, | NC. NO Bl D
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES NO BI D

561749 M D= ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, | NC 446, 00 448, 00



PROPOSAL 6

1633- 21301-13
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL
ROUTE 23 AUTOMBLL

LARSON FORD,

BIDS BY | TEM - SUMMARY

I NC,

HERTRI CH FLEET SE

12/ 18/13

M D- ATLANTI C TRUC

22925, 00
| 10000. 00
| 1600. 00
| 2100.00
| 448.00

122925. 00
10000. 00|
1600, 00|
2100. 00|
446, 00|
117071. 00|

P AGE



PROPOSAL 7

1634- 620-13 BI DS BY I TEM - SUMWRRY 12/ 18/ 13 PAGE
ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL

ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL LARSON FORD, | NC. HERTRI CH FLEET SE M D- ATLANTI C TRUC
001 18233. 00 18233, Q0

002 I | 1100.00  1100.00|
TOTALS | | 17133. 00|



PROPOSAL 7

1634- 520-13 BI DS BY I TEM 12/18/13
PRI CE ANDUNT
001 1 EA 2014 ({OR CURRENT PRODUCTI ON YEAR) SPORT
UTILITY VEHICLE, AS SPECIFI ED
08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BI D
43087 LARSOM FORD, | NC. NO BI D
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWI CES 18233. 00 18, 233. 00
56179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC MO BID
002 1 EA TRADE IN OF:

MCPS PT#7233, SERI AL #1FAFP5B211A290078
MODEL: 2001 FORD TAURUS STATI ON WAGOM
M LEAGE: 91,755.0 (AS OF 10/23/13)

08454 ROUTE 23 AUTOMALL NO BID
43087 LARSON FORD, 1 NC, NO BI D
53681 HERTRI CH FLEET SERWVI CES 1100. 0O 1, 100. 00-

65179 M D- ATLANTI C TRUCK CENTRE, |NC NO BID

PAGE



