BID # 0031-13

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GOLF COURSE SUPPLIES

By:
Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Read
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phaone: (732) B42-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-41862
Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

| Number of Bids Received | | Vendor Name and Address |
II Fertl-Soil Turf Supply, Inc.; 514 Martin Place, PO Box 997,
Scotch Plains, NJ 07076

Grass Roots Turf Products, Inc.; PO Box 336, Mt. Freedom, NJ 07970
John Deere Landscapes, Inc.; 1385 East 36" St., Cleveland, OH 44114

(SEE FOLLOWING TALLY SHEETS FOR BIDS AS OPENED AND PUBLICLY READ)




0249-520-13
FERTL-S0IL TURF S

FERTL-50IL TURF S|
00L. 12,75 12.75|

0o2 21.14 21.14|
003 17.24 362.04|
004 17.24 51.72|
005 17.24 51.72]|
006 102.40 204.80)
007 15.35 30.701
oo8 14.20 255.601
009 14.20 127.801
010 254.10 1016.40|
0rl 234.80 1174.50]
012 255.60 1022.40]
113 26.80 107.20]
014 236.25 2945.00|
015 29.60 207.20|
016 54.60 273.00]
017 11Q.75 221.50|
0le 110.7% 443.00]
019 164.70 9E8.20|
020 45,095 29.90|
021 96.90 484.50|
a2 96.90 193.80|
Jd3 136.88 136.68|
024 433.70 433.70|
025 30.50 122.00]
026 99.00 99.00|
027 23.10 46.20|

BIDS BY ITEM

GRASS ROOTS TURFE |

13.00
21.00
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76.20]
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JOHN DEERE LANDSC|
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0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM - SUMMARY 3/05/13 BAGE 2
FERTL-S0OIL TURF 5 GRASS ROOTS TURF JOHN DEERE LANDSC

nzge 23.00 46.00] 23.85 47.70| 24.592 49.84|
028 4.01 32.08]| 4.20 33.60| 4.42 35.36|
030 B.00 16.00] 7.70 15.40| |
031 16.41 590.76] 16.70 601.20| 17.49 629.64|

03z 17.60 1108.80| 18.05 1137.15] 18.89 1190.071

033  22.58 90.32] 23.10 92.40] 24.12 96.48|
034 42.20 42.20|  43.85 43.85|  45.82 45.82|
VT S 67.80|  5.70 68,40/ |
T 67.80|  5.70 68.40] I
- G T 67.80|  5.70 68.40] |
038 11.60 417.80]| 12.25 441.001 12.66 455.76|
039 27.95  111.80| 28.45 113.80]  27.97 111.88]
040 27.95  111.80| 28.45 113.80| 29.75 119.00]
041  27.95  279.50| 28.45  284.50| 29.75  297.50]
042 325.00  325.00| 218.00  218.00| r
043 162.80  325.60] 169.00  338.00| 176.86 353.72|
044 147.20  294.40] 153.00  306.00| 159.98 319.96|
045 258.20  516.40| 268.00  536.00| 280.57 561.14]
0d6 €75 108.00] 6.90 110.40f  7.24 115.84|
047 12.98  103.84| 13.25 106.00] 13.87 110.96|
048 144.15  576.60] 150.00 600.00| 156.77 627.08]
049 | | I
050 22.90  137.40] 23.80 142.80| 24.92  149.52|
051  3.99 63.84]  4.00 64.00]  4.22 67.52|
052 27.25  163.50] 29.75 178.50| |

053 (11330 10as.700 1l4.50 1030.50] I
054  48.85 439.65] 46.95 422 _.55]| |



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM - SUMMARY 3/05/13 PAGE 3
FERTL-SOIL TURF S GRASS ROOTS TURFE JOHN DEERE LANDSC

055 498.%90 498.90]| 519.00 519.00| 510.17 510.17]
056 295.40  590.80| 310.00 620.00| 321.57 643.14|
057 25.90  129.50| 26.90 134.50|  28.14 140.70]
056 61.45  491.60| 63.00 504.00] . 65.92 527.361
059 S51.70  103.40| 52.00 104.00] I
060 165.00  165.00| 168.40 168.40| 175.88 175.88|
06l 145.70 291.40| 149.15 2898.30| 155.75 311.501
062 9.55 191.00] 8.50 170.00] |
0e3 &3, 90 127.80| 65.00 120.00] |
064  30.48 60.96]  30.75 61.501 32.16 64.321
065  30.48 30.48|  30.75 30,751  32.16 32.16|
066  69.70 69.70|  70.80 70.80] I
067  2.89 34.68| 2.80 33.601 I
068  1.66 6.64| 1.60 6.40] I
069  10.40 20.80| 10.40 20.80| I
070 .44 7.04] .40 6.40] I
071 .44 1.76] .40 1.601 |
072 B5.00 170.00] 55.00 110.001 |
073 101.60  203.20| 64.00 128.00] I
074 44.00  264.00| 44.65 267.90|  46.63 279.78]
075 21.70 65.101 22.60 67.80| I
076 60.40 181.20| 61.00 183.00] !
077 33.65  100.951 33.85 101.55] I
078 185.00  185.00| 166.00 166.00| I
079  8.90 17.80] 9.90 19.80| 1
08B0 117.25  234.50| 108.00 216.00] I

08l 174.60 1396.B80| 137.00 1096.00] I



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM - SUMMARY 3/05/13 FAGE
FERTL-50IL TURF 5 GRASS ROOTS TURF JOHN DEERE LANDSC

0Bz 59.00 59.00] 48.00 48.00] |
083 202.50 B10.001 237.00 948.001 217.06 BeB.24|
084  3632.00 369.00] 3692.00 369.00| |
085 1399.B0  13%9.80| 965.15 965.1%| €15.02 619.02|
086 1335.00 1335.001 994.00 994.00] I

087 577.40  1154.801 677.00 1354.00] |
088  43.00  3999.00] 41.50 3859.501 |

089 43.00 602.00] 43.65 611.10] I
oo 4.80 192.00| 3.95 158.00] I
0ol .85 20.40| .58 13.92| |
o2 19.60 58.80] 23.30 69.90] I

TOTALS 316896.45] 26723.07| 18884. 38|



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM
PRICE AMOUNT
001 1 EA HOLE IN WHITE PAINT (1 CAN)
EAGLE COME, R251
11750 FERTL-S50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 12.75 12.75
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 13.00 13.00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES WO BID
002 1 EA  PAINT APPLICATOR W/LONG HANDLE
PAR AIDE, 12401

11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUFFPLY INC. 21.14 21.14
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 21.00 21.00
178E4 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 22.51 22.51
003 21 EA Egghggkgf EEEE_EiEEP CRRTS ON PATH"

11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 17.24 362.04
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 17.70 371.70
17884 JOHN DEERE LRANDSCAFES -18.49 388.29
e e e

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 17.24 51.72
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 17.70 53.10
17864 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 18.49 55.47
005 3 EA BEEHEE%ET Eégﬂ_;gﬂﬂfﬁ———b“

11750 FERTL-SO0IL TURF SUFFLY INC. 17.24 51.72
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 17,70 53.10

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 18.49 55.47

3/05/13

PRAGE
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0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13

FRICE AMOUNT
006 2 EA DIRECTIONAL MARKERS
BAR AIDE, 12250-25, GREEN AND WHITE
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 102.40 204.80
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 103.00 206.00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES 107.73 215.46
007 2 EA GREEN LINE INFO SIGN, STANDARD, 10345
“IT'S EVERY PLAYER'S RESPONSIBILITY..."
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 15.35 30.70
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 16.15 32.30
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES MO BID
ooa 18 EA  ROYALINE FLAG STICK 7.5' WHITE W/RED STRIPE
STANDARD (ERCH), 26101
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 14.20 255.60
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 14.40 259.20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES - NO BID
009 9 EA ROYALINE FLAG STICK 7.5'WHITE W/BELUE STRIFE
STANDARD (EACH), 26104
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPFLY INC. 14.20 127.80
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 14.40 125.60
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES MO BID
010 4 Eb SAREEEEE?HEEE-E%BG STICKS (9 PER SET)
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUFPLY INC. 254.10 1,016.40
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 2B.45 113.80

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRFPES 28.75 119.00



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13 PAGE 3

FRICE AMOUNT
011 5 EA TAPERED FIBERGLASS TOURNAMENT STICKS
PRR-AIDE, BRIGHT YELLOW(9 PER SET), 707-079
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUFPLY INC. 234.90 1,174.50
14470  GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 26.90 134.50
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 553.50 2,767.50
012 4 EA  TAPERED FIBERGLASS TOURNAMENT STICKS
PAR-AIDE, BRIGHT WHITE (9 PER SET), 70B-079
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 255,60 1,022.40
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF BRODUCTS 29.25 117.00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 553,50 2,214.00
013 4 EA  TRAPERED FIBERGLASS TOURNAMENT STICKS 2/4"
FAR-AIDE, BRIGHT WHITE (EACH), 706-079
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 26.80 107.20
14470  GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 26.90 107.60
17864 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 28.14 112.56
014 4 EA  TAPERED FIBERGLASS TOURNAMENT STICKS 3/4"
PAR-AIDE, BRIGHT WHITE (SET OF 9), 706-07%
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUFFLY INC. 236.25 945.00
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 26.90 107.60
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES 553.50 2,214.00
015 7 EA LASERLINK SMARTY REFLECTCR
PRAR AIDE, 1736
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 29.60 207.20
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 29.60 207.20

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 32.16 225.12



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM

PRICE AMOUNT
0le 5 EA TWO TONE FLAGS-NYLON YELLOW WITH BLACK TUBE
STANDARD {9 PER SET), 22780T
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUFPPLY INC. 54.60 273.00
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 6.15 30.75
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES WO BID
017 2 EA Twl TONE FLAGS-NYLON YELLOW WITH BLACE TUBE

AND BLACK SCREEN PRINTING (% PER SET)
STANDRRD, 227BOT & 21014

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 110.75 221.50

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 113.240 226.40

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
ole 4 EA TWO TONE FLAGS-NYLON YELLOW WITH BLACK TUBE

AND BLACK SCREEN PRINTING (9 PER SET)
STANDRRD, 22780T & 29094

11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 110.75 443.00

144790 GRASE ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 113.20 452.B0

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES NO BID
019 6 ERh SEWN CHECKERED FLAG W/SCREEN PRINTING

{BLACK) STANDARD(S PER SET) 22330TF & 26139

11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 164.70 988.20

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 170.00 1,020.00

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
M m ygmmlect EAN i

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 49.95 99.90

14470 GEASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 50,00 100.00

3/05/13 FRGE



0249-520-13 ' BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE BAMOUNT
17884 JOHN DEERE LARNDSCAFPES NO BID
021 5 EA CHECKERED FLAGS — RED & WHITE; TUBE
PRR RIDE (9 PER SET) B502
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 96.90 484.50
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 959.00 495.00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 103.71 518.55
02z 2 ER  CHECKERED FLAGS - BLUE & WHITE; TUBE
FAR RIDE (9 PER SET) 8312
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY IMNC. 96.90 193.80
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 99.00 198,00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 103.71 207.42
023 1 EA FLAGSTICK CADDIE, STANDARD, 25000
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPFLY INC. - 136.68 136.68
14470 GEASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 140.00 140.00
178E4 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES NO BID
024 1 EA HIO HOLE CUTTER, PAR AIDE, 1003-02
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPFLY IHNC. 433.70 433.70
14470 GRASS RCOTS TURF FPRODUCTS 76,20 16.20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 79.59 79.59
025 4 En CUP CUTTER BLADES 7" SCALLOPED
FAR RIDE, 1008-01
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 30.50 122.00

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 31.50 126.00

3/05/13

PAGE
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0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE BMOUNT

JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES 32.96 131.84

1 EA REPLACEMENT HIOQ BLADE - QUTSIDE SHARFPENED
MILTONA, L-6252

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 99.00 9%9.00
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 76.20 76.20
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES NG BID

2 EA HOLE CUTTER DEPTH GAUGE
PAR AIDE, 1034

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY IMNC. 23.10 46.20
GRASS ROOTS TURF FPRODUCTS 23.00 46.00
JOHN DEEEE LANDSCAFPES 24,12 48.24

2 En HOLE CUTTER HRNDLE WITH BUBELE LEVEL
FAR AIDE, 1029

FERTL-S0IL TURF SUFPLY INC. 23.00 46.00

GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 23.85 47.70
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 24.92 49.84

8 EA PRACTICE GREEN CUPS (EACH)
FAR-AIDE, 940

FERTL~-SOIL TURF SUPFLY INC. 4.01 32.08
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 4.20 33.60
JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES 4.42 35.36

2 EA CUP HOOK, STANDRRD, 33200
FERTL-S50IL TURF SUFPPLY INC. g.00 16.00

3/05/13

PAGE

&



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13 PRAGE 7

FRICE BMOUNT

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 7.70 15.40
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES WO BID
031 36 EA  ALUMINUM PUTTING CUP, PAR RIDE, 33200

11750 FERTL~-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 16.41 530,76
14470 GRARSS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 16.70 601.20 *

17684 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 17.49 629.64
032 63 ER EVER-WHITE ALUMINUM CUP W/SLEEVE (EACH)

PAR-AIDE, 935

11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPFLY INC. 17.60 1,108.80

14470 GRASS ROQTS TURF FRODUCTS 18.05 1,137.15

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 18.89 1,180.07
033 4 EA SET OF 1B EVER-WHITE CUF SLEEVES

: PAR-SIDE, 935-1 -

11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 22.58 a0.32
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 23.10 92.40
17884 JOHN CEERE LANDSCAFES 24.12 96.48
034 1 Ea CUP HOLE CLEANER, PAR-AIDE, 950

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 42.20 42.20
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 43,85 43.85
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 45,82 45.82
035 12 E& CLASSIC TEE MARKER (RED) EACH

STANDARD, 5600
11750 FERTL-S50IL TURF SUFPPLY INC. 5.65 67.80



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM

BFRICE AMOUNT
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 5.70 68.40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC BID

12 EA CLASSIC TEE MARKER (WHITE) EACH
STANDARD, 5601

FERTL-50IL TOURF SUFFLY INC. 5.65 67.80
GRAS5 ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 5.70 68.40
JOHH DEERE LANDSCAPES HO BID

12 EA CLASSIC TEE MARKER (BLUE) ERCH
STANDARRD, 5602

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 5.65 67.80
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 5.70 6E.40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC BID

36 ER ALUMINUM LOW-FROFILE TEE MAREER
FRR-AIDE, HUNTER GEEEN, 647-6

FERTL-50IL TURF SUFPLY INC. 11.60 417.860
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 12.25 441.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 12.66 455.76

4 EA  CAST ALUMINUM TEE MARKER (PAR-RIDE RED)
PAR-RIDE, 6&55-1

FERTL-S50IL TURF SUFPLY INC. 27.95 111.80
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 28.45 112.80
JOHMN DEERE LANDSCAFES 27.97 111.88

4 EA CAST ALUMINUM TEE MARKER (WHITE)
PAR-RIDE, €55-2

3/05/13 PAGE



0249-520-13

FRICE
FERTL-501IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 27.95
GRASS RCOTS TURF FRODUCTS 28.45
JOHN DEERE LANDSCRFES 29.75

BIDS BY ITEM

AMOUNT

111.80
113.80
119.00

10 EA CAST ALUMINUM TEE MARKER (ELUE)
PAR-AIDE, 655-3

FERTL-50IL TURF SUFFLY INC. 27.95
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 2B.45
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 29.75

1 EA RENEW-A-TEE, FORE-EVER-MARKED,
2 PART SOLUTION

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFPLY INC. 325.00
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 218.00
JOHM DEERE LANDSCAFES

2 EA LELUXE BALLWASHER, FAR-AIDE, HUNTER GREEMN,

203-02
FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 162,80
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 169,00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 176.86

325.60
338.00
353.72

11750
14470
17684

2 ER MASTER BALLWASHER/WITHOUT STAND, PAR-AIDE,

HUNTER GREEN, 205-02

FERTL~-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 147.20
GRASS ROOTS TURF FPRODUCTS 153.00

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 155.98

294.40
306.00
319.96

3/05/13

PAGE
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0249-520-13

FRICE

2 EA PRACTICE RANGE ENSEMBLE, PAR-AILE,
FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPFLY INC. 258,20
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 268.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 280.57

16 EA SPIKE BRUSH REFLACEMENT SIDE BRUSH
PAR-AIDE, 548

FERTL=-S0TIL TURF SUPELY INC. 6.75
GRAS5 ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 6.90
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES 7.24

B EA SPIKE BRUSH REPLACEMENT BASE BRUSH
PAR-AIDE, 554-11

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 12.98
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 13.25
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 132.87

4 ER PORTRBLE SPIKE BRUSH STRND
PAR ARIDE, 512-11

FERTL-S0OIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 144.15
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 150.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 156.77

SCRUSHER BOTTOM BRUSH, STANDARD, 14102

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC.
GRARSS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

BIDS BY ITEM

AMOUNT

460-02

516.40
536.00

HC BID
NO BID
NOQ BID

3/05/13

PAGE 10



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13 FRAGE

FRICE RMOUNT
050 6 EA LOW STAND FOR DIVOT MATE, PRR AIDE, 3030
.11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 22,90 137.40
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 23.80 142.80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 24.92 149.52
051 16 EA DIVCT MATE CONTAINER SCOOP, PAR AIDE, 400
11750 FERTL-SOIL TUREF SUFPLY INC. 3.5%9 63.84
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 4.00 64.00
17864 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 4.22 67.52
052 6 EA LARGE COTTON TOWELS 18"X13", GREEN
STANDARD (1PK = 12 TOWELS), 4200
11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 27.25 163.50
14470 GRASS ROCTS TURF FRODUCTS 29.75 178.50
17464 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
053 9 EA CHIX TOWELS (200 PER CARSE), STANDARD, 4970
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 113.30 1,019.70
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 114.50 1,030.50
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES MG BID
054 9 ER CASE OF SPARKLEEN (4 ONE GALLON JUGS)
STANDARD, 3300

11750 FERTL-SQIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 4B.85 439.65
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 46.95 422.55

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES NO BID

11



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13 PAGE 12

PRICE AMOTNT

T ORAG 5 e

11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 498. 90 498._90

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 519.00 5159.00

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 510.17 510.17
056 2 EA ACCUFORM ACCUCURVE BUNKER RARKES

FAR-AIDE, BOX OF 25, 99%7-125

11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INMC. 295,40 590,80

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 310.00 620.00

17EB4 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 321.57 643.14
057 3 EA ACCUFORM DEEF FACE BUNKER RRKE

PAR-AIDE, 995-7

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 25.90 129.50

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 26.90 134.50

17884 -JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES 28.14 140.70
058 B ER ACCUFORM PLUG PUSHER, PAR-RIDE, 13240

11750 FERTL~50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 61.45 491.60

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 63.00 504.00

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 65.92 527.36
T

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 51.70 103.40

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 52.00 104.00

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES HO BID



0249-520-13

FRICE

1 EA DELUXE ROPE STRKES - 24" GREEN,
EAR-RAIDE, BOX OF 25, 12230-25

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 165.00
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 168.40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCRFES 175.88

BIDS BY ITEM

3/05/13 PAGE

AMOUNT

2 ER DELUXE ROPE STRAKES - 18" GREEN
FAR-ATDE, BOX OF 25, 12210-25

FERTL-50IL TURF SUFPLY INC. 145.70
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 149,15
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES 155.75

20 EA DELUXE ROPE STAKES - 24" GREEN W/HOLE
PRESTWICK, RSD 24-01
FERTL-50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 9.55
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 8.50

JOHN DEERE LANDSCRPES

121.00
170.00 =

2 ER 1/2" BRAID POLYPROPYLENE ROPE S500FT (WHITE)

ERAGLE ONE, F1901/2W
FERTL-SQIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 63.90
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES

65.00

127.80
130.00

2 EA BRAIDED POLYFROPOLENE ROFE,
PAR ARIDE, (WHITE}, 12954

FERTL=-50IL TURF SUFPLY IMNC. 30.448
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 30.75
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES 32.16

13



0249-520-13 BIDS BY
FRICE
0BS5S 1 EA BRAIDED POLYPROFPOCLENE ROFPE
PAR AIDE (GREEN AND WHITE) 12262
11750 FERTL-30IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 30.48
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 30.75
17834 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 3z2.1e
D&6 1 EA GREENSKEEPER/COMPFLETE, STAMNARD, 2720
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUFPPLY INC. 69.70
14470 GRASS ROQTS TURF PRODUCTS T0.80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES
ne7 12 EA GREENSKEEPER FINGER, STANDARD, 27205
11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 2.89
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 2.80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
0e8 4 EA GREENSKEEFPER SPRING, STANDARD, 27203
11750 FERTL=-S0IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 1.686
14470 GRARSS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 1.60
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
69 2 ERA GREENSKEEFER FLOOR FLATE, STANDARD,
11750 FERTL-50CIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 10.40
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 10.40
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCRFES

070 16 EA  GREENSKEEPER ROLL PIN, STANDRRD, 272

ITEM

AMOUNT

0

27202
20.80
20.80

06

3/05/13

PAGE

14



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13

PRICE AMOUNT

11750 FERTL-S50IL TURF SUPFLY INC. .44 T.04

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS .40 6.40

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
071 4 EA SHAP RING, STANDARD, 27207

11750 FERTL-SQIL TURF SUFFLY INC. A4 1.76

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS A0 1.60

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES NOQ BID
072 2 En HOT SHOT SFRAY NOZZLE 3/4™

EAGLE ONE, IRGDOS

11750 FERTL-SO0IL TURF SUFFLY INC,. 85.00 170.00 *

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 55.00 110.00 *

17864 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES NO BID
073 2 EA HOT SHOT SPRAY NOZZLE 1", EAGLE ONE, IRGOO7

11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPFLY INC. 101.60 203.20 *

14470 GRAS5 ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 64.00 128.00 =
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES KO BID
074 6 EA EZ WHIP WHIPFPING PCLE, PRR AIDE, 1060

11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPFLY IHNC. 44.00 264.00

14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 44.65 267.50

176884 JOHN DEERE LAMDSCAPES 46.63 279.78
Q75 3 EA ORIGINAL WHIPFING POLE FIBERGLASS TIP,

PRR AIDE, 1045

15



0249-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE AMOUNT
FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPFLY INC. 21.70 65.10
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 22.60 67.80
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES HO BID

3 EA HEAVY DUTY IRRIGATION TRIMMER 11" HEAD
STANDRARD, 29911

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 60.40 181.20
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 61.00 183.00
JOHM DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID

3 ER HEAVY DUTY IRRIGATION TRIMMER HANDLE
STANDRRD, 29900

FERTL-S50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 33.65 100.85
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 33.85 101.55%
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES NO BID

1 En S0IL PROFILER, MILTOMA, T-520

FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 185.00 185.00
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 166.00 la6.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES N0 BID

2 En EAIN GAUGE, EAGLE CNE, 1012

FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. 8.90 17.80
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 9.90 19.80
JOHHN DEERE LANDSCAFES MO BID

2 EA REPLACEMENT ATOMIC CLOCK 18"
STRANDARD, SILVER, 200902

16



0249-520-13

BIDS BY ITEM 3/05/13 PAGE
FRICE AMOUNT
FERTL-S0OIL TURF SUPFLY INC. 117.25 234.50
GRASS ROOTS TURF FPRODUCTS 108.00 21a.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES WO BID

8 En RUBBER CUBBING - BLACK, EAGLE ONE,
8" LONG, &" WIDE, 4" TALL; F3416

FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 174.60
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 137.00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

1,396.80
1,096.00

1 EA THE SO0 STRIFPER BLADES
MILTOMNA, SILVER, T-200

FERTL-S50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 59.00
GRASS ROOTS TURF FRODUCTS 48,00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

4 EA TRASH PRO, PAR AIDE, 3820

FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 202.50
GRAS5 ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 237.00
JOHWN DEERE LANDSCRPES 217.06

1 EA HIGH BACK TEE BENCHES, ERGLE OHNE,
FERTL~-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 369.00
GRAS5 ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 369.00

JOHN DEERE LANDSCRFES

T-230

369.00
369.00

1 EA COMBIMNATION STATION, PRESTWICK, GL-SWT-01
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02459-520-13 BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE AMOUNT
11750 FERTL-S0IL TUORF SUFFLY INC. 1389.80 1,399.80
14470 GEASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 865.15 965.15 +
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFPES 619.02 619.02
0de 1 EA WATER COOLER HOUSE, EARGLE ONE, T2%0DPGERN
11750 FERTL-S50IL TOURF SUFFLY INC. 1335.00 1,335.00
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 994.00 994.00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NG BID
oav 2 EA WATER COOLER JR. COMPLETE
PAR AIDE, HUNTER GREEN, 1045
11750 FERTL-50IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 377.40 1,154.80
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 677.00 1,354.00 *
17884 JOHN DEERE LANMDSCAFES NQ BID
DES I 83 EA REFLACEMENT KIRBY MARKER TOPS ONLY, KIRBY,
#'5 WILL BE DETAILED UFON RWARDING
OF THE BID
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 43.00 3,999.00
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 41.50 3,859.50
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
W T e el I I
OF THE BID
11750 FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPPLY INC. 43.00 602.00
14470 GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 43.65 611.10

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NG BID

3/05/13 PAGE
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0249-520-13

BIDS BY ITEM

3/05/13 PAGE

AMOUNT

192.00
158.00

PRICE

40 EA  RING - WHITE, KIRBY, B122
FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPELY INC. 4,80
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 3.95
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAFES

24 ER  SCREW, KIRBY, Bl4l
FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC. LBS
GEASS ROOQTS TURF PRODUCTS .58
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

3 EA  COLLARS, KIRBY, WHITE
FERTL-S0IL TURF SUPELY INC. 15,60
GRASS ROOTS TURF PRODUCTS 23.30

JOHN DEEEE LANDSCAFPES

19



