BID # 0018-13

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF ROAD MAINTENANCE MATERIALS

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162
Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

[ Number of Bids Received | | Vendor Name and Address |
Gibraltar Rock; 484 Rt. 601, Belle Mead, NJ 08502
RWYV Land & Livestock South, Inc.; 351 Pfister Rd.,

PO Box 1323 Jackson, NJ 08527

Sahara Sand; 942 Rt. 9, West Creek, NJ 08092

Stavola Construction Materials, Inc.; 175 Drift Rd.,
Tinton Falls, NJ 07724

Trap Rock Industries LLC; 460 River Rd., PO Box 419,
Kingston, NJ 08528

Tuckahoe Sand & Gravel; PO Box 991,

Pleasantville, NJ 08232

(SEE FOLLOWING TALLY SHEETS FOR BIDS AS OPENED AND PUBLICY READ)
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0089-010-13 BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE AMOUNT
001 900 TONS I-5 SOIL AGGREGATE (“"CLAY ROAD GRAVEL")
05150 GIBRALTAR ROCK NO BID
05155 SRHARR SAND NO BID
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTICH WO BID
34890 TRAP ROCK IMDUSTRIES : MO BID
50977 TOCKRHOE SAND & GRAVEL 26.60 23,940.00
52001 R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTCCK SOUTH 16.36 14,724.00
ooz 175 TONS WASHED GRAVEL 3/8"
05150 GIBRALTAR ROCK KO BID
05155 SRAHRRD SAND 33.15 5,801.25
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION NO BID
34890 TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES NO BID
50977 TUCKAHOE SEND & GRAVEL 31.10 5,442.50
52001 R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH NO BID
ooz 850 TONS DENSE GRRDED BGGREGATE (DGA)
{"DIRTY STONE BLEND")
05150 GIBRALTAR. ROCK 19.40 16,490.00
05155 SAHARR SAND MO BID
33270 STAVOLA COMSTRUCTION 17.00 14, 450.00
34890 TRAP ROCKE INDUSTRIES 16.50 14,025.00
50977 TUCKAHOE SAND & GRAVEL 19.55 16,617.50
52001 R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH MO BID
004 325 TONS COARSE AGGREGATE 3/4"-1-12" ("BROKEN/QUARRY

STONE" - "BLUE STONE")
05150 GIBRALTAR ROCK 22.90 7,442.50

1/16/12
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0089-010-13

BY ITEM 1/16/13

PAGE

AMOUNT

NO BID
6,175.00
6, 662.50
V61 .25
NO BID

HO BID
13,422.50
NO BID
HO BID
RO BID
11,840.50

NO BID
1,915.00

NO BID

KO BID

2,410.00
1,936.00

16,380.00
NO BID

BIDS
PRICE
05155 SAHARA SAND
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION 19.00
34890 TRAFP ROCK INDUSTRIES 20.50
S0977 TUCKAHOE SAND & GRAVEL 22065
52001 R.W.V, LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH
005 650 TONS ICE CONTROL SAND GRITS
05150 GIBRALTAR ROCK
05155 SBHRRA SAMD 20.65
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION
34880 TRRP ROCK INDUSTRIES
50977 TUCKAHOE SAND & GRAVEL
52001 R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH 18.37
0oa 100 TONS MASON SAND
05150 GIERALTAR ROCK
05155 SAHRERR SRAND 19.15
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTICHN
34890 TRAP ROCK INDUSTRIES
SO%TT TUCKRHOE SAND & GRRVEL 24.10
52001 R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH 19.36
007 700 TONMS STONE SCEEENINGS
05150 GIBRRLTAR ROCK 23.40
05155 SAHRRA SAND
33270 STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION 18.00

12,600.00



0089-010-13

34890
50977

TRAF ROCK INDUSTRIES
TUOCKAHOE SRMD & GRAVEL
R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK S0UTH

BIDS BY ITEM

FRICE

17.50
21.30

1/16/13 PAGE

BMOUNT

12,250.00
14,910.00

008
05150
05155
33270
34890
50977
52001

75 TONS BALLFIELD INFIELD MIX
GIERALTRR ROCK
SRHARAR SAND
STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION
TRAP ROCE INDUSTRIES
TUCKAHOE SAND & GRAVEL
R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH

36.95
36.37

MO BID
NO BID
HO BID
MO BID

2,771.25

2,727.75

009
05150
05155
33270
34890
50977

25 TCNS RIP-RAP
GIBRALTRAR ROCK
SAHARA - SAND
STAVOLA CONSTRUCTION
TRAP ROCE INDUSTRIES
TOCKARHOE SAND & GRAVEL
R.W.V. LAND & LIVESTOCK SOUTH

36.40

40.00
26.90
27.80



