BID # 0015-15

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF PRINTING SERVICES

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

|

Number of Bids Received |

|_Vendor Name and Address |

9 ]

Esquire Graphics, LL.C; 1668 North Olden Ave.,

Trenton, NJ 08638

Graphic Image; 561 Boston Post Rd., Milford, CT 06460
GraphiColor; 3490 North Mill Rd., Vineland, NJ 08360
Hawk Graphics; 1248 Sussex Tpke., Mt. Freedom, NJ 07970
Morris Graphics, Inc.; 660 N. Broad St., Woodbury, NJ 08096
Neoprint, Inc.; 11 Alpha Rd., Chelmsford, MA 01824

New Jersey Printing & Graphics; 28 Caigary Cir,,
Morganville, NJ 07751

NPC, Ine.; 13710 Dunnings Hwy., Claysburg, PA 16625
Urner Barry; 182 Queens Blvd., Bayville, NJ 08721




Bid #0018-15; Prop 1

0020- 520- 15 BIDS BY [ TEM - SUMVARY 12/02/ 14 PAGE 1
GRAPHI C | MAGE, IN

GRAPHI C | MAGE, IN MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NEOPRI NT, 1 NC, GRAPH! COLOR CORPO HAWK GRAPHICS, 1IN NEW JERSEY PRI NT!
00t  600. 00 600C. 00 695. 00 695, GO 750. 00 750. 00 240. 00 240. 00 580. 00 590, 0C 480. 0C 480, 00
002 815.00 816.00] 1015. 00 1015. 00} 830.00 820. 00] 405.00 408. 00§ 800. 00 800. 00 750.00 750. 00
003 1130.00 1130. 00! 1580. QO 1580, 00} 1200.00 1200. 00f{ 850.00 650. 00} 1075.00 1075. 00} 800. 00 900. 00
004 800. 00 800. 00} 1090.00 1090. 00{ 800. 00 800.00{ 450,00 450. 00f 690. 00 690. 00} 600,00 604G, 00
005 1080. 00 1080. 00 1325, 00 1325. 00t 1000. 00 10C00. 0C]  750. 00 750. 00 840.00 840. 00] 950. 00 950. 0C
Q08 1500. 00 1500, 00] 1832. 00 1932 0C] 145000 1450. 00} 1070. 00 1070. 00 1175.00 1175. 001 1250. 00 1250. 00
007 840.00 640. 00} 825.00 825. 00f  765. 00 765.00] 425 00 425,001 5B60.00 560. 00! 55C.00 550. 00
Q08  850. 00 B50. 00} 12568. 00 1256. 00| 1000. 00 1000, 00] 725,00 725.00{ 720.00 720. 00} 700.00 700. 00
00 1220.00 1220, 00} 1716. Q0 1716.0C] 147500 1475. 001 960. 00 960. 00| 1045.00 1045, 00f  200. 00 900. 00

010 2050. 00 2050. 00f 2440.00 2440. 00} 1500. 00 1500. 00] 2160. 00 2160, 00| 1700.C0 1700. 00| 1895.00 1895. 0C
01t 1110. 00 1110. 00| 1522. 0C¢ 1522, 0} 1100. 00 1100, 00] 1025. 00 1025. 00] 1050. 00 1050, 00} 1200, 0O 1200. GO

€12  600.00 600.0C| 804.00 804. 00| 600.00 600. 00| 585.00 535.00f 750.00 750. 00 500.0¢ 500. 00
013 740.00 740. 00} 1010. 00 1010. 00 850.00 850.00{ 735.00 735.00] 850.00 850. 00 640.00 640. 00
014  850. 00 890. 00| 1240. 00 1240, 00 925,00 925, 00| 845, 00 845. 00} 950. 00 950. CO| 705.00 705. 00

015 15860. 00 1860. 00] 2350. 00 2350. 00| 1575.00 1575, 001 1740.00 1740. 00! 1900. 00 1500. 00f 1225.00 1225, 00
TOTALS 15585, 00} 20780. 00! 15880, 00} 12775, 00] 14695. 0G| 13245. 00



0020- 520- 15
PR
001 1 EA GROUP " A"
8-1/2" X 11", TWX 2) SIDES,
BROKEN DOWN AS FOLLOWS
SEPARATE RUNS OF 5, GO0 EACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 600.
C4044 MDRRI & GRAPHI CS | NC. 695,
07854 NEOPRI NT, I NC. 750.
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON 240,
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 590.
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 480
002 1 EA SEPARATE RUNS OF 10, 000 EACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 815,
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS 1 NC. i015.
07854 NEOPRI NT, [ NC. 890.
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 405,
52928 HAVK. GRAPHI CS, | NC 800,
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPH! CS 750.
003 1 EA SEPARATE RUNS OF 20, 000 EACH
02500 GRAPH! C | MAGE, | NC. 1130.
04044 MDRRI S GRAPHI CS 1§ NC. 1560.
07854 NEOPRI NT, | NC. 1200,
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! Onl 690.
52528 HAVK GRAPHI CS, I NC 1075
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 200
co4 1T EA GROUP " B"
8-1/2" X 14", Twol 2)

Bid #0015-15; Prop 1

BROKEN DOWN AS FOLLOVS:
SEPARATE RUNS OF 5, 000 EACH

BI DS BY | TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE
I CE ANDUNT %
FULL COLOR,

00 600. 00
00 695. 00
Co 750. 00
00 240, 00
00 590. 00
.00 480. 00
00 815. 00
0o 1,015, 00
00 890. 00
00 405. GO
00 800. 00
00 750. 00
e 1, 130.00
00 1, 560. 00
00 1, 200. 00
co 650. 00
00 1,075. 00
(o]4] 900. 00

SIDES, FULL COLOR,

1

........................................... LOWBI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON

LOWBI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT] ON

LOW B! D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON



0020- 520- 15
PR
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 200
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS i NC. 1090
07854 NEOPRI NT, | NC. 800
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 450
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, i NC 690
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 600
005 1 EA  SEPARATE RUNS OF 10, 000 £ACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, [NC. 1080.
04044 VDORR! S GRAPHI CS | NC. 1328,
07854 NEOPRI NT, 1 NC. 1600,
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 750.
52928 HAVK GRAPHI C3, | NC 840
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPH| CS 950
008 1 EA  SEPARATE RUNS OF 20, 000 EACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, 1 NC. 1800.
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 1932.
07854 NEOPRI NT, 1 NC. 1450,
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 1079.
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1175.
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 1250,
007 1 EA  GROUP “¢C°
8-1/2" X 14", TwWO[ 2)
BROKEN DOWN AS FOLLOWS
SEPARATE RUNS OF 5, 000 EACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, ! NC, 640

Bid #0015-15; Prop 1

BI DS BY | TEM

I CE

SIDES, 2- COLOR

.00

12/ 02/ 14 P AGE

ANMDUNT %

640, 00

P

LOWBI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON

LOWBID GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON

LOWBI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON



Bid #0015-15; Prop 1

0020- 520- 15 BI DS BY i TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
04044 MDRRI S GRAPH! CS | NC. 825. 00 825. 00
07884 NEOPRI NT, 1 NC. 765. 00 765. 00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON 425. 00 425. 00
52928 HAWK GRAPHE CS, 1 NC 560. 00 560. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 550. Q0 550. GO
008 1 EA SEPARATE RUNS OF 10, 000 EACH
02500 GRAFPHI C § MAGE, | NC. 850. 00 850. 00
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 1256. 00 7, 2566. 00
07854 NEGCPRI NT, 1 NC. 1000. CO 1, 000. 00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 725. 00 725, 00
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 720. 00 720.00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 700. 00 700. 00
00s T EA SEPARATE RUNS OF 20, 000 EACH
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 1220. 00 1,220. 00
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS i NC. 1716. 00 1,716. 00
07854 NEOQPRI NT, § NC, 1475. 00 1, 475. 00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 960. 00 960. GO
52928 HAVK GRAPH! CS, I NC 1045, 00 1, 045. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPH! CS 900. 00 800. 00
010 i EA GROUP "p"
PARINT TWO(2) SiDES, 4- COLOR PROCESS, MATTE
VARNI SH AND BLEED FOUR( 4) S DES ON BOTH
St DES OF PAPER. NO OVER OR UNDER RUNS
ACCEPTED:
SEPARATE RUNS OF 10, 0DO EACH
Q2500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 2050. 00 2,050. 00

%

12/ 02/ 14

PAGE

3

LOWEBI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON

LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS

LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPH! CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 1

0020- 520- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 12/02/ 14 PAGE 4
PRt CE ANDUNT %
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 2440. 00 2, 440. 00
07854 NEQPRI NT, | NC. 1500. 00 1, 300.00
51230 GRAPHt COLOR CORPORAT! ON 2180. 00 2, 160. 00
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 1700. QO 1,700. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPH| CS 18985, 00 T, 895. 00

............................................................................................ LOWEID NEOPRINT, 1NC.

011 1 EA GROUP "E"
PRI NT TWO(2) S!DES, 4- COLOR PROCESS, BOTH

SIDES OF PAPER. NO OVER OR UNDER RUNS
ACCEPTED:

SEPARATE RUNS OF 10, 000 EACH

02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, I NC, 1110. 00 1,110. 00

04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS I NC, 1522. 00 1,522. 00

07854 NEGPRI NT, | NC. _ 1100. 00 1, 100. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1025. 00 1, 025. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1050. 00 1, 050. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 1200. 00 1, 200. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON
012 1 EA  POSTCARDS

TEN THOUSAND { 10, 000)

02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, I NC. 600. 00 600. 00

04044 MDRRI S GRAPHI CS 1 NC. 804. 00 804. 00

07854 NEOPRI NT, | NC. 600. 00 600. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 595. 00 595. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 750. 00 750. 00

56348  NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS 500. 00 500. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS
013 T EA  FIFTEEN THOUSAND ( 15, 000)

€2500 GRAPH!I C 1 MAGE, | NC. 740. 00 740, G0



Bid #0015-15; Prop 1
0020-520- 15

04044 MDRBI § GRAPH CS 1 NC.

07854 NEOPRi NT, 1| NC

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPCRAT! ON

52928 HAWK GRAPH! CS, | NC

56348 NEW JERSEY TmmZM_Zm.@ GRAPHI CS

014 T EA TVENTY THOUSAND ( 20, 000)
02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, I NC.

04044 VORRE S GRAPHI CS | NC.

07854 NECPRI NT, {NC

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, [NC

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTi NG & GRAPHI CS

215 1 EA ENVI RONMENTAL EDUCATI ON
FI FTEEN HUNDRED { 1, 500)

02500 GRAPHE C | MAGE, | NC.
04044 NORRI S GRAPH! CS 1 NC.
07854 NEOPRI NT, | NC,

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON
52928 HAVWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPH; CS

PRt CE

BROCHURE

1560,
2350.
15675,
1740.

1200.

sle)
oy
00
00

0o

BIDS BY | TEM

ANDUNT

1, 010.
850.
735.
850.

840. I
.................................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS

890.
1, 240.
925.
845.
950.

o
00
00
60
Qo

00
ole}
00
00
oC

.00
.................................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS

%

5

LOWBI D NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPH! CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

D021-520- 15 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMVARY 12/02/14 PAGE 1
MORRI S GRAPHI CS

MORRI S GRAPHI CS || GRAPHI COLOR CORPO HAVK GRAPHI CS, IN NEW JERSEY Tm_ZA__ URNER BARRY PUBLI |
001 1410. 00 Aﬁao_oo% 700, 00 700. GO 770. 00 770. 00 800, 00 80C. 00 700. 00 700, 00|
002 840.00 840.00| 450,00 450. 00| 515.00 515.00} 570.00 570.00{ 300.00 3006. 60}

003 1380.00 1380. 00} 1280.00 1250. 00} 1150. 00 1150. 02] 1150. 60 T150. 00| 1300. 00 1300. 00}

004  340.00 340.00) 225.00 225.00f 100. 00 100.00! 165.00 165.00f  82.00 82. 00|
005 895,00 895. 00| 1055. 00 1055. 00| 320. 00 320.00{ 380.00 380.00] 410.00 410. 00|
006 420.00  420.00] 255.00 255.00] 125.00 125.00] 175.00 175.00| 103.00 103. 00]
007 1250.00  1250.00| 1195.00 1195. 00} 415.00 415.00] 465. 00 465.00! 505. 00 505, 00|
008  465. 00 465. 00! 320.00 320.00] 140. 00 140.001 210.00 210.00{ 121.00 121. 00|
00% 1280.00  1280.00] 1490.00 1490. 00| 450.00 450.00]{ 565.00 565.00| 581.00 581. 00}
010 160.00 160.00f  85.00 85.00|  65.00 65.00]  95.00 95.00]  51.00 51.00]
011 380,00 380.00] 360. 00 360.00f 210.00 210.00| 210.00 210.00] 254.00 254. 00|
012 485, 00 485. 00| 300. 00 300.00| 280.00 280.00} 270.00 270.00{ 195. 00 195. 00|
013 675.00 675.00! 475,00 475.00| 625.00 625.00| 385.00 385.00] 336.00 336. 00!
014 370.00 370. 00| | 280.00 260.00] 130.00 130. 00| 217.00 217. 00|
015 1050.00  1050. 00| | 860.00 860.00] 350.00 350.00] 718.00 718. 00|

TOTALS 11400, 00} 8160. 00| 6285. 00] 5920. GO 5873. 00|



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

0021- 520- 15 BIDS BY | TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 1
PRI CE ANDUNT %

001 1 EA NCPS LETTERHEAD STATI ONARY: 25, 000

04044 NMORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 1410. 00 1,410.00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT] ON 700. 00 700. 00

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 770. 00 770. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPHI CS 800. 00 800. 00

56816 URNER BARRY PUBL{ CATI ONS, 1| NC 700. 60 700. GO

............................................................................................ LOWBID TIE BID

00z 1 EA MCPS LETTERHEAD STAT! ONARY: M0.000

04044 MDRRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 840. 00 840, 00

51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 45Q. 00 450. 00

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 515. 00 515. 0C

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPH! CS 570, 00 570. 0C
m.mm."mw<cmmembmmJ\_ucmw_n)jozm,zowoooo---woooo ............................ LOWBI D URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI ONS, | NC
003 1 EA MCPS LETTERHEAD ENVELOQPES; 25, 000

04044 MORRE S GRAPHE CS 1 NC. 1380. 00 1,380, 0C

51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1256. G0 1, 250. 00

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, [ NC 115Q, 00 1. 150. Q0

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPHI CS 1150. 00 . 1, 150. 00

56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI ONS, | NC 1300. 00 1, 300. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID TIE BID
064 1 EA BROWN OR vl TE CRAFT ENVELOPES,

6" X 9"; 1,000

04044 MDORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 340. 00 340. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 225. 00 225, 00

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, [ NC 100. 00 10C. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 165. 00 165. GO



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

0021- 520- 15 Bl OS BY | TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE AMOUNT %
56818 URNER BARRY PUBLi CATI ONS, INC 82. 00 82. 00
005 1 EA BROWN OR WHI TE CRAFT ENVELOPES:
6" X 8"; 5,000
04044 MORRI & GRAPHI CS { NC. 895. 00 895, GO
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1085. 00 1, 055.00
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 320. 00 320. 0C
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 380. GO 380. 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, | NC 410. 00 410.C0
008 1 EA BROWN OR VI TE CRAFT ENVELOPES,
8" X 12"; 1, 000
C4044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 420. 00 420.00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI On 255. 00 255. 00
52928 HAWK GRAPH! CS, | NC 125. 00 125. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 175. 00 175. 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBL! CATIONS, | NC 103. 00 103. 00
007 1 EA BROVWN OR WHI TE CRAFT ENVELOPES,
9" X 12"; B, 000
04044 MORR1 S GRAPHI €S | NC, 1250. Q0 1, 250. 0C
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1195. 00 1, 185. 00
52828 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 415, 00 415. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 465. 00 465, 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI ONS, | NC 505. 60 505. 00
oo 1 EA BROWN OR VHI TE CRAFT ENVELOPES,

9-1/2" X 12-1/2"; "1, 000

2

LOWBI D URNER BARRY PUBLI CAT! ONS,

LOWBI D HAWK GRAPHI CS,

LOWBID URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI ONS,

LOW BI D HAWK GRAPHI CS,

I NC

1 NC

I NC

i NC



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

0021- 520- 15
PRI CE
04044 MDRRI S GRAPHE CS 1 NC, 465. 00
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 320. 00
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, i NC 140. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 210.00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, !NC 121. 00
009 T EA  BROWN OR WHI TE CRAFT ENVELOPES,
9-1/2" X 12-1/2", 5,000
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 1280. 00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1490. 00
52928 HAVWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 450. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTE NG & GRAPHI CS 565. 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, | NC 581. 00
010 1 EA  STANDARD #10 WHI TE OR [ VORY ENVELOPES
1, 000
04044 MORR! S GRAPHI CS 1 NC. 160. 0C
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPCRAT! ON 88. 00
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 65. 00
55348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS §5. 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI1 CATI ONS, | NC 51.00
011 1T EA  STANDARD #10 WHI TE OR | VORY ENVELOPES
5, 000
04044 NORR! S GRAPHI CS | NC. 380. 00
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 360. 00
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 210.00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS 210. 00

BI DS BY | TEM

AMDUNT

380.
360.
210.
210.

00
o
0o
00

%

12/ 02/ 14

PAGE

3

LOW B8l D URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, [NC

LOWBI D HAWK GRAPHI CS, |NC

LOW BI D URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI ONS, I NC



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

0021- 520- 15 Bi DS BY ! TEM 12/02/ 14 PAGE 4
PRI CE ANDUNT %
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, |NC 254, 00 254. 00

........................................................................................... LOWBID TIE BID

012 1 EA STANDARD #9 ENVELOPES: 10, D00

04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 485. 00 485. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON 300. 00 300. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, I NC 28C. 00 280. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAFHI CS 270.00 270.C0

56816 URNER BARRY PUBL! CATIONS, | NC 195.00 195. 00
............................................................................................ LOWB!I D URNER BARRY PUBL! CATI ONS, | NC
013 1 EA STANDARD #10 W NDOW ENVELQOPES: 15, 000

04044 VORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC, 675. 00 675. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 475. 00 475. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPH! CS, | NC 625.00 625. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 385. 00 385. 00
PR UMERGARY PRGN 1N w00 ssoo LOWSID URNER BARRY PUBLI CATI O, 1 hC
014 1T EA STANDARD #14 NMANI LA ENVELOPES,

5" X 11-1/2"; 1,000

04044 MDRRI S GRAPHI CS i NC. 370. 00 370. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BID

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 260. 0 260. 00

56348 2m<¢gmmmm< PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 130. 00 130. 00

56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATi ONS, | NC 217.00 217.00
........................................................................................... LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPH! CS
015 1 EA STANDARD #14 MANI LA ENVELOPES,

57 X 11-1/2": 5,000
04044 NDRRI'S GRAPH| CS i NC. 1050. 00 1, 050. 00



Bid #0015-15; Prop 2

0021-520- 15 BiDS BY | TEM 12/02/14 PAGE 5
PRI CE ANDUNT %
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NG BI D
52928 HAWK GRAPH! C3, 1NC 860. 0O 860. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 350. 00 360. 00
56816 URNER BARRY PUBLI CATIONS, |NC 718. 00 718. 00

.......................................................................................... LOWBI D NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS



Bid #6015-15; Prop 3

0022-520- 15 B DS BY | TEM - SUWMMARY 12/02/14 PAGE 1
GRAPH! COLOR CORPO

GRAFH! COLOR CORFPO HAVWK GRAPHI CS, IN ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS NEW JERSEY PRI NT!

001 265. 00 265. 00| 225. 00 225,00 275.00 275. 00
002 [ 490.00 480. 00}  340. 00 340.00] 405.00 405, 00|
003 | 445.00 445,001  300.00 300.00{ 370.00 370. 00|
004 | 850.00 850. 00| 475.00 475.00] 515.00 515. 00|
005 | 550.00 550.0C|  300. 00 300.00] 345.00 345. 00|
008 i 885.00 885.00] 470. 00 470.00{ 515.00 515. 00|
007 [ 825.00 825.00] 350.00 350.00] 335.00 335. 00|
008 | 1460. 00 1460. 00| 500. 00 500. 00| 540.00 540. 00
009 | 600.00 800. 00| 425. 00 425.00| 460.00 460. 00|
010 i 900.00 90C. 00§ 580. 00 580.00| 800.00 800. 00|
011 | 150.00 150.00] 280.00 280.00| 300.00 300. 00]
012 | 540. 00 540.00| 485.00 485.00| 525.00 525. 00|
013 I 200.00 200.00] 250. 00 250.00] 420.00 420. 00|
014 | 395.00 395,00 285.00 285.00] 345. 00 345. 00|
015 | 1200.00 1200.00| 600. 00 6G0. 00| 640. 00 640. 00}
016 | 275.00 275.00]  290. 00 290.00) 310.00 310. 00|
017 i 450.00 450.00| 365. 00 365.00| 365.00 365. 00|
018 | 875.00 675.C0f 470. 00 470.00| 500.00 500. 00|
019 | 1175.00 1175.00| 760. 00 760.0C| 920.00 920. 00}
020 | 300.00 300. 00| 325.00 325.00}  300.00 300. 00
021 | 800.00 800. 00}  700. 00 700.00] 800.00 800. 00|
022 | 1500. 00 1500. 00 1005. 00 1005.00]  950. 00 950. 00|
023 | 400.00 400.00| 380. 00 380.00! 310.00 310. 00}
024 | 1000. 00 1000. 00}  800. 00 800. 00!  770. 00 770. 00j
025 { 1750. 00 1750. 00} 1220. 00 1220.00{ 1100. 00 1100. 00|
026 | 1550.00 1550.00f 925, 00 925. 00| 955.00 955. 00|

027 920.00 820. 00| 750.00 750.00] 780.00 760.00] 750.00 750. 00}



©022-520- 15

028 1270.
028 1440,
030  900.
031 1110.
032 1300.
033 450.
034 620.
035

036

037

038

039

040

041

042

043
TOTALS

Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

GRAFPH! COLOR CORPO

00
GO
oo
GO
00
00
00

1270, 0O/
1440. 00|
900. 00|
1110. 00|
1300. 00|
450. 0G]
620. 00}
|
_
|
_

8010. 00|

HAWK GRAPH! CS,

10565.
1250,
690,
950,
1100,
550.
700,
575.
725.
1100.
1575.
75.

o0
00
00
GO
ao
00
00
00
00
00
Co
00

10565,
1250,
690,
250.
1100.
550.
700.
575.
725.
1100.
1875.
75.

30725,

BI BS

I'n
00
00|
00
00|
00|
00!
00]
00}
00|
00|
00}
001

|

!

|

|
00!

BY I TEM -

1000. 00
1200. 00
76C. 00
1000. GO
1200. 00
497. 00
650. 00
470. 00
640. 00
690. 00
850. 00

28. 00
400. 00
560. 00
510. 00
710. 00

SUMMIARY
ESOU RE GRAPHI CS

1000,
1200.
760.
10C0.
12C0.
497.
650,
470,
640.
690.
850.
28.

001
00!
00|
0G|
00|
00|
00}
00}
o1}
00}
00|
00|

. 00}
. 00}
. 001
. 00}

12402/ 14 PAGE 2

NEW JERSEY PRI NT

850.
1100.
750.
900,
1000.
390.
925,
285.
450,
600.
810.
35.
520.
680.
500.
720.

00
ole}
00
o0
o0
Qo
00
Qo
00
00
(810]
4]
oo
Q0
00
00

250.
11006.
750.
900.
1000.
390.
525.
285.
45Q,
600,
810.
35.

00 |
001 i
00| f
(8]0)] I
00| |
00} |
001 |
00} !
00| i
00} |
00| i
0G| |

. 00} !
. 00} |
. 00| |
. 00| |



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022- 520- 1§ BI DS BY 1 TEM 12/02/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE AVDUNT %
001 1 EA  2-PART NCR FORMB - 5-1/2" X 8 1/2"
CONSECUTI VE NUMBERED; 5, 000
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 265. 00 265. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 225. 00 225. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRi NTING & GRAPHI CS 275. 00 275. 00
c02 1 EA  2-PART NCR FORMB - 5-1/2 X 8 1/2°
CONSECUTI VE NUMBERED; 10, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 490. 00 480. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 340. 00 340. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 405. 00 405. 00
003 1 EA 2-PART NCR FORME - 8-1/2" X 11"
CONSECUTI VE NUMBERED; 5, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO BI D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS,. | NC 445. 00 445. G0
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 300. 00 300. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 370. 00 370. 00
004 T EA 2-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 11"
CONSECUT!I VE NUMBERED: 10, 000
51230 GRAPH| COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPH! CS, | NC 850. 00 850. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPH! CS 475. 00 475. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS 515. 00 515. 00

LOWBI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI C$

LOWBI D ESOU RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBI B  ESQU! RE GRAPHI CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022-520- 15 BI DS BY 1 TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 2
PRI CE ANDUNT %
005 1 EA 3- PART NCR FORMB - 5-1/2" X 8- 1/2"
CONSECUTI VE NUMBERED; 5, 000
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON NC BI D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, I NC 550. 00 550. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPH! CS 300. 00 300. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 345. 00 345. 00

............................................................................................ LOW BI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

006 1T EA 3-PART NCR FORMS - 5-1/2" X 8 1/2"
CONSECUT! VE NUMBERED; 10, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO Bi D
52928 HAVK GRAPHi CS, | NC 885. 00 885. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 470. 00 470. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 515. 00 515. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID ESQOU RE GRAPHI CS
007 1 EA  3-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 11"
CONSECUT! VE NUMBERED: 5, GOG
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BID
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, i NC 825. 00 825. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 350. 00 350. 00
563483 NEW JERSEY PRINT! NG & GRAPH! CS 335. 00 335. 00
............................................................................................ LOW B! D NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS
008 1 EA  3-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 11"
CONSECUTI VE NUNMBERED: 10, 000
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON NO B! D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1460. 00 1, 460. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 500. 00 500. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 540. 00 540. 00

............................................................................................ LOW BI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS



Bid #0013-15; Prop 3

0022-520- 15 BIDS BY { TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 3
PRI CE ANMDUNT %
009 1 EA  3-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 14"
CONSECUT! VE NUMBERED: 5, 000

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BI D

52928 HAVE GRAPH: CS, | NC 600. 00 600. DO

56162 ESQU RE GRAPHI CS 425, 00 425,00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRi NTI NG & GRAPHI C$ 460, 00 460. 00
............................................................................................ LOW B! D ESQUI RE GRAPH! CS
010 1 EA  3-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 14°

CONSECUT! VE NUMBERED; 10, 000

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NC BI D

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 800. 00 900. 00

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHE CS 580. 00 580. 00
56348 NEWJERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHICS  800.00  800. O LOWEID ESQUIRE GRAPHI CS
011 1 EA  3-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 11”: 1,000

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! QN NG BiD

52928 HAWK GRAPH: CS, | NC 150. 00 150. 00

56162 ESQUN RE GRAPH! CS 280. 00 280. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS 300. 00 300. 00
........................................................................................... LOW BI D  HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC
012 1 EA 3-PART NCR FORNE - 8-1/2" X 11": 5, 000

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO BID

52928 HAVWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 540. 00 540. 00

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 485, 00 485. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRi NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 525. 00 525, 00
........................................................................................... LOW B! D ESOU RE GRAPHI CS
013 1 EA  4-PART NCR FORMS - 8-1/2" X t1": PUNCHED

HOLES AND CONSECUTI VELY NUNMBERED: 750



0022-520- 18 BI DS BY | TEM 12/ 02714 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT %
51230 GRAPH!I COLOR CORPORATI ON NG BiID
52528 HAVK GRAPHI C5, [NC 200. 00 200.00
56162 ESQU! RE GRAPHI CS 250. 00 2560. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS 420. 00 420.00
014 P EA  4-PART NCR FORNG - & -1/2" X 11-3/4":
PUNCHED HOLES { BACKING); 1, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT] ON NO BI D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 395. 00 385. 00
56162 ESOUI RE GRAPHI CS 285. 00 285. 00O
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 345. 00 345. 00
015 T EA  4-PART NCR FORMB - 8- 1/2" X 11-3/4"
PUNCHED HOLES ( BACKI NG): 5, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORFORAT! ON NO Bi D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1200. 00 1, 200. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 600. 00 600. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS G40. 00 840. 00
018 1 EA  4-PART NCR FORNB - 9-1/4" X 5-1/2"
CONSECUT! VELY NUMBERED; 1, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 275.00 275,00
B6162 ESQU RE GRAPHI CS 290. 00 280. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 310. 00 310. 00
017 1 EA 4- PART NCR FORNME - 9-1/4" X 5-1/2"

Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

CONSECUT! VELY NUNBERED; 2, 0D0

LOWBI D HAWK GRAPHI CS,

I NC

LOWBID ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBI D ESQUt RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBI D HAWK GRAPHICS, [NC



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022-520- 15 BIDS BY | TEM 12/02/ 14 PAGE 5
PRI CE ANMOUNT %
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO Bl D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 450. 00 450. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHE C5 . 365. 00 365. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 365. 00 365. 00

.................................. LOWBID TIE BID

018 1 EA  4-PART NCR FORMB - 8-1/2" X 11"
PUNCHED HOLES: 5, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BID
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NG 675. 00 675. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPH: CS 470. 00 476. 00
58348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT!I NG & GRAPHI CS 500. 00 500. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS
019 1 EA  4-PART NCR FORMS - 8-1/2" C 11"
PUNCHED HOLES: 10, 000
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORFORATI ON NO BI D
52928 HAVWK GRAPH! CS, | NC 1175. 00 1, 175. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPH!I CS 760. 00 760. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTi NG & GRAPHI CS 920. 00 920. 00
............................................................................................ LOW BI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS
020 1 EA  TYVEK SIGNAGE, 1-SIDE, 1- COLOR
8-1/2" X 117; 1,000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 300. 00 300. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 325. 00 325. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 300. 00 300. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID TIE BID
021 T EA  TYVEX SIGNAGE, 1-SIDE, 1- COLOR:

8-1/2" X 11"; 5,000



Bid #0015-18; Prop 3

0022- 520- 15 BIDS B8Y I TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 6
PRI CE ANDUNT %
51230  GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT] ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 800. 00 800. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 700. 00 700. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS 800. 00 800. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS
022 1 EA  TYVEK $IGNAGE, 1-SIDE, 1- COLOR
8 1/2" X 11": 10, 000
51230  GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO Bl D
52928 HAVK GRAPH! CS, | NC 1500. 00 1, 500. 00
56162  ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1005. 00 1, 005. 00
56348  NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 950. 00 950. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS
023 1 EA  TYVEX SIGNAGE, 1-SIDE, 2 COLORS
8 1/2" X 11": 1,000
51230  GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! CN NO Bi D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 400. 00 400. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 380. 00 380. 00
e NEWSSSEFNMNG & GMeN S w000 @000 oW1 D NEWJERSEY PRI ATI G & GRAPH G5
024 1 EA TYVEX SI GNAGE, 1-SIDE, 2 COLORS
8-1/2" X 11™: 5,000
51230 GERAPHI COLCR CORPORATI ON NG BLD
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1000. 00 1, 000. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 800. 00 $00. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 770. 00 770. 00
......................................................................................... LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS
025 1T EA  TYVEX SIGNAGE, 1-SIDE, 2 COLORS

g-1/2" X 11": 10,000



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022-520- 158 BI DS BY | TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO BI D
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1750. 00 1,750. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1220. 00 1,220.00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 1100. 00 1, 100.00
G26 1 EA TYVEX SIGNAGE - 10" X 14"; 5,000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON NO BI D
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 1580. 00 1, 550. 00
561862 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 925. 00 925. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPH! CS 855. 00 8955. 00
027 T EA GROUP A
6" X 12" SCORE CARDS ( SHARK RI VER, HOWELL,
HOM NY Hi LL, CHARLESTON SPRINGS NORTH &
CHARLESTON SPRI NGS SOUTH GOLF COURSES}
10, 0G0
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 920. 00 820. 00
52928 HAVWK GRAPHI CS, I NC 750. 00 750. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 760. 00 760. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 753. 00 750, 00
028 1 EA GRCUP A
6" X 12" SCORE CARDS { SHARK RIVER, HOVELL,
HOM NY HILL, CHARLESTON SPRI NGS NORTH &
CHARLESTON SPRI NGS SOUTH GOLF COURSES)
20, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1270. 00 1,270. 00
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC 1055. 0O 1,055, 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPH! CS 1000. 00 1, 000. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NYI NG & GRAPHI CS 950. 00 950. 00

12/02/ 14

PAGE

LOWBID NEW JERSEY v_n: NTING & GRAPHI CS

LOWBID

ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBID TIE BID

LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022- 520- 15 BIDS BY | TEM

FRi CE

028 1 EA GROUP A

ANDUNT

6" X 12" SCORE CARDS ({ SHARK RI VER, HOWELL,
HOM NY HILL, CHARLESTON SPRI NGS NORTH &
CHARLESTON m%muzmm SOUTH GOLF COURSES)

25, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1440. 00
52923 HAVWK GRAPHI CS, [NC 1250. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1200. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPHI CS 1100. 0C

030 1 EA GROUP B

1, 440. GO
1. 250. 00
1, 200. 00
1, 100. CO

4" X 12" SCORE CARDS ( PI NE BROOK & BEL- Al RE

GOLF COURSES); 10, 000

53230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 900. 00
52528 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 690. 00
58162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 760. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPHI ¢S 750. 00
031 1 EA GROUP B

8C0. 00
890. G0
760. 00

4" X 12" SCORE CARDS (Pl NE BROOK & BEL- Al RE

GOLF COURSES); 20, 000

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT!| ON 1110. 00
52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, [ NC 950. Q0
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1000. 00
563483 NEW JERSEY PR! NTI NG & GRAPH| CS 900. 00
032 1 EA GROUP B

1. 110.00
850. 00

i, 000, 00

4" X 12" SCORE CARDS (Pl NE BROOK & BEL- Al RE

GOLF COURSES): 25, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON 1300. 00
52928 HAVK GRAPH CS, 1 NC 1100. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1200, 00

i, 300. 00
1,100. 00
1, 200. 00

%

8

LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS

LOWBID HAVWK GRAPHI CS, | NC

LOW BI D NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022- 520- 15

NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS

1 EA FOOT GOLF SCORE CARDS:
GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON
HAWK GRAPHI CS, I NC
ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS
NEW JERSEY PR! NTI NG & GRAPHI CS

PRI CE

1000.

5, 000

450.
550,
497.

00

ole)
Q0
00

Bi DS BY | TEM

12/02/14 PAGE 9

ANMDUNT %

.............................. LOW BI D NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS

........................................................................................... LOWEBID NEW JERSEY PRINT! NG & GRAPH! CS

1 EA FOOT GOLF SCORE CARDS:
GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON
HAWK GRAPHI CS, 1 NC
ESQUI RE GRAPH! CS
NEW JERSEY PRI NT!I NG & GRAPHI CS

10, 000
620.
700.
650.

1T EA  GOLF COURSE | D CARDS; 5, 000

GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON

HAWK GRAPH! CS, | NC

ESQUI RE GRAPH: CS

NEW JERSEY PRI NTi NG & GRAPH! CS

1 EA GOLF COURSE | D CARDS:
GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON
HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC
ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS
NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS

10, 500

00
0o
00

NO
575.
470.
285,

NG
725,
640.
450.

.............................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHi CS

Bi D
00
00

00
............................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS

BI D
00
0C

00
.............................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

Bl DS BY

10, 0CO

| TEM

12/02/14 PAGE

ANDUNT %

NO 381D

NO 81 D
1.575. 00
850. 00
810. 00

NO BI D

NO BI I

NG B D

NO BI D

00622- 520- 15
PRI CE

037 1 EA GOLF COURSE 1D CARDS; 15, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON

52928 HAWK GRAPHI €S, 1 NC 1100. &0
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 690. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 800. 00
038 1 EA GOLF COURSE i D CARDS: 30, 000
51230 GRAPH| COLOR CORPORATI ON

52928 HAVE GRAPHI CS, | NC 1575. GO
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 850. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 810. 00
039 1 EA BUSI NESS CARDS (1 BOX): 500
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC 75. Q0
56162 ESCM RE GRAPHI CS 28. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 35, 00
040 1 EA PROGRAM PARK RECE! PT FORMB; 5, 000
51230 GRAPHI COLLOR CORPORAT! ON

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 400. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPH| CS 520. G0
041 1 EA PROGRAM PARK RECEI PT FORNE;
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORAT! ON

52928 HAVWK GRAPH: CS, | NC

NO Bi D

10

LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS

LOWBID NEW.JERSEY PRI NT! NG & GRAPHI CS

LOWEBID ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

LOWBID ESQUIRE GRAPHI CS



Bid #0015-15; Prop 3

0022- 520- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 12/02/ 14 PAGE 11
PRI CE ANDUNT %
56162 ESQU RE GRAFHI CS 560. 00 580. 00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 680. 00 680. 00

.................................. LOWBID ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS

c4a2 T EA ) NVO! CE/ STATEMENT OF ACCOUNT FORMS: 5, 00O
51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON NO B! D

52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, | NC NG Bl D

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 510. 00 510. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 500. 00 500. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBI D NEW JERSEY PRI NTING & GRAPHI CS
043 1 EA 1 NVOI CE/ STATENENT ACCOUNT FORMB; 10, 000

51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON NO Bt D

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, [ NC NO B! D

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 710. 00 710. 00

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 72C. 00 720. CO

............................................................................................ LOWBI D ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS



Bid #6015-15; Prop 4

0023-520- 15 Bl DS BY
PRI CE
001 1 EA GREEN HERI TAGE NEWSLETTER
15, 000/ 1 SSUE
02500 GRAPHI C ! MAGE, | NC. 3700. 00
04044 MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NC. 4865, 00
07854 NEOPRI NT, 1 NC. 4525. 00
08546 NPC, | NC. 3450. 00
51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 3680. 00
52928 HAWK GRAPHI CS, INC 3600. 00
56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 3720.00
56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 3800. 00

I TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE

ANDUNT %

3, 700. 00
4, 965. 00
4, 525. 00
3, 450. 00
3, 880. 00
3, 600. 00
3,720.00
3, 800. 00

1

LOWEID NPC,

I NC,



Bid #0015-15; Prop 4

0023-520- 15 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMMARY 12/02/ 14 PAGE 1
GRAPHI C | MAGE, IN
GRAPHI C I MAGE, I N MORRI S GRAPHI CS | NECPRI NT, | NC. | NPC, INC GRAPH! COLOR CORPO| HAWK GRAPHICS, IN
G01 3700. 00 3700. 00 4985. 00 48965. 00} 4525, 00 4525. 0C| 3450.00 3450. 00| 3880. 00 3680. 00| 3800.00 3600. 00
TOTALS 3700. 00| 4985. 00| 4525, §0] 3450. 001 3680. DO| 3600. 00
GRoOuUP# 2

mmDC_mmmmvaﬂnm Zm<<;mmmm<vm_2._._
001 3720. 00 3720. 00| 3800, 00 3800. 00

TOTALS 3720. 00} 3800. 00| | i |



Bid #06015-15; Prop 5

0024-520- 15
GRAPHI C | MAGE, I N

GRAPHI C | MAGE, tN| NEOPRI NT,
001 1100.00  1100.00! 1075. 00
002 1260.00  1360.0C| 2175.00
003 3520.00  3520.00! 2750. 00
TOTALS 5980, 00|
GROUP# 2

NEW JERSEY PRI NTI
001 800. 00 80C. 00
002 1450.00  1450. 00|
003 3500.00  3500. 00}
TOTALS 5750. GO|

BI DS BY I TEM - SUMVARY 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 1
I NC. NPC, [NC. GRAPHI COLOR CORPO! HAWK GRAPHICS, iN| ESQUIRE GRAPHI CS
1075.00| 850, 00 850. 00| 980. 00 98C. GO| 1190. 00 1190. 00| 12471. 75 1241. 75
2175.00| 1775. 00 1775. 00| 118G. 00 1190. 00| 1830C. 00 1830. 00| 1987. 35 1987. 35
2750. 00} 3550.00 3550. 00{ 3860.00 3860. 00] 3800. 00 3800, 00| 3097. 70 3097. 70
8000. 00| 6175. 00| 6030. 00} 6820. 00| 6326. 80



Bid #0015-15; Prop 5

0024- 520- 15 Bi DS BY | TEM 12/ 02/ 14 PAGE 1
PRI CE ANDUNT % :

001 T EA  COUNTY FAIR POSTCARDS: 30, 000

02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 1100. 00 1, 100. 00

07854 NEGPRI NT, 1 NC. 1075. 00 1, 075. 00

08546 NPC, | NC. 850. 00 850. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON 980. 00 980, 00

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, {NC 1190. 00 1, 190. 00

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1241, 75 i, 241. 75

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 800. 00 800. 0O

................................. LOWBID NEW JERSEY PRINTI NG & GRAPHI CS

002 T EA COUNTY FAIR HOME & GARDEN BROCHURES
5, 000

02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, | NC. 1360. 00 1, 360. 00

07854 NEOPRI NT, 1 NC. 2175. 00 2,175. 00

08546 NPC, 1 NC. 1775. 00 1, 775. 00

51230 GRAPHI COLOR CORPORATI ON 1190. 00 1, 190. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPH! CS, | NC 1830. 00 1, 830. 00

56162 ESQUI RE GRAPHI CS 1987. 35 7, 987. 35

56348 NEW JERSEY PRI NTI NG & GRAPHI CS 1450, 00 1, 450, 00
............................................................................................ LOW BI D GRAPHI COLOR CORPORAT! ON
003 1 EA COUNTY FAIR BOOKLETS: 25,000

02500 GRAPHI C | MAGE, I NC. 3520. 00 3, 520. 00

07854 NEOPR! NT, | NC. 2750. 00 2, 750. 00

08546 NPC, | NC. 3550. 00 3, 550. 00

51230 GRAPH! COLOR CORPORATI ON 3860. 00 3, 860. 00

52928 HAVK GRAPHI CS, | NC 3800. 00 3, 800, 00

56162 ESQU RE GRAPHI CS 3097. 70 3,0987.70

56348 NEW JERSEY PRINTING & GRAPHI CS 3500. 00 3, 500. 00

............................................................................................ LOW BID NEOPRINT, 1NC.



