BID # 0060-14

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUNDS AND TURF EQUIPMENT
SUPPLEMENT #2

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Menmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

l

Number of Bids Received |

|_Vendor Name and Address |

Barg’s Lawn & Garden Shop, Inc.; 876 Highway 33 East,
Freehold, NJ 07728

Central Jersey Equipment, LI.C; 670 Route 40,
Eblmer, NJ 08318

Cherry Valley Tractor Sales; 35 Route 70 West,
Marlton, NJ 08053-3099

Harter Equipment, Inc.; 615 State Route 33,
Millstone Twp, NJ 08535

KLBL, Inc. d/h/a Vie Gerard Golf Cars; 281 Squankum Rd.,
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Montague Tool & Supply Co., Inc.; 42 Broad St.,
Branchville, NJ 07826

Ricciardi Brothers, Inc.; 1915 Springfield Ave.,
Maplewood, NJ 07040

Storr Tractor Company; 3191 US Highway 22,
Somerville, NJ 08876

Trico; 551 N. Harding Hwy., Vineland, NJ 08360
W.H. Potter & Son, Inc.; 470 Red Hill Rd.,
Middletown, NJ 07748

Wilfred MacDonald, Inc.; 19 Central Blvd.,
South Hackensack, NJ 07606

Xtreme Machines, LLC; 700 Highway 33,
Millstone Twp, NJ 08535
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BI DS BY I TEM

11/ 06/ 14 PAGE

PRI CE ANMDUNT %

i EA 4- VHEEL DRI VE BACKHOE LOADER

BARG' S LAV & GARDEN SHOP tNC
MDNTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1 NC

KLBL | NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC.

MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.
PCTTER & SON, W H,
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY
TRI CO EQUI PMVENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

XTRENE MACHI NES
Rl CCt ARDI BROTHERS
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

1 EA M NUS OFT! ONAL TRADE- | N
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC.

KLBL 1 NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO.. | NC.

MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, W H.
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

XTREME MACH! NES
RI CCI ARD! BROTHERS
CENTRAL JERSEY EQU! PNENT
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NO
NG
NO
NO
NO
NO
NG
NO

BI D
Bi D
Bl D
(o]¢]

Bl D
B D
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LOWBI D HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC

LOWRBID HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., INC
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O\mu

11/06/ 14

PAGE

2

............................................................................................ LOW BID CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

PRi CE ANDUNT
003 1 EA MOVER | - TOW BEHI ND FLEX- W NG ROTARY
03040 BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC NC Bi D
06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO BI D
13880 KLBL 1 NC. NO BI D
15590 HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., | NC. NO BiD
20780 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC, NO BI D
28310 POTTER & SON, W H. NO BI D
33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BI D
40335 TRI CO EQUI PMENT NO BI D
49840 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO BI D
54820 Ri CCl ARDI BROTHERS NG BI D
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 20841. 47 20, 841. 47
004 1 EA M NUS OPTI ONAL TRADE- I N
03040 BARG' S LAV & GARDEN SHOP | NC NC BID
06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO BI B
13880 KLBL | NC. NO BI D
156590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1 NC. NO BI D
20760 MACDONALD, W EFRED 1 NC. NO BID
28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NC Bi D
33540 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY | NO Bl D
40335 TRI CO EQUI PNENT NO BID
48940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NG BED
547586 XTREME WMACHI NES NO BID
54920 RI CCi ARDI  BROTHERS NG Bl D
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 3500. 00 3, B00. 00-

LOWBI D CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT
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03G40
06346
13880
16590
20760
28310
33540
40335
48840
54758
54920

BIDS BY | TEM

PRI CE
2 EA MOVER 11 - 15.5 FT. PULL BEH ND TR - DECK
ROTARY FI NI SHI NG
BARG' 3 LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC NO
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO ! NC. NO
KLBL 1 NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., ! NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. 18847. GO 37,694,
POTTER & SON, WH. NG
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY NO
TRI CO EQUI PMENT NO
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTREME MACHI NES NO
Rl CCl ARDI  BROTHERS NO

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

2 EA MOVER t11 - ROTARY BRUSH (3 PT HI TCH
MOUNTED)
BARG'S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC NO
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO
KLBL | NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO.., NG NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTCR COMPANY 3526. 00 7,052
TRI CO EQUI PNENT NG
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 3022. 00 6, 044.
XTREME MACHI NES NO
RI CCl ARDI  BROTHERS NO

AMDUNT
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BI D
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BiD
00

Bl D
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BI D
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8l D
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Bl D
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00
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LOW BI D CENTRAL JERSEY EOQUI PMENT

NN N N N N N NN NN

MI\JNNI\JMNNMNN

. 000
. bco

ooC
000
000
slele}
000
000

. 000

coc
G0o0

. 000

. Q00
. 000

000
000
ele)
000
000
000
Q0o
000

- 000



1472-21401- 14

03040
06845
13880
15580
20780
28310
33540
40335
49940

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

BI DS BY ! TEM

PRt CE

3 EA MOVER !V - ZERC TURN (DI ESEL)

" BARG' S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP 1 NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.

KLBL | NC.

HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., 1NC
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES

Rl CCl ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

11800. 00
123938. 00

11626. 30

12096. 00

148886. 97

ANDUNT

4, 232.

35, 700.
37,187

NO
NO
NG

34, 878.

NO
NG

38, 988,

T EA MOVER V - ROTARY ROUGH (DI ESEL} W REAR

DI SCHARGE DECK
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP 1NC

MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.

KLBL | NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.
POTTER & SON, WH,

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQU!I PMENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

20873.12

NO
NG
NO
NO
NC
NO

20, 873.

NO
NO

72

QG
00
BiD
Bl D
BI D
80
Bl D
BI D
00
Bi D
Bl D

Bi D
BI D
BID
BI D
BI D
BiD
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Bl D
BID

Y
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LOWBID CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
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XTRENE MACHI NES
RI CCl ARDI BROTHERS
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

BIDS BY { TEM

4 EA MOVER V1 - HAND ( COMVERCE AL ROTARY,

SELF PROPELLED)
BARG' S LAV & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1 NC.
KLBL § NC.
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC.
POTTER & SON, WH,
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
TRI CO EQU! PMENT
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME NACHI NES
Rl CCl ARDI BROTHERS
CENTRAL JERSEY mOC_WEmZA

1 EA MOVER Vi - HOVER
BARG' S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC.
KLBL I NC
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC
POTTER & SON, WH.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

PRi CE ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BID
16765. 00 16, 765. 00
744,00 2,976.00
NG BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC BI D
780. 00 3,720.00
NO BI D
NG BI D
NO Bt D
NO BI D
NC BI D
362. 48 1,449,982
NO BI D
NO BI D
- NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
1129. 00 1,129, 00

%

11/08/ 14

PAGE

5

LOWBID CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

LOW BI D CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PVENT

A
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000G
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. 000
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. 000



1472-21401- 14 B! DS BY i TEM

11/08/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT %
TRI CO EQUI PMENT NO Bi b
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTRENE MACHI NES NO BI D
RI CClI ARDI BRQTHERS NO BID
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO Bl D
1 EA MOVER VIET - wALK BEHI ND T- BAR W SULKY
ATTACHMENT

BARG' S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC 3644. 00 3, 644. 00

MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1 NC. NC BI D
KLBL i NC. NO Bi D
HARTER EQUI PNMENT €O., I NC, NO BI D
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO BID
POTTER & SON, W H. 3746. 00 3, 7486. C0

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO Bl D
TRI CO EQUI PNENT - NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BID
XTREME MACHI NES NO BI D
Rl CCI ARDI BROTHERS NO BI D
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO Bl D

03040
06845
13880
15590

1 EA CAB ENCLOSURE & TRAC SYSTEM W SNOVBL OVER

ATTACHENENT
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP I NC NO
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO
KLBL | NC. NO
HARTER EQU PMENT CO., I NC. NG

8

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

1.

1
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. 000
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. D00
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000
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.............................. LOWBID BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
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BI D
BI D
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PRI CE ANVDUNT %

MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC. NC BiD
POTTER & SON, W H. NO BI D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 21707. 56 21, 707.56

TRI CO EQUI PNVENT NC BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO Bi D
XTRENME MACHI NES NO BI D
R CCl ARDI BROTHERS NO BI D
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NG BI D

1 EA 72" RECYCLI NG DECK

BARG' S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP : NC NO BID
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NG Bl D
Ki.BL I NC. NO BID
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., i NC. NO Bi D
MACDONALD, W LFRED t NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NG Bl D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 4738. 56 4, 739.56

TRICO EQUI PMVENT NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NG BID
XTREME MACHI NES NC E!' D
RI CCI ARDI BROTHERS NO BID
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D

1 EA 4 X 4 UTILITY VEHICLE | { GAS)
BARG' S LAWW & GARDEN SHOP | NC NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1 NC. NG

Bi D

BI D

7

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

LOW BI D STORR TRACTOR COMPANY
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PRI CE
KLBL {NC.
HARTER EQUi PMENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, W H,
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
TRIECO EQU PMENT
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME NMACH! NES 289900
RI CCl ARD! BROTHERS
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNVENT 10760. 00
1 EA UTHLITY VEHICLE 11 ( GAS)
BARG'S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP i NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.
KLBL 1 NC. 108385. 00

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., I NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1| NC.
POTTER & SON, wWH.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUH PMENT

CHERRY VALLEY THACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHE NES

Rl CCl ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

1 EA UTTLITY VEHICLE 111 { ELECTRI C)

BI DS BY

{ TEM
ANDUNT
NO 81 D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO Bi D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
9, 999. 00
NO BI D
10, 760. 00
NO BiI D
NO 81D
10, 995, 00
NO BI D
NO BID
NO B D
NO Bi D
\NO BID
NG BI D
NO Bi D
NO BID
NO 81D

PAGE

8

LOWBID XTREME MACHI NES

LOWBID KLBL

I NC.

. 000
. 00O
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. 00G
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PRI CE

BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP 1 NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO ! NC.
KLBL I NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., |NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

POTTER & SON, WH.

STORR TRACTOR COWMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES 11889, 00
Ri CCI ARDI  BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PVENT

BIDS BY | TEM

2 EA BUCKET FORK Ki T ( TOP MDUNTED}
BARG'S LLAVN & GARDEN SHOP i NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.
KLBL 1 NC.

HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., INC
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

POTTER & SON, WH.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENVE MACHI NES

RI CCi ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PVENT

11/ 06/ 14 PAGE
ANGUNT %
NO Bl D
NO BID
NG BID
NG BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO B! D
NO BI D
NO BI D
11,.888. 060
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NC BID
NO BiD
NG 8I D
NO BI D
NC BID
NO B! D
NO B8l D
NO BID
KO Bi D
NO Bt D

9

LOWBID XTRENME MACHI NES

LOWBEID

. 000
. Q00
. 000
. 000
. Q0o
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 0C0
. 000

. 000

000

. Do0
. 000

000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000G

. 000
. 00C
. 000
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PRI CE ANDUNT %

018 1 EA  BOX SCRAPER |

03040 BARG' S LAV & GARDEN SHOP | NC NO BI D 1. 000
08845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1NC. NO BI D 1. 000
13880 KLBL 1 NC. NC BiD 1. 000
15590 HARTER EQUi PMENT €O., INC. NO BI D 1. 00O
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BID 1. 000
28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D 1. 000
33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 1508, 00 1, 508. 00 1. 000
40335 TRI CO EQUI PMENT NO BID 1. 000
49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 1253, 26 1, 253. 26 1. 000
54758 XTRENE MACH! NES NO BI D 1.000
54920 Rl CCi ARDI BROTHERS NO BiD 1. 000
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUt PMENT 8400, 00 8, 400. 09 1. 000
............................................................................................ LOWRBID CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
019 1 EA  BOX BLADE SCRAPER 1{

03040 BARG' S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP i NC NO Bi D 1. 000
06845 MDNTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO BID 1. 000
13880 KLBL | NC. NO BI D 1, 000
15590 HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., | NC. NO BI D 1. 000
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NG Bl D ~1.000
28310 POTTER & SON. W H. NO Bl D 1. 000
33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BID 1. 000
40335 TRI CO EQUI PVENT ‘ NO BI D 1. 000
49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NC BID 1. 000
54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO BID _ 1. 000
54920 RI CCI ARDI  BROTHERS NO BID 1. 000
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT \O BID 1. 000

............................................................................................ LOW BI D
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33540 STORR TRACTOR COWPANY

40335 TRI CO EQUI PMENT

49840 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 - XTREME MACHI NES

54920 Rl CCi ARDI BROTHERS

57058 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

020 1 EA LANDSCAPE RAKE (3 POINT HI TCH)

03040 BARG' S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC

06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO ! NC.

13880 KLBL I NC.

15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC

207680 MACDONALD, W LFRED i NC.

28310 POTTER & SON, WH. 3094. 00

33540 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 4187. 00

40335 TRI CO EQUI PMENT

49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 3129.00

54756 XTREME MACHI NES

54920 Rt CCI ARDI BROTHERS

57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 700. 00
021 1 EA  GAS POVERED SPRAYER

03040 BARG' S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC

06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO 1 NC. 1098. 00

13880 KLBL §NC

15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., [NC

20780 MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.

28310 POTTER & SON, WH. 1085. 00

ANDUNT
NO Bi b
NO BI D
NG BI D
NO BI D
NO 81 D
3,094, 00
4,187.00
NC Bi D
3,128.00
NO BI D
NO BI D
700. 00
NO BI D
1,088, 0C
NO BID
NC BiD
NO BID
1. 085. 00
NO BID
NO BID
NC BiD
NO BID
NO Bl D
NO BI D

o\o

11/06/ 14

PAGE

11

LOWBID CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

LOWBID POTTER & SON, WH.

. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 00C
. 000
. Q00
. 000
. 000
. 000
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BI BS BY | TEM

PRI CE

ANMDUNT

1 EA 3- POINT HI TCH MDUNTED BOOM.ESS SPRAYER |}

BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.
KLBL 1 NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., ! NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, W H.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PMVENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES

R CCI ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

7 EA  BLOVER | - BACK PACK
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC.
KLBL I NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO.. | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

POTTER & SON, W H.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACH! NES

RI CCI ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

283.
261.

263.

271.

00
76

00

00

NO
NO
NO
NG
NO
NCQ
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO

1,981,
1,832,

NO
NO
NO

1, 841.

NO
NO

1,837

Bi D
Bl D
BI D
Bt D
BI D
Bl D
BI D

oo
32
BI D
BI D
B D
00
BI D
Bl D

%

11/06/ 14

PAGE
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LOW Bl D

LOWBI D NONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO

NN N NN

NoNON N N NN

. 0C0
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. Q00
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. Q00
. 000
000
c00
. 000
000
000
00cC
oo
000

. 000
1 NC,
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1 EA BLOVER 11 - HAND

BARG S {LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC

MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO i NC

KLBL | NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC

MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

POTTER & SON, WH

STORR TRACTCR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PMENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

XTREME MACH! NES

RI CCl ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
2 EA BLOVWER 111 -

BARG' S LAVN & GARDEN SHOP i NC

MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO ! NC

KLBL

HARTER EOQUI PMENT CO.

I NC.

I NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, W H.

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME NMACH! NES
Rl CCt ARD! BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

DEBRI S { TRAI LER

BIDS BY | TEM 11/06/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE AMDUNT %
209. 00 209. 00
201. 92 201,92
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID
188. 00 188. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
160. 00 150. 00
NO BID
NO BI D
228. 48 228. 48
NOUNTED)
NC BiD
NO BI D
NO B D
NG BiD
NO BI D
NG BI D
6727. 96 13, 455. 92
NO Bi D
NO BI D
NC B! D
NO BID
NO BI D

3

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

1.
................................. LOW B! D CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

- 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000
. OO
. 000
. 000
. 000

000

. 000
. 000

000

. 060G
. 000

000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000

. 000
. Goo
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028 3 EA CHAFN SAW I - SMALL
03040 BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC
13880 KLBL I NC
15590 HARTER EQUI PVENT CO., 1NC.
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

28310 POTTER & SON, WH.

33540 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

44335 TRI CO EQWH PMENT

43940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 XTREME MACH! NES

54920 Ri CCt ARDI BROTHERS

57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

027 2 EA CHAEN SAW I - LARGE
03040 BARG'S LAWK & GARDEN SHOP | NC
06845 WDNTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC
13880 KLBL I NC
155580 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., I NC
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

28310 POTTER & SON, WH

33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

40335 TRI CC EQUI PVENT

49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 XTREME MACHI NES

54920 RI CCl ARDI BROTHERS

57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

288. 00
278. 56

263. 00

818. 00
798. 66

735. 00

ANDUNT
864. 00
835. 68
NG BI D
NG BID
NO BI D
789. 00
NO Bi D
NO 8i D
NC BID
NO BID
NO 81 D
956, 37
1, 636. 00
1,687, 32
NO BI D
NO BI D
NG BID
1,470. 00
NO BI D
NC BI D
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
1, 808.786

%
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LOWBID POTTER & SON, - W H.

LOWBID POTTER & SON, WH,
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PRI CE ANDUNT %

028 7 EA  POLE PRUNER

03040 BARG' S LAVN & GARDEN SHOP | NC 478. 00 3, 346. 00 7. 000
06845 MDNTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO ¢ NC. 467. 74 3,274.18 7. 000
13880 KLBL 1 NC. NO 81D 7. 000
15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO Bl D 7.000
20760 MACDONALD, W LERED | NC. NO Bt D 7. 000
28310 POTTER & SON, WH. 432.00 3, 024. 00 7. 000
33540 STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY NO Bi D 7. 000
40335 TRI CC EQUI PNENT NO Bi D 7. 000
49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D 7. 000
54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO BID 7. 000
54920 Rl CCI ARDI BROTHERS NO B! D 7. 000
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 535. 54 3.748. 78 7. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID POTTER & SON, WH.
029 1 EA  EDGER | - LAWN

03040 BARG' S LAVWN & GARDEN SHOP | NG NO BI D 1. 000
06845 MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NO BI D 1. 000
13880 KLBL 1 NC. NG Bi D _ 1. 000
15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., [ NC, NO BI D 1. 000
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. \NO BID 1. 000
28310 POTTER & SON, WH, 510. Q0 510. 00 1. 000
33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BI D 1. 000
40335 TRI CO EQUI PMENT NO BI D 1. 000
49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D 1. 000
54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO BID 1. 000
54920 RI CCI ARDI  BROTHERS NO BI D 1. 000
57059 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D 1. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID POTTER & SON, WH.



1472- 21401- 14

T EA  EDGER f! - RECI PROCATI NG

BARG' S LAVIN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC
KLBL | NC.

HARTER ECQUI PMENT CO., i NC.
MACDONALD, W ILFRED i NC.
POTTER & SON, WH

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

TRI CO EQUI PNVENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENVE MACHI NES

Ri CCI ARDI BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

7 EA  TRIMMER | - LINE
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY GO | NC
KLBL | NC,

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, W H.

STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

TRI CO EQUI PMENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES

Rl CCI ARD! BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PVENT

BI DS BY { TEM

PRI CE

793. 00

534. 50

288. 00
276.72

263. 00

369, 50

AMOUNT
NO Bl D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID

783. 00
NO Bl D
NO BID
NO BID

534. 50
NG BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

2,086.00
1.837.04
NG Bl D
NO BI D
NO BID
1,841.00
NO BI D
NC BID
2,588 50
NO BID
NG BID
2,537.71

%
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1.
LOW Bt D CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

LOWEBID POTTER & SON, WH.
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BEDS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
4 EA TREMVER |1 - HEDGE W EXT REACH AND
ART! CULATI NG HEAD
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP | NC 404, 00 1. 616. 00
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC, 373.986 1,485. 84
KLBL I NC. NO BID
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO BiD
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, W H. 355. 00 1,420.00
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NO BI D
TRI CO EQUt PMENT NO BiD
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BID
XTRENE MACHI NES NG Bi D
Ri CCt ARDI  BROTHERS NO BI D
CENTRAL JERSEY EQU! PMVENT 427. 42 1.709. 868
4 EA PRESSURE WASHER

BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP [ NC NO BID
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO | NC. NG BiD
KLBL I NC. NO BID
HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., | NC. NG BiD
MACDONALD, W LFRED ! NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH, NC BID
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BID
TRI CC EQUI PMVENT NO Bt D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTRENME MACH! NES 1200. 00 4, 800. c0
Rl CCi ARDI BROTHERS 899. 00 3, 586. 00

Yo

11/06/ 14
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LOWEBID POTTER & SON, WH.
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PRI CE

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT

1 EA Ft ELD PAI NTER ( GAS)
BARG'S LAWN & GARDEN SHOP I NC
MONTAGUE TOOL & SUPPLY CO I NC.
KLBL f NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC.
POTTER & SON, WH,

STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

TRI CO EQUI PMENT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME WACHI NES

Rt CCI ARDI  BROTHERS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

BiDS BY | TEM

11/ 06/ 14 PAGE

ANDUNT %

NO BI D
NO Bt D
NO BI D
NG BI D
NO Bl D
NO BID
NO Bt D
NG BI D
NG Bi D
NO BI D

18

EOWBI D Ri CClI ARD

LOWBID RICCI ARD
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