BID # 0033-14

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GOLF COURSE SUPPLIES

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: {732) 842-4000, £xt. 4330
Fax: {732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

I

Number of Bids Received |

| _Vendor Name and Address |

3]

Kirby Markers, LLC; 56 Peacevine, Irvine, CA 92618

John Deere Landscapes; 1385 East 36" St.,

Cleveland, OH 44114

Fertl-Soil Turf Supply, Inc.; PO Box 997, 514 Martin Pi,
Scotch Plains, NJ 07076
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0376- 520- 14 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMVARY 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE 3
FERTL-SOIL TURF S  JOHN DEERE LANDSC Kl RBY MARKERS
085 338,75 1355.00| 337.50 1350. 00| i |

056  26.40 105. 60  26.25 105. 00! |
057  63.00 126.00|  62.25 124. 50! m _ ;
058  16.55 49. 65| 7. 31 21. 93] I
059 11.25  270.00| 10.83 259. 92| ! [

060 9. 60 230. 40| | | |
061  10.55 158. 25} m I |
062  64.70 64. 70] { w !
063 10.70 267. 50| _ w m
064  11.50 138. 00| ! | w

065  32.15 96.45|  31.50 94, 50| | |
066 32.15 192.90;  31.50 189. 00| |
067 69.65  208.95] 66.44 199. 32} |
068  2.66 15. 96| 2.83 - 15.18] m M
069 1.55 4.65] 1.44 4. 32| | |
070 9.85 49. 25| 9. 39 46. 95| | |
071 . 40 2. 40} .36 2. 16| * _
072 . 40 2. 401 .36 2. 18} |

073  47.95 1¢1. 80| I [ |
074  57.90 115. 8G| _ I : |

075 ~ 9.13 54. 78| 8. 00 54. 00| | w
076 44,20 309.40]  44.25 309. 75| |
077 .38 27. 361 .36 25.92] _

078  70.35 211. 05| | | !
07% 164, 95 329. 90| | ] |
080 8. 50 51. 00 ! _ “
081 87.30 87.30f 86.25 86. 25| |
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BI DS BY I TEM - SUMVARY 4729/ 14 PAGE 4
LANDSC  KIRBY MARKERS

17. 25} i m
86. 25| _ |
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6.51] ! |
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0376- 520- 14 BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
001 3 EA  PAINT APPLI CATOR W LONG HANDLE:
PAR Al DE; 12401
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 20. 99 62.97
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 21.00 63. 00
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
co2 8 EA  DURA-FLEX S!GN "GROUND UNDER REPAI R*:
PAR Al DE; 5260- 01
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 17. 60 140. 80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17.43 139. 44
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
003 8 EA  DURA-FLEX S!GN "VET AREAS CARTS KEEP OFF":
PAR Al DE: 5620-08
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY INC. 17. 60 140, 80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17. 43 139.44
51221 Kt RBY MARKERS NO BI D
004 2 EA DURA-FLEX SIGN "PLEASE KEEP OFF":
PAR Al DE; 5620- 10
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC, 17. 60 35. 20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17. 43 34.86
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
005 7 EA DURA FLEX SIGN "< -- CARTS":
PAR Al DE; 5620-17
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 17. 60 123. 20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17. 43 122. 01
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

%

3.
3.

3.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

LOWEBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
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0376- 520- 14 BI DS BY [ TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE 2

PRI CE ANDUNT %
006 1 EA DI RECTI ONAL MARKERS; PAR Al DE; 12250- 25
GREEN AND Wi TE
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 103. 90 103. 80 1. 000
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 102. 00 102. 00 1. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NG BI D 1. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
007 2 EA GREEN LINE I NFO SIGN; STANDARD; 10345;
"I T'S EVERY PLAYERS RESPONS!BI LI TY. .
11750 FERTL- SOIL TURF SUPPLY I NC. 18. 90 37. 80 2. 000
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 16. 25 32. 50 2. 000
51221 KI BBY MARKERS NO BI D 2. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
008 27 EA ROYALINE FLAG STICK 7.5 WM TE WRED STRI PE
STANDARD; 26101
11750 FERTL- SOt L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 14. 05 379. 35 27. 000
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 13. 90 375. 30 27.000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO Bi D 27. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
009 6 EA  TAPERED FiBERGLASS TOURNANENT STI CKS:
PAR Al DE; BRIGHT YELLOW (9 PER SET} 707- 079
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 243. 55 1,461, 30 6. 000
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 244, 62 1,467.72 6. 000
51221 K! RBY MARKERS NO BI D 6. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BID FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY INC
010 2 EA  TAPERED FI BERGLASS TOURNAMENT STI CKS:
PAR Al DE; BRITISH BLACK & WHI TE (9 PER SET)
708- 079
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 264. 70 529. 40 2.000
17884  JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES 264. 87 529. 74 2. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D 2. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY 1NC.



0376-520- 14

BIDS BY | TEM 4129/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE ANMDUNT %
1 EA  JUNIOR FLAG ST! CX MARKER/ FLAG SETS:
PAR Al DE; 9182-9
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY iNC. 186. 50 186. 50
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 184,12 184.12
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D
6 EA  TAPERED FIBERGLASS TOURNAMENT STi CKS 374"
PAR AIDE: BRI GHT WHI TE { EACH): 706-079
FERTL- S0l L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 27.12 162. 72
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 27.18 163. 08
K! RBY MARKERS NG BID
2 EA  TOURNAMENT JUNI OR FLAG ST!CK MARKER,;
PAR Al DE; (SET OF 9}; 9111-9
FERTL- S0l L TURF SUPPLY {NC. 194, 00 388. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 180. 5O 381.00
KI RBY MARKERS NO BI B

332. 40

6 EA  TWD TONE FLAGS- NYLON YELLOW W TH BLACK TUBE
STANDARD; (9 PER SET); 22780T
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 55. 40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 52,72

Ki RBY MARKERS

316. 32

SEVWN CHECKERED FLAG W SCREEN PRI NTI NG

BLACK; STANDARD; 9 PER SET; 22330TP & 26139

FERTL- SOt L TURF SUPPLY ! NC. 168. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

KI RBY WMARKERS

151. 67

672. 00
606. 68

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

G
6

8
LOWBID FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY | NC.

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 00O
. 000
. 000

000
000
GO0

. 000
. 000
. 006

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0376-520- 14

1 EA  CHECKERED FLAGS - BLUE & WHI TE: TUBE;
PAR AIDE; 9 PER SET; 8512

FERTL- S80I L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 98. 20
JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES 98. 25
Ki RBY MARKERS

1 EA HI O HOLE CUTTER; PAR Al DE; 1009-02
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 75. 90
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 74.25
KI RBY MARKERS

1T EA  H O EJECTING ROD; PAR Al DE: 1003- 10
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 21. 60
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 18. 00

PRI CE
2 EA  CHECKERED FLAGS - RED & VWHI TE; TUBE:
PAR AIDE: 9 PER SET; 8502
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 89. 20
JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES 88. 25

Ki RBY MARKERS

Kl RBY NMARKERS

BI DS BY | TEM

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

ANDUNT %

2t. 860
18. 00
NO BI D

323.00

2 EA  CUP CUTTER- LEVEL ACTION; PAR Al DE; 1001- 2%
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 161. 50
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 159. 75

Ki RBY MARKERS

318. 50

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWB! D JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0376-520- 14

PRI CE ANDUNT
4 EA CUP CUTTER BLADES 7° SCALLOPED;
PAR AIDE; 1008-01

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 32. 20 128. 80
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 31. 50 126. 00
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BID

6 EA  CUP CUTTER BLADES; PAR Al DE; 1008-02
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 32. 20 193. 20
JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES 3t. 50 189. 00
KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D

1 EA CUP PULLER; PAR AIDE; 1032
FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY I NC. 13.05 13.086
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 12.75 12,75
Kl RBY MARKERS NO BID

5 EA HOLE CUTTER DEFTH GAUGE; PAR Al DE; 1034
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 24.45 122. 25
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 24,00 120. 00
Kl RBY MARKERS NG BiD

6 EA PRACTI CE GREEN CUPS (EACH); PAR Al DE; 940
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY [ NC. 4.10 24.860
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 4. .12 24,72
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D

BIDS BY | TEM

4 EA CUP HOOK; STANDARD; 33200

4/ 29714 PAGE

%

LOWB!I D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWRBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

6.
6.

6.
LOWBID FERTL- SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 00C
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
Coo
000



0376- 520- 14

BIi DS BY | TEM

18 EA EVER- VHI TE ALUM NUM CUP W SLEEVE |( EACH} ;
PAR Al BE; 935
FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY { NC. 17.80 320.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17.62 317
Kl RBY MARKERS NO

PRI CE ANDUNT
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 7. 50 30. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 7.22 28. 88
KI RBY MARKERS NO BID

36 EA  ALUM NUM PUTTI NG CUP; PAR Al DE; 930

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 18. 40 590. 40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 18. 31 587. 16
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D

10
50

3 EA SET OF 18 EVER-WHI TE CUP SLEEVES: PAR Al DE;
935- 1
FERTL- SO! L. TURF SUPPLY | NC. 22.70 68.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 22.50 67.
KI RBY MARKERS NO

18 EA  CLASSIC TEE MARKER ( RED) EACH; STANDARD;
5600
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 5. 40 97.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 5. 42 87.
Kl RBY MARKERS NO

20

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

36.
36.
36.

18.
18.
18,

18.
18.
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
Goo
000

000
0G0
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000



0376- 520- 14 Bi DS BY { TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT %
031 36 EA CLASSI C TEE MARKER (VI TE) EACH:
STANDARD; 5801
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 5. 40 184. 40
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 5.42 185,12
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
032 18 EA CLASSI C TEE MARKER ( BLUE) EACH;
STANDARD; 5602
11750 FERTL- SOl . TURF SUPPLY INC. 5. 40 87. 20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 5. 42 97. 56
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
033 38 EA SHARK RIVER LOGD ALUM NUM DES! GNER GOLF;
CMTY; RED
11750 FERTL- S0l L TURF SUPPLY I NC. NO BI D
17884 JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC BI D
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D
034 38 EA  SHARK RIVER LOGO ALUM NUM  DES] GNER GOLF;
CNTT; WHETE
11750 FERTL- SOi L ._pcmm SUPPLY I NC. NO BI D
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO Bi D
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NG BFED
035 38 EA SHARK Rl VER LOGC ALUM NUM DES! GNER GOLF;
CMT1: BLUE
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. NO BI D
17884 JOHN DELRE LANDSCAPES NO BI D
61221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BID

LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY |

LOWBI D FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY t

LOW BI D

LOWBI D

LOWEBID

36.
36.

36.
NC.

18.
18.

18.
NC.

38.
38.
38,

38.
38,
38.

38.
38.
38.

Co0
000
000

000
000
Qo0

000
000
000

Qoo
000
000

Coo
000
oo0



0376-520- 14

Bi DS BY | TEM

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

ANDUNT %

170. 88
16%. 86

284, 80
283. 10
NO BI D

763, 20

PRI CE
038 5 EA  JUNIOR TEE MARKER; PAR AlDE; 647-8
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY INC. 12.32
17884 JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES 12. 00
51221 Kl RBY MARKERS
G637 6 EA CAST ALUM NUM TEEL MARKER ( PAR- Al DE RED} ;
PAR Al DE; HOM NY; 655.1%
11780 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 28. 48
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 28. 31
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS
038 10 EA  CAST ALUM NUM TEE MARKER ( VWHI TE) ;
PAR Al DE; HOM NY; 655-2
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 28.48
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 28. 31
51221 KI RBY MARKERS
039 6 EA  CAST ALUM NI UM TEE MARKER {BLUE)
PAR Al DE; HOM NY; 655-3
11780 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 28.48
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 28. 31
51221 KI RBY MARKERS
040 36 EA P RON WOODS TEE MARKERS; PRESTW CK:
I W TMBOO- 08- 05; YELLOW
11750 FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 21.20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
51221 KI RBY MARKERS

6
4]
6
LOWBID JCHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
6
6
6
LOWEBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
10.
10.
10.
LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
6
6
6
LOWBID JOHWN DEERE LANDSCAPES
36.
36.
36.

LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
0co
000

. oo
. Q00
. 000

000
000
000



0378-520- 14 BIDS BY I TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE 2

PRI CE ANDUNT | %

041 16 EA  DELUXE BALLWASHER; PAR Al DE; HUNTER GREEN:

203- 02
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 169. 39 2,710. 24 16. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 169. 50 2,712. 00 16. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D . _ 16. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY I NC.
042 6 EA  TRASH MATE SINGLE; PAR Al DE: 3004- 02 _
11750 FERTL- $OI L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 45.90 275. 40 6. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 45. 00 270. 00 6. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BID 6. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
043 18 EA  TRASH MATE HOOP FRAME; PAR Al DE: 3015
11750 FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 10. 90 196. 20 18. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 10. 68 192. 24 18. 000 -
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D 18. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
044 2 EA  CLUB WASHER; PAR Al DE; GREEN: 250-(02
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURE SUPPLY | AC. 66. 50 133. 00 2. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 65. 25 130. 50 2. 000
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO Bl D : _ 2. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
045 2 EA  RANGE MATE CLUB WASHER BRUSH; STANDARD: 1602
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 61. 50 123. 00 2. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 63. 00 126. 00 2. 000
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO Bi D 2. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.
046 4 EA  CLUB WASHER REPLACEMENT BRUSH: PAR Al DE:

254



0376-520- 14

PRI CE ANMDUNT
11750 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 24. 85 98. 80
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 24, 37 97. 48
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NC BI D
047 18 EA SPI KE BRUSH REPLACENENT BASE BRUSH:
PAR Al DE; 554- 11
11750 FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 13. 60 244,80
17884 JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES 13.31 239.58
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
048 i EA  PORTABLE SPIKE BRUSH STAND; PAR Al DE:
512-11
11750 FERTL- SOt L. TURF SUPPLY | NC. 160. 25 150. 25
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 149. 25 149, 25
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D
049 4 EA DI VOT MATE CONTAI NER SCOOP; PAR Al DE:
400
11750 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 3.99 15. 96
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 3.93 15.72
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D
050 10 EA LARGE COTTON TOVELS 18" X 18"; GREEN;
STANDARD { TPK = 12 TOMELS): 4200
11750 mm,m._._.‘ S0 L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 26. 20 262. 00
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 25. 28 252. 80
51221 Kl RBY MARKERS NO BID

BI DS BY { TEM

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

i0

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWEBID JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES

LOWBID .JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES

18.
18.
18.

1C.
10.
10.

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
0G0
0G0

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

00C
000
000



0378-520- 14

PR! CE ANDUNT
6 EA CHI X TOVEELS ( 200 PER CASE); STANDARD:
4970
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 120. 20 721. 20
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 120. 83 724,98
KI RBY MARKERS NG BI D
6 EA CASE OF SPARKLEEN (4 ONE GALLON JUGS);
STANDARD; 3300
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 44 50 267. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 44. 06 264. 36
KI RBY MARKERS NO BID

1 EA 25" ACCUFORM ACE ||

BOX OF 25; 995-525
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 506. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 506. 256

KI RBY MARKERS

BI DS BY | TEM

BUNKER RAKE; PAR Al DE;

505. 00
506. 25

3C8. 80

1 EA  ACCUFORM ACCUCURVE BUNKER RAKES: PAR Al DE;
BOX OF 25; 997-125
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 306. 90
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 3C0. 00

KI RBY MARKERS

4 EA
BOX OF 25; 997-872-8
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1| NC. 338.75
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 337.50

Kl RBY MARKERS

300. 00

ACCUFORM ACCUCURVE BUNKER RAKES: PAR Al DE;

1,355.00 *
1.350.00

4/29/14 PAGE

%

11

6.
6.

B.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY I NC

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

1.
1.

1
LOWB!D FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

0Cco
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000

. Q00
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
- 000



0376-520- 14 BIDS BY | TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

PRI CE ANDUNT %
058 4 EA %OOCmomg DEEP FACE BUNKER RAKE; PAR Al DE:
95-7
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 26. 40 105. 60
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 26. 25 105. 00
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NC BI D
057 2 EA  ACCUFORM MAI NTENANCE BUNKER RAKE: PAR Al DE:
13130
11780 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 63. 00 126. 00
17884 JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES 82. 25 124. 50
51221 Ki BBY MARKERS . NO BID
058 3 EA  ACCUFORM DEEP FACE BUNKER HANDLE; PAR Al DE:
972-2
11780 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 16. 55 49.65 *
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 7.3 27.93
51221 Kl RBY MARKERS NC BI D
059 24 EA  TOUR SNDOTH RAKE: STANDARD: 11995
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY. | NC. 11. 25 270.00 *
17884 JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES 10. 83 258. 82
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI b
060 24 EA DELUXE ROPE STAKES - GREEN; PRESTW CK:
R3D18; SLOT
11750 FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 9. 80 230. 40
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO Bt D

12

&
4
4
LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
2
2
2
LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
3
3
3
LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
24,
24,
24,
LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
24,
24.
24,

LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY i NC.

. 000
. 0G0
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. Q00
. 000
. 000

000
000
000

000
000
0G0



0376- 520- 14

PRI CE ANOUNT
15 EA DELUXE ROPE STAKES - 24" GREEN W HOLE:
PRESTW CK; RSD 24- 01
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 10. 55 158. 25
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BIE
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D
1 EA 1/2" BRAI D POLYPROPYLENE ROPE 500 FT:
VHI TE: EAGLE ONE: F1801/2wW
FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY | NC. 64. 70 64. 70
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NOC Bl D
KI RBY MARKERS NC Bt D

12 EA 2 X 2 X 24 VYHI TE HAZARD NMBRKER: PRESTW CK;
0OB232s- 04
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 11. 50 138. 00
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D
3 EA BRAI DED POLYPROPOLENE ROPE; PAR Al DE:
12958 ( GREEN)
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 32. 16 96. 45
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 31. 50 94, 50
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D

Bl DS BY | TEM

25 EA 2 X 2 X 24 RED HAZARD MARKER; PRESTW CK:
HD2245- 07
FERTL- SOt L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 10. 70 287.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO
Ki RBY MARKERS NO

4/ 28/ 14

%

PAGE

13

15,
15.

15.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

25,
25.

25.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

12,
12.

i2.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

000
000
000

. 000
. 000

1. 000
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

000
Co0
OGO

000
000
000

. 000
. 00O
. 000



0378-520- 14

8 EA
12962 { GREEN

FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
Ki RBY MARKERS

3 EA
FERTL- SOi L TURF SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
Ki RBY MARKERS

6 EA
FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

GREENSKEEPER

KI RBY MARKERS

3 EA  GREENSKEEPER
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
Ki RBY MARKERS

5 EA  GREENSKEEPER
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
K! RBY MARKERS

6 EA GREENSKEEPER

GREENSKEEPER/ COMPLETE:

Bi BS BY

PRI CE

AND WHI TE)
1 NC. 32.15

31.50

STANDARD; 272
I NC. 69. 65

66. 44

FI NGER; STANDARD; 27205
I NC. 2.66

2.53

SPRING; STANDARD: 27203
I NC, 1.55

1.44

FLOOR PLATE; STANDARD;
I NC. 9.85
9. 38

ROLL PIN; STANDARD; 272

iTEM

ANDUNT

BRAI BED POLYPROPOLENE ROPE; PAR Al DE;

182,
189,

oC

27202

48,
46.

06

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

%

14

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWEB!D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. Q00
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 060
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0376- 520- 14

PRI CE ANDUNT

FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC. . 40 2.40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES .36 2.16
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BID

6 EA  SNAP RING STANDARD; 27207
FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY I NC. . 40 2. 40
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES .36 2.16
KI RBY MARKERS NO Bi D

4 EA  HOT SHOT SPRAY NOZZLE 3/4"; EAGLE ONE;

| RGOOS5

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 47. 95 191. 80
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID
KI RBY MARKERS NO BID

2 EA  HOT SHOT SPRAY NOZZLE 1"; EAGLE ONE:

I RGOO7

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 57. 90 115. 80
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D

6 EA LIDS (CANS ONLY); PAR Al DE; 3010
FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 9.13 54. 78
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 9. 00 54. 00
KI RBY MARKERS NO BID

7 EA_ EZ WHIP WHI PPING POLE; PAR AlIDE; 1060

Bl DS BY | TEM

-

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

15

LOWRBID JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

4.
4.

4.
LOWBI D FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY I NG.

2.
2.

2.
LOWBID FERTL-SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC.

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
G000
000

000
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0376-520- 14

BIiDS BY I TEM

PRI CE

11750 FERTL-S0OI L TURF SUPPLY 1{NC. 44,20
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 44, 25
51221 KI RBY MARKERS

077 72 EA FI BER GASKET, STANDARD, 1332
11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC, 38
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES . 36
51221 KI RBY MARKERS

078 3 EA SO L PROBE, EACH: M LTONA; L-515
11780 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 70. 35
17884 JOHN BEERE LANDSCAPES

51221 KI RBY MARKERS

079 2 EA SOIL PROFILER; MLTONA, T-520
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 164. 95
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

51221 Kl RBY MARKERS

080 6 EA RAIN GAUGE; EAGLE ONE; 1012
11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 8. 50
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

51221 Ki RBY MARKERS

081 1 EA  JOB BOARDS; PAR AID;, 7250-02
11750 FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY 1NC. B7. 30

ANDUNT

308.
309.

87.

30

4] 29/ 14 PAGE

16

7.
LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY i NC.

72.
72.
72.

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

2.

2

[
6

6
LOWBI B FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY I NC.

. 000
. 000

Q00

000
0Qo
C00

. 000
. 000

3. 000
LOWBI D FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.

000

. 000

2.
LOWBI D FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY INC

G000

olele)
000
000

. 000



0376-520- 14 Bi DS BY | TEM

086
11750
17884

PRI CE ANDUNT
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 86. 25 86. 25
KI RBY MARKERS NOC BI D

1 EA WMARKER TRAY; PAR AID; 7250-02

FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 17. 45 17.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 17.25 17.
Ki RBY MARKERS NO

1 EA MOW NG PATTERN BOARD; PAR Al D; 7250- 11

FERTL- SCi L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 87. 30 87.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 88. 25 86.
Kt RBY MARKERS NO

2 EA  SCORECARD CADDY; PAR Al D; 3359

FERTL- S80I L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 147.22 294.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 146. 25 292.
Kl RBY MBRKERS NO

3 EA  DECALS CANS OR BOTTLES; STANDARD GOLF:

13191
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY ! NC. 2.39 7.
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 2.17 8.
Kl RBY MARKERS NO

3 EA DECALS TRASH ONLY; STANDARD GOLF; 13192
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1INC, 2.39 7
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 2.17 B

17
. b1

4/ 28/ 14 PAGE

%

17

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWEBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES

LOWSBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. Q00
. 000

. 000
. 600
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000



0376-520- 14 BI BS BY ! TEM

081
11750
17884

PRI CE ANDUNT

Kl RBY MARKERS NO

6 EA  TRIPOD BASE ONLY BLACK; STANDARD GOLF;

36201
FERTL- S0Oi L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 438. 00 294
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 46. 94 281.
Ki RBY MARKERS NO

3 EA  AERIFYING CUP PLUGS; PAR AID; 1070 SET OF

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 40. 85 121,
JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES 40.12 120.
KI RBY MARKERS NO

1C¢ EA RUBBER CURBI NG - BLACK: EAGLE ONE; F3416
8' LONG, 6" WDE, 4" TALL

FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY I NC, 195. 00 1, 950,
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NG
Ki RBY MARKERS NO

2 EA BENCH; STANDARD; 100500, 6 FT

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 377.70 755
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 316. 87 633.
KI RBY MARKERS NG

2 EA HI GH BACK TEE BENCHES; EAGLE ONE: T-230

FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 392. 00 784,

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO

00
Bi b

4/ 28} 14 PAGE

18

3
LOWBID JOHN DEERE { ANDSCAPES

G

6

8
LOWBID JCOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

3

3

3
LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

10.

10,

LOWBID JCOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 0G0

. 000
. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
0G0

10. 000
LOWBID FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC.

. 000
. 000
. 0C0

. D0C
. 000



0376-520- 14 : BIDS BY | TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE 19

PRI CE ANDUNT %

51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BID 2. 000
.............. T ... LOwBID FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY I NC.
092 2 EA  WATER COOLER HOUSE; PRESTW CK: GL- SWP

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 979. 20 1, 958. 40 2. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 2. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D 2. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC.
093 18 EA  WATER COOLER 10 GALLON; PAR AID; 3657 GREEN

11750  FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC. 64. 80 1, 166. 40 : 18. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 79. 50 1,431. 00 18. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D 18. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.
094 6 EA WATER COOLER 5 GALLON, PAR AID: 3867 GREEN

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 54. 90 329. 40 6. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 51. 00 308. 00 6. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BiD 6. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
095 7 EA B2 QUART ICE CHEST: |1GLOO; 13179

11750 FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY | NC. 74. 50 521. 50 * 7. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID 7. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO Bi D 7. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D FERTL-SOfL TURF SUPPLY [ NC.
096 90 EA  SPIGOT FOR PLASTIC COOLER; STANDARD; 45315

11750 FERTL- SO L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 6. 64 597. 60 _ 90. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 8. 67 780. 30 90. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D . 000

90
............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-S0i L TURF SUPPLY | NC.



0376-520- 14

PRI CE

6 EA DELUXE COVER; PAR- Al DE; 2203- 01
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 31. 81
JOHN DEERE LLANDSCAPES 31,560
Ki RBY MARKERS

8 EA DELUXE COVER: PAR Al DE; 2203-03
FERTL- SOl L. TURF SUPPLY { NC. 31. 81
JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES 31. 50
Ki RBY NMARKERS

3 EA DELUXE COVER; PAR- Al DE; 2203- 89;
PAR- Al BE BLUE

FERTL- SOt L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 31. 81
JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES 31. 50
KI RBY MARKERS

3 EA  AGITATOR ASSEMBLY; PAR- Al DE; 200- 30

FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 35. 98
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 25. 50
Ki RBY MARKERS

1T EA  AGI TATOR LOCK NUT; PAS- Al DE; 200-80-4

FERTL~ SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 6. 10
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 6. 00
KI RBY MARKERS

1T EA  AGITATOR RUBBER GROMVET: PAR- Al DE;

BI DS BY | TEM

ANMDUNT

190. 86
189. 00

94. 6O

200-11-4

4/ 29/ 14 PAGE

%

20

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWEID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

. 000
. 006
. 000

. 0G0
. 000
. 000

. 000
. Q00
. 000

. 000
. 600
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0376- 520- 14 BI DS BY | TEM 4/ 29} 14 PAGE 21

PRI CE AMDUNT %

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 2. 80 2. 80 1. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 2. 81 2.81 1. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO B! D 1. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC.
103 20 EA  CAP SCREW PAR- Al DE; 200- 21

11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 2.65 53. 00 20. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 2.62 52. 40 20. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D 20. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

104 94 EA  FOAM GASKET FOR DELUXE; PAR- Al DE; 203- 25

11750 FERTL- SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 1. 89 177. 66 , 94. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 1.87 175. 78 94. 000
51221 K! RBY MARKERS NO BID 94. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

105 9 EA  BRUSH ASSEMBLY: PAR- Al DE: 200- 20

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 35. 90 323. 10 8. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 35. 62 320. 58 9. 000
51221 Ki RBY MARKERS NO BI D 9. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

1086 5 EA  DRAIN PLUG W TH GASKET; PAR- Al DE; 203- 40- 4

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 13, 05 65. 25 5. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 12. 93 64. 65 5. 000
51221 KI RBY MARKERS NO BI D 5. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BI D JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

107 6 EA DRAIN PLUG GASKET; PAR- Al DE: 203- 50- 10

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 5. 69 34.14 6. 000



0376-520- 14

11750

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 5.62 33.72
Ki RBY MARKERS NO BID

2 EA BAL WASHER REPAIR KI'T; PAR- Al DE; 200- 10
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY i NC. 67.85 136,
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 67. 31 134.
K! RBY MARKERS NO

15 EA CONMPLETE KI RBY MARKER; Ki RBY
FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 64. 00 980
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NG
KI RBY MARKERS 55. 00 825

4 EA COMPLETE CUSTOM Ki RBY MARKER; K! RBY
FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY I NC. 69. 00 276
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NG
K| RBY MARKERS 65. 00 260

70 EA  REPLACENMENT KI RBY MARKER TOPS ONLY: Ki RBY;

#' 5 WLL BE DETAI LED UPON AWARDI NG OF BI D
FERTL-SOI L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 36.65
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO

Kl RBY MARKERS

17 EA REPLACEMENT CUSTOM Ki RBY MARKER TOPS ONLY;
KIRBY;, #°S WLL BE DETAI LED UPON AWARDI NG

OF THE BiD
FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY I NC. 38. 25 650.

2, 585.

2,520.

BI D

Bl D

50
BiD

25

4/ 28/ 14 PAGE

%

22

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

LOWRBI D Kl RBY MARKERS

LOWBID Kl RBY MARKERS

LOWBID K!RBY MARKERS

15.
15.
5.

70.
70.
70,

17.

. 000
. 000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000

000



0376-520- 14 BIDS BY I TEM 47 29/ 14 PAGE 23

PRI CE ANDUNT %

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID

51221 KI RBY MARKERS 38. 00 646. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID K! RBY MARKERS
113 10 EA  RING - VI TE; KIRBY; B122

11750  FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY iNC. 4, 90 49. 00

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D

51221 Ki RBY MARKERS 4.00 40. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID Kl RBY MARKERS
114 20 EA  SPRING; KIRBY, B140

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY 1 NC. 1.20 24. 00

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO B! D
Y MRS e TS O T —
115 10 EA  BASE; KiRBY: B121

11750 FERTL- SOl L TURF SUPPLY | NC. 8. 15 61. 50

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO Bi D

51221 KI RBY MARKERS 4. 00 40. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID KIRBY MARKERS
116 44 EA  COLLARS; KIRBY: WHI TE

11750  FERTL-SOIL TURF SUPPLY | NC. 18. 40 809. 60

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID

51221 KI RBY MARKERS 15. 00 660. 00
............................................................................................ LOWBID Kl RBY MARKERS
117 15 EA  COLLARS; KIRBY; GREEN

11750  FERTL-SOIL TURE SUPPLY I NC. 18. 40 276. 00

17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BID

17.000
17.000

10. 000
10. 000
10. GO0

20. 000
20. 000
20.000

10. 000
10. 000
10. 000

44, 000
44, 000
44. 000

16. 00C
18, 000



0378-520-14

BI DS BY | TEM 4/ 29/ 14 PAGE 24
PRI CE ANDUNT %
51221 KI RBY MARKERS 15.00 225.00

- 15. 000

LOWBID Ki RBY MARKERS



