BID # 0023-15

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

|

Number of Bids Received |

| Vendor Name and Address |

Aleph Industry; 106 Lexington Ave., Brooklyn, NY 11238

All American Poly; 40 Turner Pl., Piscataway, NJ 08854

All Clean Janitorial Supply Co., Inc.; 990 Spruce St.,
Lawrenceville, NJ 08648

Calico Industries, Inc.; 9045 Junction Dr.,

Annapolis Junction, MD 20701-1155

Central Poly Corp.; 2400 Bedle PI., Linden, NJ 07036
Chem-Tek Industries, Inc.; 31 Virgina Dr., Howell, NJ 07731
Dash Medical Gloves, Inc.; 9635 S. Franklin Dr.,

Franklin, WI 53132

Interboro  Packaging Corporation; 114 Bracken Rd.,
Montgomery, NY 12549

John Deere Landscapes; 1385 East 36" St.,

Cleveland, OH 44114

Madsen & Howell, Inc.; 500 Market St., PO Box 391,

Perth Amboy, NJ 08862

Pyramid School Products; 6510 North 54™ St.,

Tampa, FL 33610-1908

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.; 300 Smith St., Farmingdale, NY 11735
Scoles Floorshine Industries; PO Box 2303,

Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Singer Equipment Company, Inc.; 150 S. Twin Valley Rd.,
Elverson, PA 19520

Spruce Industries; 759 East Lincoln Ave., Rahway, NJ 07065
TSP Maintenance Supply, LLC; PO Box 184,

Livingston, NJ 07039

Unipak Corp.; PO Box 300027, Brooklyn, NY 11230
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1/13/15

ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
27.33 546. 60

33. 30 3330. 00|
16. 25 8125. 00|

PAGE 1

JOHN DEERE LANDSC

_

|
14. 65 2930. 00|

CENTRAL POLY CORP

13. 00

17. 30

26. 10

21.66

260. 00
1730. 00
13050. 00

4332. 00



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMVARY 1/13/15 PAGE 2

ALEPH | NDUSTRY CALICO INDUSTRIES ~ PYRAM D SCHOOL PR ALL AMERICAN POLY  JOHN DEERE LANDSC  CENTRAL POLY CORP
028 _ | 41.60 416. 00| _ |
029 _ | 41.60 416. 00| _ _
030 [ |  33.89 67. 78| _ _
031 _ _ _ | _
032 _ _ | | _
033 |  39.92 199.60|  40.99 204. 95| _ _
034 _ |  34.98 1049. 40| | 67.68 2030. 40|
035 [ [ 4. 29 720. 72| _ |
036 | 14.14 141. 40| 14. 27 142. 70| _ _
037 _ _ ~72 69. 12| | _
038 _ _ _ _ _
039 | _ | _ |
040 _ 3.14 113. 04| 3.99 143. 64| | |
041 | _ 6.79 81. 48| | _
042 _ _ _ | _
043 [ 3.94 236. 40| 3.69 221. 40| _ |
044 _ _ 1.08 155. 52| _ _
045 | | 23.99 719. 70| | _
046 _ _ | _ _
047 _ | 25. 99 129. 95| | |
048 _ |  21.98 879. 20| _ |
049 | | 1.04 18. 72| | |
050 | .98 98. 00| .48 48. 00| | _
TOTALS 7000. 00| 16130. 96| 21511. 23| 12001. 60| 4960. 40| 19372. 00
GROUP# 2
MADSEN & HOVELL, UNI PAK CORPORATI O  SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES| SCOLES FLOORSHI NE| | NTERBORO PACKAGI | ALL CLEAN JANI TOR

001 14. 00 280. 00 19. 21 384. 20 15. 34 306. 80 16. 70 334.00
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IVADSEN & HOWELL

GROUP #
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94.
995.

_

|
40|
00|
60|
80|
85|
12|
84|
80|
20|
80|
00|
00|
20|
80|
40|
00|
24|
00|
50|
30|
96|
50
30|
56|
00|
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UNI PAK CORPORATI O

19. 85 1985. 00|
14. 20 7100. 00|

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

_
_
_
49. 99 5998. 80|

_
*
_
_

_
14.37 143. 70|

53. 96 4316. 80|

1/13/ 15

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

27.73 2773. 00|
38.46  19230. 00|

_
_

_
35. 40 849. 60|

29.67 593. 40|

_
_
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37.00

3

| NTERBORO PACKAG
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MADSEN & HOVELL, UNI PAK CORPORATI O  SPRUCE | NDUSTRIES  SCOLES FLOORSHI NE | NTERBORO PACKAGI  ALL CLEAN JANI TOR
GROUP# 2
029  99.50 995. 00| [ | |  37.00 370. 00|
030 35.82 71. 64| [ _ [ | 31.25 62. 50
031 28.75  2875.00] | 19.14 1914.00|  16.94 1694. 00| | 17.68 1768. 00
032 24.12 192. 96| |  16.81 134. 48| _ |
033  58.83 294. 15| _ | 129.99 649. 95|
034 29.16 874. 80| |  56.05 1681.50|  55.14 1654. 20| |  36.95 1108. 50
035 6.66 1118. 88| _ 2.62 440. 16| [ |
036 17.79 177. 90| _ _ | _
037 .76 72.96| _ _ [ _ . 81 77.76
038 _ _ _ [ | 170.00  11050. 00
039 [ [ | | | 150.00 900. 00
040 4.54 163. 44| | _ | _
041  13.35 160. 20| | _ _ _
042 1.59 38. 16| | _ | _
043 6.98 418. 80| [ [ [ _
044 1.01 145. 44| | _ _ | . 85 122. 40
045 52.28  1568.40]| |  22.80 684.00|  47.23 1416. 90| |  24.50 735. 00
046  13.67 683. 50| _ * _ _
047 12.96 64. 80| |  26.61 133.05|  43.13 215. 65| | 26.12 130. 60
048 12.96 518. 40| |  18.61 744.40|  36.97 1478. 80| |
049 1.65 29. 70| [ [ _ _
050 .86 86. 00| [ [ [ _
TOTALS 34386. 30| 9365. 00| 16190. 89| 30939. 70| 12484. 80| 51699. 05
GROUP# 3

SAM TELL & SON CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI | DASH MEDI CAL GLOV| SINGER EQUI PNENT TSP MAI NTENANCE S

001
002

17. 17
24. 80

343. 40
2480. 00|
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GROUP #

003
004
005
006
007
008
009
010
011
012
013
014
015
016
017
018
019
020
021
022
023
024
025
026
027
028
029

SAM TELL & SON

3

9. 29 111. 48|

6.34 63. 40|
21.96  527.04]
11.93 59. 65|

15.19 151. 90|
16. 98 84. 90|
4. a1 88. 20|
9. 35 168. 30|

7.75 93. 00|

_
_
126. 96|
_
_

5. 29

BI DS BY

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI

6. 48 64. 80|
|

7.50 37. 50|

|

58. 76 1410. 24|
_

20. 60 741. 60|
_

_

_

|

5. 00 100. 00|

_

_

|

_

_

_

24. 30 388. 80|
36. 25 1812. 50|
37. 69 376. 90|

| TEM - SUMVARY

DASH MEDI CAL GLOV

41.70 3336. 00|

33. 89
18. 94

10.72

14.94

4.37
14.57
44. 44

61. 41

37.09

1/13/ 15

SI NGER EQUI PMENT

16945. 00|
227. 28]

_
68. 40|

_
53. 60|

49. 40|
74. 70|
87. 40|
262. 26|
3555. 20|
108. 48|
3070. 50|

370. 90|

PAGE 5

TSP MAI NTENANCE S

29.76  3571.20]
_
_
_
_
_
_
|
_
_
_
_
_
~
41.00  3280.00|
_
44.00  2200. 00|
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15

SAM TELL & SON

GROUP# 3
030

031

032

033  44.
034

035 3.
036 -
037

038

039

040 5.
041 5.
042 3.
043  10.
044

045 52,
046 14,
047

048

049

96

91

71
92
64
42

50

224. 80|

_
656. 88|

205. 56|
71. 04|
87. 36|

625. 20|

1575. 00|
704. 50|
_
_
_

_
5625. 17|

27.00
17.58
18. 00
40. 00

2.05

34. 00

19. 00

BI DS BY | TEM -
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI

54. 00|
1758. 00|
144. 00|
200. 00|

_
344. 40|

_

1020. 00|
_

_

760. 00|
_

|

9212. 74|

SUMVARY
DASH MEDI CAL GLOV

_
_
“

_
3336. 00|

1/13/ 15

SI NGER EQUI PNVENT

16.43 1643. 00|
32.18 257. 44|
45. 61 228. 05|
59. 82 1794. 60|
_

_

_

_

_

_

8. 00 96. 00|
_

_

_

_

_

46. 24 231. 20|
36. 60 1464. 00|
_

_

33410. 81|

PAGE 6

TSP NAI NTENANCE S

23.25 2325. 00|
_
_
_
_
_
_
144. 92 9419. 80|
90. 00 540. 00|

_
|

_
21336. 00|
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01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967

PRI CE

20 Cs
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 13. 12
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY 27. 33

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON 13.00
MADSEN & HOVELL, INC

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON 14. 00
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 19. 21
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. 15. 34
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 16. 70

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY 1.7, 17

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

100 Cs

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CAL! CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 16. 60
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY 33. 30
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON 17. 30

MADSEN & HOWELL, |NC

BI DS BY

TRASH BAGS 24 X 33, 6 M CRON, CLEAR

TRASH BAGS 33 X 40, 22 M CRON, CLEAR

| TEM

1/13/15 PAGE

ANDUNT %

NO
262.
NO
546.
NO
260.
NO
280.
NO
384.
306.
334.
NO
NO
NO
343.

NO
1, 660.
NO
3, 330.
NO
1, 730.
NO

Bl D
40
BI D
60
BI D
00
BI D
00
BI D
20
80
00
BI D
BI D
BI D

Bl D

BI D
00
BI D
00
BI D

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

LOW BI D CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
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01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944

55799

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

500 CS
EXTRA HEAVY, BLACK

ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

TRASH BAGS 38 X 58 X 60, 2.0

BI DS BY | TEM 1/13/15 PAGE
PRI CE ANDUNT %
19. 85 1,985. 00

NO BI D
27.73 2,773.00
14. 98 1,498. 00
23.50 2,350. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
24. 80 2,480. 00
NO BI D
M L GAUGE
14. 00 7, 000. 00
17.18 8,590.00 *
NO BI D
16. 25 8, 125.00
NO BI D
26.10 13, 050. 00
NO BI D
14. 20 7,100.00 *
NO BI D
38. 46 19, 230. 00
14. 84 7,420.00
23. 20 11, 600. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D

100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.

LOWBI D | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
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PRI CE ANDUNT
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC NO BI D
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY 33. 89 16, 945. 00
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D

12 EA FLOOR BRUSH - 24"

ALEPH | NDUSTRY NO BI D
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 7.74 92. 88
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 8. 85 106. 20
ALL AMNERI CAN POLY NO BI D
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 17.45 209. 40
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON NO BI D
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO BI D
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE NO BI D
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BID
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 10. 25 123. 00
SAM TELL & SON 9.29 111.48
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BI D
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, [ NC NO BI D
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY 18. 94 227. 28
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D

BIDS BY | TEM

120 Cs TOILET TISSUE, SIZE: 1500 SHEETS PER ROLL
ALEPH | NDUSTRY NO
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO

BID
BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

3

500.
500.
500.

LOWBID ALEPH | NDUSTRY

12,
12.
12.
12.
12.
1.2.
12.
12.
12.
12
12,
12.
12.
12.
12;
1.2.
(1528

LOWBID CALICO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

120.
120.

000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
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PRI CE

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOVELL, | NC 65. 00
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 49. 99
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 39.50
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC 29.76

10 EA  WASTEBASKETS ( PLASTI C)
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 3.48
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 2.99
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 4. 86
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

7, 800. 00
NO BI D
5,998. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
4,740.00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID.
NO BI D
3,571. 20
NO BI D
34. 80
29. 90
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
48. 60
NO BI D
NO BI D

4

120. 000

120.
120.

000
000

120. 000

120.

000

120. 000

120. 000

120.

000

120. 000

120.
120.
120;
120.
120.

120.
LOWBI D TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
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007
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799
56161
56273

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

24 EA  TRASH CANS
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

5. 85
6. 34
6.48

26. 98

18. 20

21.96

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
58. 50
63. 40
64. 80
NO BI D
68. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

647.52 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

436. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D

527.04 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

5

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24,
24,
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
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009
01045
02587
09616
09640

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 EA MOP HANDLES
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, |NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SINGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

144 EA SPONGES
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY

BI DS BY

PRI CE

3.78
8. 29

12.25
11.93
7.50

1.28
e 72

| TEM 1/13/15 PAGE

ANDUNT %

NO BI D
18. 90
41.45 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
27. 85
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
61. 25
59. 65
37.50
NO BI D

NO BI D
184. 32
247. 68

NO BI D

LOW BI D MADSEN & HOWELL, INC

LOW BI D CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES,

I NC.

24.

144,
144,
144.
144.

TS BN B B N C N < N S LI < I B B S NG LS IS IS

000

000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
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010
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585

PRI CE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC «73
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAG!I NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

24 EA  CLOTHES SOAP
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO I NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 9.19
ALL ANERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC . 9.91
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 35. 40
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
105.12
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
220. 56
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
237. 84
NO BI D
NO BI D
849. 60
NO BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

7

LOWBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

144,
144,

144

144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,

24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.

000
000

. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 59. 55
54944 SAM TELL & SON

55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 58. 76
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

56833 TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
011 20 Cs LI QUID DI SH SOAP

01045 ALEPH | NDUSTRY

02587 CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 60. 99
09640 ALL AMERI CAN POLY

17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

50967 MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 26. 64
51918 UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 29. 67

53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
54944 SAM TELL & SON

55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

56833 TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

ANDUNT %
1,429. 20
NO BI D
1,410. 24 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
1.219. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
532. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
593. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

8

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.

20.
20.
20.

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000

. 000
20.
20.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

013
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967

PRI CE

36 EA CAR WASH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 4.79
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 4.70
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 4. 80
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 20. 60
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |INC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

20 BAGS OI L DRY ( GRANULE ABSORBENT)
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWVELL, | NC 8.99

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT %
NO BID
NO BI D
172. 44 *
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
169. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
172. 80
NO BI D
741.60 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
179. 80

1/13/15

PAGE

9

LOWBI D NADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,
SI NGER EQUI PNMENT CONMP

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

I NC.
I NC
ANY

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

200 BAGS | CE MELTING PELLETS (CALCI UM CHLORI DE)

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC
UNI PAK CORPORAT! ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I ON

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,

I NC.

NO
NO
NO
NO

14. 65 2, 930.
21.66 4,332.
16. 52 3, 304.

NO
NO
NO
NO

18. 50 3, 700.

NO
NO

BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
00

00

00

BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
00

BI D
BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

10

LOWBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.
200.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

016
01045
02587

PRI CE

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
10 CS SCRUB PADS 6" X 9"

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 12. 34

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 1:2.. 311

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 42. 60

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 14. 37

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON 15. 19

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY 4.94

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 EA PAILS, 15 QUART
ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 15. 94

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
123. 40
123.10
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
426. 00
NO BI D
143. 70
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
151. 90
NO BI D
NO BID
49. 40
NO BID
NO BI D
79.70

1/13/15

PAGE

11

200.
200.
200.

LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10,
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

LOW BI D SINGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000



0083-010- 15

017
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935

PRI CE
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 17. 24
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 18. 00
SAM TELL & SON 16. 98
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, 1 NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY 14.94

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

20 EA METAL- TI P, THREADED END BROOM HANDLE
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 3.16
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 6. 24
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
86. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
90. 00
84. 90
NO BI D
NO BI D
74.70
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
63. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
124. 80
NO BI D
NO BID

%

1/13/15

PAGE

12

LOW BI D SINGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

SIS TS < TS N < B B S NS B B < B LB < L S

000

. 000

000
000
000

. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

018
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799
56161
56273

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PNMENT CONMPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

18 EA BRUTE PLASTI C BUCKETS
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE )
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

BI DS BY

PRI CE

2.75
4. 41
5. 00

7.38

7.04

13. 30

13.45
9. 35

14.57

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
55. 00
88. 20
100. 00
NO BI D
87. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
132. 84
126. 72
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
239. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
242.10
168. 30
NO BI D
NO BI D
262. 26

1/13/ 15 PAGE 13

%

20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

20

18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
. 000

LOWBID ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083- 010- 15

020
01045
02587
09616
09640

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

80 CS MEDI CAL GLOVES

ALEPH 1| NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI m,m~ I NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, 1INC

SI NGER EQUI PNMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
12 EA FLI P UP DUST PAN

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

PRI CE

50.
41.

46.

53.

31.

94
60

60

96

50

a5

. 34
.99

BI DS BY | TEM

1/13/15 PAGE

ANDUNT %

NO
4,075.
3, 328.

NO

NO

NO
3,728.

NO
4,316.

NO
2,520.
3, 580.

NO
88.
83.
NO

BI D
20 *
00

BI D
BI D
BI D
00

BI D
80

BI D
00 *
00

BI D
BI D

BI D
08
88
BI D

14

LOW BI D

LOW BI D

18.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

80.

80.

80.

80.

80.

80.
80.
80.

80.

80.

80.

80.

80.

80.

80.
80.

80
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

12,

12.

127

12.

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

021
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585

PRI CE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 11.02
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON 7.75
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY 9.04
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

50 CS SHOP TOWELS
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, 1 NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 92.98
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 44.10
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
132. 24
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
93. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
108. 48
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
4,649. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
2, 205. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

15

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

12,
12
12.
12.
12;
12¢
k2"
1122
12,
12-
12,
112
12.

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 1/13/15 PAGE 16

PRI CE AMDUNT %
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 69. 69 3, 484. 50 50. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 50. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BID 50. 000
56161 DASH NEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC NO BI D 50. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PNENT COMPANY 61. 41 3, 070. 50 50. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC 44.00 2, 200. 00 50. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
022 10 EA  ROLL TOVEL DI SPENSER
01045 ALEPH | NDUSTRY NO BI D 10. 000
02587 CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BI D 10. 000
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 37.95 379. 50 10. 000
09640  ALL ANERI CAN POLY NO BI D 10. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 10. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D 10. 000
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 37.45 374. 50 10. 000
51918 UNI PAK CORPORATI ON NO BI D 10. 000
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO BI D 10. 000
53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE NO BI D 10. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 10. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 38.10 381. 00 10. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 10. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BI D 10. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC NO BI D 10. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY NO BI D 10. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 10. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL, |INC



0083-010- 15

10 EA TOI LET PAPER DI SPENSER

ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES
PYRAM D SCHOOL PR
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSC
CENTRAL POLY CORP
MADSEN & HOWELL,

, I'NC.
ODUCTS

APES
ORATI ON
I NC

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI

NG CORP.

ES, INC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

16 EA HAND CLEANER, HEAVY DUTY

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES
PYRAM D SCHOOL PR
ALL AMERI CAN POLY

CONMPANY

. I'NC.
ODUCTS

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOVELL,

I NC

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

22.98

22.43

25,65

16. 99

11.56

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D

229. 80
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D

224. 30
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

255. 50
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D

271. 84
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
184. 96

%

1/13/ 15

PAGE

17

LOWBI D NADSEN & HOVELL,

I NC

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

16.
16.
16.
16.
16.
16.
16.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

025
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,
SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMP
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPL

50 CS FOAM SKI N CLEANSER

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

I NC
I NC
ANY

Y,

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, 1 NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| ON

LLC

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,

I NC.

BI DS BY

PRI CE

16. 95

24. 30

68. 98

31.45

45.78

36. 25

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
271. 20
NO BI D
388. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
3,449.00
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
1, 57250
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
2,289.00
NO BID
1,812, 50

%

1/13/ 15

PAGE

18

LOWBID NMADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

16.
16.
16.
16:
16.
16.
16.
16.
16.
16:

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

027
01045
02587

PRI CE

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
10 Cs LI QUI D HAND SOAP ( GL)

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 52. 96

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, I NC 39.73

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 40. 70

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

37.69

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
24 EA CORN BROOM

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC

BI DS BY

I TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
529. 60
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
397. 30
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
407. 00
NO BI D
376. 90
NO BID
370. 90
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

19

50.
50.
50.

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL, |NC

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

LOW BI D SINGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

24.
24.

000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000



0083-010- 15

028
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
519356

PRI CE
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 4.49
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 3.94
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 501
SAM TELL & SON 5..29

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

10 CS DI SPOSABLE GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY, LARGE
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 41. 60
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 99. 60
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
107.76
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
94. 56
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
120. 24
126. 96
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
416. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
995. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/ 15

PAGE

20

LOWBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24,
24.
24,
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 1/13/ 15 PAGE 21

PRI CE ANDUNT %

53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE NO BI D 10. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. 37.00 370.00 * 10. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 10. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 10. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BI D 10. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC NO BI D 10. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PVENT CONPANY NO BI D 10. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 10. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
029 10 CS DI SPOSABLE GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY, X- LARGE

01045 ALEPH | NDUSTRY NO BI D 10. 000
02587 CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, I NC. NO BI D 10. 000
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 41.60 416. 00 10. 000
09640  ALL AMERI CAN POLY NO BI D 10. 000
17884  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 10. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BID 10. 000
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 99. 50 995. 00 10. 000
51918 UNI PAK CORPORATI ON NO BI D 10. 000
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO BI D 10. 000
53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE NO BID 10. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. . 37. 00 370.00 * 10. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 10. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 10. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, 1 NC. NO BI D 10. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC NO BID 10. 000

56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY NO BI D 10. 000



0083-010- 15

PRI CE

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BI DS BY | TEM

1/13/ 15 PAGE 22

%

1.0.

............................................................................................ LOW BI D | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

2 CS CLOROX CLEAN- UP W BLEACH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 33.89
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWVELL, |INC 35. 82
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 31.25
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, 1 NC. 27.00
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

............................................................................................ LOW BI D CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,

031
01045
02587
09616
09640

100 Cs MULTI FOLD TOVEL
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
67.78
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
71.64
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
62. 50
NO BI D
54. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D

1 NC.

100.
100.
100.
100.

000

. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000

000

. 000

000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000



0083-010-15

032
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585

PRI CE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, |INC 28.75

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 19.14

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 16. 94

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 17.68

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 17.58

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY 16. 43

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC 23. 25
8 CS TOI LET BOW. CLEANER

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CAL|I CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, |INC 24.12

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 16. 81

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
2,875.00
NO BI D
1,914.00
1,694. 00
NO BI D
1, 768. 00
NO BI D
1,758.00
NO BI D
1, 643. 00
2, 325. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
192. 96
NO BI D
134. 48
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

23

100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.

LOWBI D SINGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

® ©® 0 ® O ®®® P @

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 1713/ 15 PAGE 24

PRI CE ANDUNT %
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 8. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 8. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 18. 00 144. 00 8. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC NO BI D 8. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PNENT COMPANY 32.18 257. 44 8. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 8. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BID SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
033 5 EA  MDP/BUCKET WRI NGER COMBO
01045 ALEPH | NDUSTRY NO BI D 5. 000
02587 CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 39.92 199. 60 5. 000
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 40. 99 204. 95 5. 000
09640 ALL AVERI CAN POLY NO BI D 5. 000
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 5. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D 5. 000
50967 MADSEN & HOWELL, |NC 58. 83 294. 15 5. 000
51918 UNI PAK CORPORATI ON NO BI D 5. 000
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO BI D 5. 000
53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 129. 99 649. 95 5. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 5. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 5. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON 44. 96 224. 80 5. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRIES, | NC. 40. 00 200. 00 5. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC NO BI D 5. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PNENT CONMPANY 45. 61 228. 05 5. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 5. 000

............................................................................................ LOW BID CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, I NC.



0083-010- 15

01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967

30 CS WASP AND HORNET KI LLER
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

168 EA STRI NG MOP HEAD
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, I NC

BI DS BY

PRI CE
34. 98
67.68
29.16
56. 05
55. 14
36. 95
59. 82
4.29
6. 66

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
1,049. 40
NO BI D
2,030. 40
NO BID
874. 80
NO BI D
1,681.50
1,654. 20
NO BID
1,108. 50
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
1,794.60
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
720.72
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
1,118.88

25

LOWBID NMADSEN & HOVELL,

I NC

30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,
SI NGER EQUI PNVENT CONP

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

I NC.
I NC
ANY

BI DS BY

PRI CE

3. 91
2.05

1/13/ 15 PAGE 26

%

168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.
168.

............................................................................................ LOWBID CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

036
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799

10 CS WAX LI NERS
ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG C

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES,

I ON

ORP.

I NC.

14.14
14. 27

17.79

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
440. 16
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
656. 88
344. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
141. 40
142. 70
NO m_D
NO BI D
NO BID
177. 90
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

10.
10.
10,

10

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000

. 000
10.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

01045
02587

PRI CE

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

96 EA SOAP BARS
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS . 12
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC .76
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO . 81
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PNMENT CONPANY

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

65 CS HYDROGEN PEROXI DE/ ORANGE Ol L CLEANER

CONCENTRATE, SANI TI ZER/ VI RUCI DE
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
69.12
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
72.96
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
77.76
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/156

PAGE

27

LOW BI D

LOW BI D

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

10.
10.
10.

96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.
96.

65.
65.

000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000



0083-010- 15

01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935

PRI CE

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 170. 00
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

6 EA
PUSH BUTTON GALLON DI SPENSER

ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, |INC

UNI PAK CORPORAT! ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

BI DS BY | TEM

ANMDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
11, 050. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
9,419. 80

HYDROGEN PEROXI DE/ CONCENTRATE, AUTONATI C

NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO
NO

BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D
BI D

%

1/13/ 15

PAGE

28

65.
65.
65.
65.
65.
65
65.
65.
65.
65.
65.
65.
65.
65.

65.
LOWBID TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000

000

. 000
. 000

000

. 000

000

. 000
. 000



0083-010-15 BI DS BY

040
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799
56161
56273

PRI CE

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 150. 00
SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |INC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT COMPANY

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC 90. 00

36 EA DECK BRUSH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 3.14
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 3.99
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, I NC 4.54
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON 5.71
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BID
900. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
540. 00
NO BI D
113. 04
143. 64
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
163. 44
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
205. 56
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D

%

1/ 13/ 15

PAGE

29

LOWBI D TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, L

36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36
36.
36.
36.

ro o o o O O O O

. 000
000
. 000
. 000
000
000
000

. 000
Cc

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083- 010- 15

042
01045
02587
09616
09640

PRI CE

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

12 EA STREET BRUSH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 6.79
ALL ANERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 13. 35
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON 5.92
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY 8. 00
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

24 EA  SCRUB BRUSH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANERI CAN POLY

BI DS BY

I TEM

ANMDUNT
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
81.48
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
160. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
71.04
NO BI D
NO BI D
96. 00
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID

%

1/13/15

PAGE

30

LOW BI D CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES,

LOWBID SAM TELL & SON

I NC.

36.

12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12.
12,
12.
12,
12.
12.
12,
12

24.
24.
24.
24.

000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

043
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
535685

PRI CE

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, I NC 1.59
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON 3. 64
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

60 EA ANGLE BROOM
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 3.94
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 3.69
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, I NC 6.98
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

BIDS BY | TEM

ANMDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
38.16
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI'D
NO BI D
87. 36
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

236. 40

221.40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

418. 80
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1/13/15

PAGE

31

LOWBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

24.
24
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24.
24,
24.
24.

60.
60.
60.
60.
60.
60
60.
60.
60.
60.
60.

000

. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000

. 000

000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM

1713/ 15 PAGE 32

%

60.
60.
60.
60.
60.
60.

........................................................................................... LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

PRI CE
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
54944 SAM TELL & SON 10. 42
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
044 144 EA POWDER/ ABRAS| VE CLEANER
01045 ALEPH | NDUSTRY
02587 CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 1.08
09640 ALL AMERI CAN POLY
17884 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
50967 MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 1.101
51918 UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE
53585 I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO .85

54944 SAM TELL & SON

55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY
56833 TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

ANDUNT

NO BI D
625. 20

NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
165. 62

NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
145. 44

NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
122. 40

NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D

144,
144,
144,
144,
144.
144.
144,
144.
144.
144,
144,
144,
144.
144,
144.
144,

144.
LOWBID ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15

046
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967

BI DS BY
PRI CE
30 CS DI SI NFECTANT AEROSOL SPRAY

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 23. 99

ALL ANERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOVELL, | NC 52. 28

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 22. 80

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 47.23

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 24. 50

SAM TELL & SON  52.50

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. 34. 00

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, 1NC
SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

50 EA REPLACEMENT STEEL SPONGE NOP HEAD
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 13: 67

| TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
719.70
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
1,568. 40
NO BI D
684. 00
1,416. 90
NO BID
735. 00
1,575. 00
1, 020. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
683. 50

%

1/13/ 156

PAGE
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LOW BI D SPRUCE

| NDUSTRI ES

30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010-15

047
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935
53286
53585
53961
54944
55799

PRI CE

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON 14. 09
CHEM TEK 1 NDUSTRI ES, | NC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 CS FURNI TURE POLI SH
ALEPH | NDUSTRY
CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 25. 99
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 12. 96
UNI PAK CORPORATI ON
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 26. 61
SCOLES FLOORSHI NE 43.13
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 26.12
SAM TELL & SON
CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, I NC

BI DS BY

I TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
704. 50
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
129.:95
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
64. 80
NO BID
133..05
215. 65
NO BID
130. 60
NO BI D
NO BID

%

1/13/15

PAGE
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LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL,

I NC

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

SIS B N < T NS B < BN B S B S B < B < B

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000



0083- 010- 15

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
40 Cs GLASS CLEANER

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONPANY

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
18 EA  TOILET BOW. BRUSH

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC

BI DS BY
PRI CE
46. 24
21.98
12.96
18. 61
36. 97
19. 00
36. 60

I TEM
ANDUNT
NO BI D
231. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
879. 20
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
518. 40
NO BI D
744. 40
1,478. 80
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
760. 00
NO BID
1,464. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D

%

1713/ 15

PAGE
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LOWBID NMADSEN & HOWELL,

LOWBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

I NC

40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.
40.

18.
18.

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000



0083-010- 15

050
01045
02587
09616
09640
17884
43057
50967
51918
51935

PRI CE

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 1. 04

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 1.65

UNI PAK CORPORATI! ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

SCOLES FLOORSHI NE

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC.

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY

TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
100 EA URI NAL BRUSH

ALEPH | NDUSTRY

CALI CO | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. .98

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS .48

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC . 86

UNI PAK CORPORATI ON

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

BI DS BY

| TEM
ANDUNT
18.72
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
29.70
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
98. 00
48. 00
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
86. 00
NO BI D
NO BID

%

1/13/15

PAGE
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LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.

100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000



0083-010- 15 BI DS BY | TEM 1713/ 15 PAGE 37

PRI CE ANDUNT %
53286 SCOLES FLOORSHI NE NO BI D 100. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 100. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 100. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 100. 000
55799 CHEM TEK | NDUSTRI ES, | NC. NO BI D 100. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC . NO BI D 100. 000
56273 SI NGER EQUI PMENT CONMPANY NO BI D 100. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 100. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS



