BID # 0021-14

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF GROUNDS AND TURF EQUIPMENT

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners

Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Read
Lincrofi, NJ 07738
Phone: (732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QPA

{

Number of Bids Received |

| Vendor Name and Address |

Central Jersey Equipment, LLC; 670 Route 40,

Ehlmer, NJ 08318

Cherry Valley Tractor Sales; 35 West Route 70,

Marlton, NJ 08053

Harter Equipment, Inc.; 615 State Route 33,

Millstone Twp., NJ 08535

KLBL, Inc. dba Vic Gerard Golf Cars; 281 Squankum Rd.,
Farmingdale, NJ 07727

Storr Tractor Company; 3191 US Highway 22,
Branchburg, NJ 08876

W.H. Potter & Son, Inc.; 470 Red Hill Rd.,

Middletown, NJ 07748

Wilfred MacDonald, Inc.; 19 Central Blvd.,

South Hackensack, NJ 07606

Xtreme Machines; 700 Hwy 33, Millstone Twp., NJ 08535

(SEE TALLY SHEETS FOR BIDS AS OPENED AND PUBLICLY READ)




1731- 21301- 13 BI DS BY | TEM - SUMMARY 2/ 06/ 14 PAGE 1
CENTRAL JERSEY EQ

501, SENTRAL JERSEY EQ KLBL I NC. | HARTER EQUI PMENT “ MACDONALD, W LFRE| POTTER & SON, WH| STORR TRACTOR COM
. . “ 35996. 00  35996. 00

00221000. 00  21000. 00} | | i [36421.00  36421.00

00317000. 00 17000. 00} | m | 133712.00  33712.00

004 | | m | | 4075.00  |4075.00

005 | | [ | { 5950.00  |5950. 00

006 _ | I | 3560.00  3560.00]

007 | W | | 4728.00  4728.00|

008 | 9023.00  9023. 00} w | |

009 | 10895. 00  10995. 00/ W m |

010 | 8914.00  §914.00] _ . h |

011 _ _ _ f _

012 8950.00 8950.00{10564. 00  10564. 00| | ! |

013 P9429, 00 89429. DO I i |

014 { 9734.00  9734.00] ! | !

015 | 9717.00  9717.00] : _ M

016 ! | | | _

017 |16477.00  16477. 00} M | |

01814250, 00 28500. Q0| {14700.00  29400. 00] | |

019 i w M ; |22724.35  32724.35

020 ~ M ] I 129426.35  29426. 35

021 | { |25417.00 25417, 00! j

022 | | | m 127018.81  27018. 81

023 | “ _ ! 138579.94  38579.94

024 | _ [10971.00  10971. 00} j

025 | _ | | 3715.85  3715.85] 3185.77  3185.77

026 I m m _ 111610.51 11610, 51

027 _ [ | | |40959.75  40959. 75




1731- 21301- 13
CENTRAL JERSEY EQ
028 |
029 !
030 i
031 |
03214000. 00 42000. 00|
033 |
034 _
035 |
036 |
037 ]
038 |
039 [
040 _
041 _
042 !
043 |
044 1100.00  1100. 0Of
045 |
046 |
047 |
048 |
049 !

TOTALS 138550. 00}

GROUP# 2
CHERRY VALLEY TRA
00130307.36 30307.386

00230860.36 30860. 36|

BI DS BY { TEM - SUVMMVARY

KLBL | NC.

!

84853. 00|

XTRENE MACHI NES

HARTER EQUI PNENT

!
!

i
3650.00  3650. 00|

1
H

_
|

!

2/ 06/ 14
MACDONALD, W LFRE

“
52487.00  52497. 00|

_
14994.00 14994, 00|

1118, 00 1119. 001

|
31239.00  31239. 00|

PAGE 2

POTTER & SON, WH STORR TRAQ

| 20781.
180488.
[60673.
1 60673.
| 20813,
| 35134.
| 56858.
1 52883.
|
| 33820.
| 56528,
|30194.
137658,
111997.
123020.
| 32248,
2774. 00 2774. 00| 4237.
_
{1085,
| 7728,
i

| 25542,
14777. 85|

12
98
56
56
68
10
68
68

o
64

17

W N W W W W

2
8
6
60673. 56
G
3
5
5

TOR COM
0761. 12
0488. 29
0673, 56

2441, 04
5134. 10
£6858. 68
2883. 68

B820. 00
B528. 70
0194, 21
7658, 98
5991. GO .
3020. 06
2248, 00
4237.00

1085. 00

F728. 64




1731-21301- 13

CHERRY VALLEY TRA

GROUP# 2
00329173.04 29173. 04|

004
005
006
007
008
009
010
G111
G112
c13
014
015
016
017

I

i
3615.70  3615. 70|

4250.70  4250. 70|
|

01813823.48 27646. 96!

019
£20
021
G22
023
024
025
028
Q27
028
029

!

BIDS BY I TEM -
XTREME MACH] NES

11800.00  11800. 00|

10100. 00 10100, 00|

|
17600.00  35000. 00}

SUMVIARY

2/06/ 14

PAGE




1731-21301-13 BI DS BY I TEM - SUMWARY 2/ 06714 PAGE 4
CHERRY VALLEY TRA XTREME MACHI NES

GROUP# 2
030 ] ; ﬁ | i

031 m ] M ! m
032 “ | | ] m
033 | | j w _
034 | _ _ _ |
035 | _ _ | _
036 m _ | “ _
037 W _ _ | . W
038 | _ ; m w
039 | ! | m |
040 ] | ﬁ } !
041 ] I | f |
042 | | | ! _
043 | | _ w |
044 3705, 23  3705. 23] [ m u !
045 | | | _ |
048 _ ~ _ _ |
047 ! | _ _ |
048 m | | _ |
049 I m | _ I
TOTALS 129559, 35] 56900. 00} m | |




1731-21301- 13 BI DS BY { TEM

05854
13880
15580
20780

PRI CE ANDUNT %

T EA TRACTOR | - TURF (DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EOQU PMENT 21000. 00 21, 000. co
KLBL 1 NC. NO BID
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED i NC. NO Bi D
POTTER & SON, W H. NO Bt D
STORR TRACTOR COWMPANY 353%96. 00 35,996.00 *
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 30307. 38 30, 307. 36
XTREME MACHI NES NO B! D

1 EA TRACTOR I - TURF {DIESEL) W TH ADDI Ti ONAL

ADDI Tt ONAL PRI CE *OPTI ONS

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 21000. 00 21, 000. 0C
KLBL 1 NC. NO Bl D
MARTER EQUI PWENT CO., 1NC. NO BI B
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BID
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 38421.00 36, 421.00 *
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 308B60. 36 30, 860. 358
XTRENE MACHI NES NC BID

1 EA TRACTOR 11 - TURF (DI ESEL) W TH OPTi ONAL

TRADE-t N

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 170G0. 00 17, 000. GO
KLBL ! NC. NG BID
HARTER EQUI PMENT CC., INC, NC Bi D
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NG BID

28310

POTTER & SCN, WH. NG

Bi D

2/ 06/ 14

PAGE

1

LOWBID CENTRAL JERS

LOWBID CENTRAL JERS

EY EQU! PMVENT

EY EQUI PVENT




1731-21301-13

Bi DS
PRI CE
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 33712. 00
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 29173. 04

XTREME MACHI NES

1 EA  TRAILER | - SINGLE AXLE LANDSCAPE
CENTRAL JERSEY ECUI PMENT
KLBL | NC.
HARTER EQU PMENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 4075. 00
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENME MACHI NES

1 EA TRAILER ! - DUAL AXLE LANDSCAPE
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
KL.BL 1 NC
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY 5850. 00
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME WMACHI NES

1 EA L0OG SPLI TTER

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

BY | TEM

ANOUNT
33, 712.00
28,173.04

NO BI D

NO BID

NO BID

NO BI D

NC BID

NO BI D
4,075. G0

NOC BiI D

NG BID

NC Bl D

NO Bl D

NO Bl D

NO BI B

NO BID
5, 850. 00

NO BID

NO BID

NC B! D

%

2/ 06/ 14

PAGE

2

LOWBID CENTRAL JERS

LOWBID STORR TRACTO

LOWRID STORR TRACTO

FY EQUI PVENT

R COMPANY

R COMPANY




1731-21301- 13

Bi DS BY ! TEM 2/ 08/ 14 PAGE 3
PRI CE ANDUNT %

KLBL i NC. NO BiD
HARTER EQUE PNENT CO., tNC. NO BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO Bl D
POTTER & SON, WH. 35660. 00 3, 5860. 0C

STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 3615.70 3,615.70

XTREME MACHE NES NO BID

1 EA LOG SPLITTER 11 - WTH LOG LIFTER *OPTI ONAL
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO
KLBL | NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., [NC. NO
MACDONALD, W IFRED 1 NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. 4728. 00 4, 728.
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY NO
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 4250. 70 4, 250.
XTREME MACHI NES NO

1 EA UTELITY VEHICLE | - ( GAS)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO
KLBL 1 NC. 8023. 00 8,023,
HARTER EQU PMENT CO., {NC. NO
VACDONALD, W ELFRED 1 NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NO

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NG

LOWBI D POTTER & SON

Bi D
BI D
8D
Bl D
00

LOWBID CHERRY VALLE

BI D
oG *
Bl D
BI D
BID
BI D
BI D

-

TRACTOR SALES



1731- 21301-13

05854
13880
16590

PRI CE

XTREME NACHI NES

1 EA UTHLITY VEHICLE 11 - { GAS)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
KLBL 1 NC. 10985. 00
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., 1 NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENE MACH] NES

1 EA UTILITY VEHICLE 111 - {GAS)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNMENT
KLBL 1 NC. 8%14. 00
HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., 1NC.
MACDONALLD, W LFRED ! NC,
POTTER & SON, WH,
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENE MACH! NES

1T EA UTILITY VEHICLE 1V - { GAS)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQU PMENT
KLBL I NC.
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC.

BIDS BY I TEM

ANDUNT
NO B! D
NO BiD
10, 985. Q0 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO B D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID
NO BiD
8,914.00 *
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BID

NO

B D

%

2/08/ 14

PAGE

4

LOWBID KLBL

LOWBID KLBL

LOWBID KLBL

I NC.

I NC.

1 NC.




1731-21301- 13

PRI CE ANDUNT
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BID
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO Bl B
XTREME MACHI NES 11800. 00 11, B0OO. 00

1 EA UTELITY VEHI CLE V - { GAS}
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT 8950. 00 8,95C. 00
KLBL  NC. 10564. 00 10, 564. 00
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC. NG BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO BID
POTTER & SON, WH. NO B!'D
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NO BID
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTRENVE MACH! NES NO BI D
1 EA UTELITY VEHI CLE VI - ( GAS)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PWENT NO BID
KEBE § NC. 9429. 00 9, 429. 00
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC. NC BiD
MACDONALD, W EFRED 1 NC. NO BiD
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BID
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTRENME MACHI NES NO BI D

Bl DS BY I TEM

%

2/06/14

PAGE

5

LOWBID XVREME MACHINES

LOWBID CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNVENT

LOWBID KLBL | NC.




1731-21301-13

1 EA UTT LI TY VEHI CLE VI |
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT
KLBL | NC.
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1 NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACH! NES

1 EA UTHLITY VEHICLE VIl
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMVENT
KLBL I NC.
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES

1 EA UTTLITY VEHICLE | X -
CENTRAL JERSEY EQU PMENT
KLBL 1 NC.
HARTER EOQUI PNENT CO., | NC.
MACDONALD, W ELFRED t NC.
POTTER & SON, WH,
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT %

- (ELECTRi C)
NO BiD
9734. 00 8,734.00 *
NO BID

NO Bi D

~ (ELECTRI C)
NO BID

$717.00 8, 717.00 *

{ ELECTR! C)
NG BI D
NO BID
NC BID
NO BI D
NO Bi D
NO Bi D

2/ 08/ 14

PAGE

6

LOWBID KLBL

LOWBID KLBL

I NC,

I NC.




1731- 21301- 13

019
05854
13880

PRI CE

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES 10180. 00

T EA UTELETY VEHICLE X - (FLECTRIC)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
KLBL [ NC. 16477.00
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., [NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENE MACHI NES

2 EA UTT 1 TY VEHICLE X1 - (DIESEL}), 4w
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT 14250, 00
KLBL I NC.

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC. 14700. 00

MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 13823. 48
XTRENME MACH! NES 17500. 00
1 EA  UTILITY VEHICLE Xi! - {DIESEL)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT
KLBL i NC,

BI DS BY | TEM

2/ 086/ 14 PAGE
ANDUNT %
NO BID
10, 160. 0C
NO BID
16, 477.00 *
NG Bt D
NOC BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO Bl D
NO BI D
28, 500. 00
NC Bi D
28, 400. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI B
27.646.96 *
35, 000, 00 *
NG BI1D

NO

Bi D

LOWBID XTREME NACH

LOWBID KLBL 1NC.

LOWBID CHERRY VALLE

NES

¥ TRACTOR SALES




1731-21301-13 BI BS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT

HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., INC. NO 81D
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO B! D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 22724. 35 22,724, 35

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO Bi D
XTREME MACHI NES NO BI D

T EA  UTILITY VEHICLE X1} - {DIESEL) W TH
MOUNTED SPREADER

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D
KLBL 1 NC. NO B D
HARTER EQUE PMENT CO., I NC. NO BI D
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO Bl D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 29426. 35 29, 426. 35

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NG BI D
XTREME MACHI NES NO BI D

05854
13880
15590
20760
28310
33540
49940

1T EA UTILETY VEHICLE XIV - (DI ESEL) 4 WHEEL
TURF TRUCKSTER

CENTRAL JERSEY EOQUI PMENT NO
KLBL | NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC. NG
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. 25417. 00 25,417,
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NO

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO

Bl D
BID
Bl D
0o

BID
Bl D
BI D

2/ 06/ 14

PAGE

g

LOWBID STORR TRACTO

LOWBID STORR TRACTO

R COMPANY

R COMPANY




2/ 06/ 14

Y%

PAGE

1731 21301-13 BIDS BY | TEM
PRI CE ANDUNT
54756 XTREME WMACHI NES NG Bi D
022 1 EA UTILITY VEHI CLE XV - (Di ESEL}
05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D
13880 KLBL 1 NC. NO BI D
15590 HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., | NC. NO BI D
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BID
28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NG Bt D
33540 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 27018. 81 27,018. 81
49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO BI D
023 1T EA  UTILITY VEHICLE Xvi - (DIESEL) W TH SVEEPER
0bg54 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO BID
13880 KLBL | NC. NO Bi D
15580 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1!NC. NOC BID
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED 1§ NC. NO BI D
28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NO Bl B
33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 38579. 94 38,578, 84
49840 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
54758 XTREME NMACHE NES NC BID
024 1 EA MDVER | - GREENSMOVER, WALK, (GAS)
05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO BI D
13880 KLBL | NC. NO 21D
18580 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO BI D

g

LOW BRI D MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.

LOWBI D STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWBI D STORR TRACTOR COMPANY




1731- 21301- 13

........................................................................................... LOWBID MACDONALD, W

PRI CE ANDUNT
MACDONALD, WLFRED i NC. 10971, 00 10, 971.00
POTTER & SON, WH. NO Bi D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY NO BID
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BID
XTREME MACHI NES NO Bl D

1 EA MOVER 11 - WALK BEH!I ND W BAGGER & SULKY
VHEELS ( GAS)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BID
KLBL I NC. NC BID
HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., [INC, NC Bl D
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NC BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. 3715.85 3,716.88
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 3185. 77 3,185.77
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO Bl D
XTREME MACHI NES NO B! D
1 EA MOWVER 11 - 26" WALK W TH GROOMERS { GAS)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NC BI D
KLBL t NC. NC BI D
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., [ NC. NC BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. - NO BID
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BID
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 11610, 51 11, 610. 61
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTREME MACHI NES NO 81D

Bi DS BY | TEM

2/ 06/ 14 PAGE 10

LOWBID STORR TRACTOF

LFRED 1 NC,

LOWBI D STCRR TRACTOR COMPANY

CONMP ANY



1731-21301- 13

Bi DS BY ! TEM

PRI CE
1 EA  NDWER IV - TRIPLEX, 11 BLADE REEL ({GAS)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO
KLBL I NC. . NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 40959. 75 40, 959
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTRENE MACHI NES NO
1 EA NDVER V - (DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO
KLBL 1 NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO
POTTER & SON, W H. NO
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 20761, 12 20, 761.
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTRENE MACHI NES NO
1 EA  NMDVER VI - (DI ESEL}
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT ©NO
KLBL | NC, NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., ! NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NO
POTTER & SON, W H. NG
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 80488. 99 80, 488.

ANDUNT

Bi D

Bl D
BID
BI D

BI D
81D
BID
BI D
BiD
98

%

2/ 06/ 14

P AGE

11

LOWEBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOW BID STORR TRACTOR COMPANY




1731-21301-13

032
05854
13880

PRI CE

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTRENME NMACHI NES

1 EA MOWER V11 - (DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT
KLBL 1 NC.
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO.., | NC.
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
POTTER & SON, WH.
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY 60673. 56
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
XTREME MACHI NES

1 EA MOVER V111 - ROTARY W DE AREA (Dl ESEL!}

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

KLBL | NC,

HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC.

MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC.

POTTER & SON, WH.

STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 60673. 58
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES

XTRENE MACHI NES

3 EA MOWER | X - ROTARY ROUGH { DI ESEL}
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT 14000. 06
KLBL I NC.

Bf DS BY { TEM

60, 673.

60, 673.

ANDUNT %
NO 81D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NG BI D
NC BI D
NC Bi D
NO BIiD

56 *
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NC B D
NC BiD
NO BID

56 *
NO BI D
NO Bl D

oC

42, 000.

NO

Bl D

2/06/14

PAGE

i2

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWBI D STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR

7 COMPANY




1731-21301- 13

Bl DS BY { TEM

PRI CE AND
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED § NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH NO
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY 20813. 68 62,441,
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTRENE MACH! NES NO

1 EA MOVER X - 100" ARTI CULATI NG ROUGH { DI ESEL
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO
KLBL | AC. NO
HARTER EQUHI PMENT CO., 1NC, NO
MACDONAL D, W LFRED | NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 38134.10 35, 134.
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTREME NMACH! NES NG

T EA MOMVEER Xi - FAl RWAY { DI ESEL}

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO
KLBL 1 NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., INC. NO
MACDONAL D, W LFRED | NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 56858. 68 56, 858.
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO
XTREME MACH! NES NOC

UNT

BI D
Bl D
Bl D

)

BI D
BID
Bl D
BI D

Bl D
BI D
Bl D
Bl D
BI D

Bl D

%

2/ 06/ 14

PAGE

13

LOWBID CENTRAL JERSEY EQU PNENT

LOWRBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY




173%1-21301-13 BI DS BY [ TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT

1 EA WOVER Xl - REEL (DI ESEL}
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNVENT NOC BI D
KLBL I NC. NO BiD
HARTER EQU! PMENT CO., | NC. NO BI D
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BID
POTTER & SON, WH. NO B! D
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY 52883. 88 52, 883. 68
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
XTREME MACHI NES NO Bl D

1 EA MOVER XII1 - FAIRWAY REEL (Di ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D
KLBL 1 NC. NO BI D
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., [NC. NO BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. 52497. 00 52, 4387.00
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NG BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NC BI D
XTREVE NMACH! NES NC BID

1 EA MMER XI'V - TRIPLEX 8-BLADE REEL - (DI ESEL}

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO
KLBL 1NC. _ NO
HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., | NC. NO
MACDONALD, W EFRED 1 NC, NO
POTTER & SON, WH. NO

STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 33820. GO 33, 820.

BID
BID
BI D
BI D
BID
00

%o

2/ 08/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWBID MACDONALD, W

LFRED I NC.



1731-21301-13

PRI CE AMDUNT

CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NG B! D
XTREME NACHE NES NG Bi D

1 EA MOVER XV - FAI RWAY (DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQU! PMENT NOC BI D
KLBL | NC. NO BED
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC, NO BI D
MACDONALD, W LFRED I NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NC BI D
STORR TRACTOR COWNPANY 56528. 70 56,528. 70
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO Bi B
XTRENME NMACHI NES NO BI D

1 EA MOVER XV1 - SIDW NDER ROTARY ( DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO BI D
KLBE 1§ NC. NC BI D
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., INC. NC BID
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NC BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BID
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 30194, 21 30, 194. 21
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BID
XTRENME NACH! NES NO BID

1 EA MDVER XVIL - GREENSMOVER - RI DI NG { DI ESEL)
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT NO Bl D
KLBL | NC. NO BI D

BEDS BY 1 TEM

»*

%

2/08/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBI D STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWEBID STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY




1731-21301-13

15690 HARTER EQUI PNMENT CO., | NC.
20780 MACDONALD, W EFRED 1 NC,
28310 POTTER & SON, WH.

33640 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
48940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 XTREME MACHI NES

041 3 EA 11 BLADE CUTTI NG UNI TS
05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT

13880 KLBI. | NC.

15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC.

20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED i NC.

28310 POTTER & SON, WH,

33540 STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

499840 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 XTREME MACH! NES

042 1T EA  AERATOR | - WALK BEHIND
05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT
13880 KLBL [ NC.
15590 HARTER EQUI PNENT CO., | NC.
20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC.
28310 POTTER & SON, WH.
33540 STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY
49840 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES
54756 XTREME MACHI NES

BIDS BY 1 TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
NC BI D
NO BID
NC BI D
37658. 98 37,658. 98
NO BI D
NO 81 D
NO BID
NO BI D
NG BI D
NO Bi D
NO Bi D
11987. G0 35, 991, 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NG BID
NO BID
NG BI D
NO BID
NO BiD
23020. 08 23,020.086
NO BI D
NO BI D

16

LOW B! B STORR TRACTOR COMPANY

LOWBI D STORR TRACTOR CONPANY

LOWBID STORR TRACTOR

CONPANY



1731-21301- 13 BI DS BY 1 TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
1 EA AERATOR I - FAlI Rway
CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO BI D
KLBL 1 NC. NO BI D
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. NC B! D
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NG Bt D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO 8I D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 32248. 00 32,248, 00 *
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NC BI D
XTREME WACH! NES NC B! D

1 EA LANDSCAPE RAKE {3 PO! NT Hi TCH)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNENT 1100. 00 1, 100.
KLBL I NC. NO
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., | NC. 3650. 00 3, 650.
MACDONAL D, W LFRED | NC. NO
POTTER & SON, WH. 2774.00 2,774,
STORR TRACTOR CONPANY 4237. 00 4, 237.
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES 3705. 23 3, 705.
XTREME MACHI NES NO

1T EA  GREENS ROLLER ( GAS)

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNVENT NO
KLBL | NC. NG
HARTER EOQUI PMENT CO., 1 NC. NO
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. 148924. 00 14, 994,
POTTER & SON, WH. NO

STORR TRACTOR CONPANY NO

oC
Bl D
g
BI D

BI D
Bi D
Bl D
00

BID
Bl D

%

2/ 086/ 14

PAGE
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LOWEBID STORR TRACTQ
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PRi CE ANDUNT %

48940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D

54756 XTREME MACHI NES NO Bi D
............................................................................................ LOW BI D MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC.
046 1 EA  TiNE HARROW

05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO BI D

13880 KLEL | NC. NO BI D

15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1 NC. NO BI D

20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. 1119. 00 1,118. 00

28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D

33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 1085. 00 1, 085, 00

49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D
nmwm.“wmw.mnnn,WA”_.WWYW;WRWPWW*Mw/_mm:m|--u---------=--:-:--n--||----1-|-7mmu:=wwwu ........................... LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONP ANY
047 1 EA  BLOVER - DEBRIS, TRAILER MDUNTED

05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMENT NO BID

13880 KLBL | NC. NO BI D

15590 HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1NC. NO BI D

20760 MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. NG BID

28310 POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D

33540 STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 7728. 64 7,728. 64

49940 CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NO BI D

54755 XTREME MACH: NES NO BI D
........................ T ......._............ LOWBID STORR TRACTOR CONPANY
048 1 EA  SVEEPER / VACUUM

05854 CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PMNENT NO BI D

13880 KLBL 1 NC. NO 81D




1731-21301- 13 Bl DS BY | TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., 1RNC. NC Bl D
MACDONALD, W LFRED | NC. 31239. 00 31, 238.00
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI B
STORR TRACTOR CONMPANY NO BI D
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NC BI D
XTREME MACHI NES NOC Bt D

1 EA BUNKER MA! NTENANCE MACH! NE

CENTRAL JERSEY EQUI PNMENT NO BID
KLBL T NC. NC BI D
HARTER EQUI PMENT CO., {NC. NO BtD
MACDONALD, W LFRED 1 NC. NO BI D
POTTER & SON, WH. NO BI D
STORR TRACTOR COMPANY 255642 .17 25,542, 17
CHERRY VALLEY TRACTOR SALES NC BI D
XTREME MACHI NES NO BID

%

2/ 06/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBI D NACDONALD, W

LOWBID STORR TRACTCHR
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COMPANY




