BID # 0016-14

FURNISHING AND DELIVERY OF JANITORIAL SUPPLIES

By:

Monmouth County Board of Recreation Commissioners
Monmouth County Park System
805 Newman Springs Road
Lincroft, NJ 07738
Phone: {732) 842-4000, Ext. 4330
Fax: (732) 842-4162

Contact: Stephanie Weise, QRPA

|

Number of Bids Received |

|_Vendor Name and Address |

[ 13 ]

All American Poly Corp., 40 Turner P1., Piscataway, NJ 08854
All Clean, Inc.; 990 Spruce St., Lawrenceville, NJ 08648
Central Poly Bag Corp.; 2400 Bedle P1,, Linden, NJ 07036
Dash Medical Gloves; 9635 S. Franklin Dr.,

Franklin, WI 53132

Interboro Packaging Corp; 114 Bracken Rd.,,

Montgomery, NY 12549

John Deere Landscapes, Inc.; 3 Industrial Ct.,

Freehold, NJ 07728

Madsen & Howell, Inc.; 500 Market St., PO Box 391,

Perth Amboy, NJ 08862

MB and Companies, DBA Cross Country; 855 Hylton Rd.,
Pennsauken, NJ 08110

Pyramid School Products Co., 6510 N, 54" S,

Tampa, FL. 33610

Sam Tell & Son, Inc.; 300 Smith St., Farmingdale, NY 11735
Spruce Industries; 759 East Lincoln Ave., Rahway, NJ 07065
TSP Maintenance Supply, LLC; 52 East Dr.,

Livingston, NJ 07039

United Sales USA Corp.; 250 44" St., Brooklyn, NV 11232

(SEE TALLY SHEETS FOR BIDS AS OPENED AND PUBLICLY READ)
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w
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40|
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ALL AMER! CAN POLY
22.87 457. 40

32. 35 3235. 00}
18. 05 9025. 00|
w

_

1/13/14

JOHN DEERE LANDSC]
|

_
!

_

12.75  1912. 501

:
P
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1

UNI TED SALES USA

40. 00

41. 74

_
I

|
6720. CO|

2087. 00|
w

CENTRAL POLY CORP
13. 20 264. 00

14. 70 1470, GO
14. 20 7100. 00



0085- 010- 14 BI DS BY | TEM - SUNMARY 1/13/14 PAGE 2
VB AND COMPANIES,  PYRAM D SCHOOL PR ALL AVERI CAN POLY  JOHN DEERE LANDSC  UNI TED SALES USA  CENTRAL POLY CORP
028 3.30 33. 00} 4.18 41. 60| _ | m

029 | 4. 41 132. 30| ; | |
030 | 4,41 132. 30} I ! |
031 31.80 63.60]  33.74 67. 48] ] | _
032 | 36.99  3699. 00| _ | 35.50  3550.00]
033  17.60 70. 40} [ | | |
034 2.10 21. 00} 2. 80 25, 00| ! ! |
035 41.10  205.50|  39.98 199. 90| ﬁ ! m
036 35.30 1412.00| 35.54 1421, 80} [ 74.78 2990. 40| |
037 47.90  670.60] 51.72 724. 08| m i |
038  17.60 176.00{  14.19 141, 90| : | | |
039 M . 86 82. 56| ! _ !
040 _ | ﬂ ! o
041 I W ] ] _
042 | 53.16 169, 48] “ | _
043 41.10 82.20f  47.88 95. 76 | _ _
044 12.72 25. 44| ! ! ! |
045 20,00  200.00| 27.96 279. 60} | m !
046  45.60  273.60|  30.47 182, 821 i | |
047 L 22,22 888. 80| _ [ 50.00 2000, 00|
048 i _ | | !
048 [ 26.89 265. 90| ! _ |
TOTALS 25974. 21| 21608. 45| 12717, 40} 4902. 90| 14357. 00! 8834. 00
GROUP# 2
MADSEN & HOWELL, SPRUCE { NDUSTRIES| | NTERBORO PACKAGI | ALL CLEAN JAN! TOR] SAM TELL & SON DASH MEDI CAL GLOV

001 23.52 470, 401 14. 98 299. 60|

00z 33.58 3358. 0} ! 14. 48 1448, 00| | i



0085-010- 14

GROUP# 2

003 36. 80
oo4 75. 18
005 59. 50
0Ge 4,45
007 5. b8
cog 5.04
009 .72
010 60. 50
011 30.12
012 25, 24
OAm. 8. 23
014 13, 80
015 42.30
0186 16. 12
017 3.25
018 13. 20
019 41,95
G20 66. 09
021 43. 20
022 37.45
023 23. 69
024 22. 43
625 1. 34
028 30.79
027 37. 60
028 4.17
G29 9.75

18450.
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9996.
44
27.
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248.
2070.
846.
80.
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3356.
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2160.
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47.
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181.
1539,
376.
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MADSEN & HOWELL,

00|
54|
00}
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68|
00}
60}
20|
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00|
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0]
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80|
00/
18]
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60|
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45|
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50|
00|
70}
50|

BI DS BY { TEM - SUMWBRY

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

!
50.99 8566, 32|

!
29, 99 1499, 50]

13.99 129. 90|
]
W

{ NTERBORO PACKAGI

17.48 8740. 00)

H
H
i

w

|
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50.
84.
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ag,
ag.
31.

43.
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73.
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34.
30.
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.37

50
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81

.18
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00
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.25
.00

1113/ 14
CLEAN JANI TOR

152.
14232,
76.
58.
71.
485,
178.
1443,
159,

877.
114,
308.
287.
39786.
180.
3684.
349.
69,
458.
1060.
2439,
418.
52.
210.

22|
96/
00!
25|
28|
28|
001
00
85|

40/
05|
00|
82|
001
00|
50|
84|
161
25|
48|
00|
301
501
00|

53.

10.

13.
16.
-13
13.

48,

5.

PAGE

48

.75

81

.03

67
a1

76

50

31

SAM TELL & SON

160.

57.
54,
37.

273.

80.
187.
247.

93.

384

50|

40|
051
80|
68|

_

DASH NMED! CAL GLOV

43. 70

3496. 0C



0085-010- 14 BIDS BY I TEM - SUMVARY 1713/ 14 PAGE 4

MADSEN & HOWELL, SPRUCE | NDUSTRIES | NTERBORO PACKAGI  ALL CLEAN JAMI TOR  SAM TELL &-SON DASH NEDI CAL GLOV
GROUP# 2
030 9.75 292. 50| i I 7.00 210. 00} |
031  32.76 65. 52| _ |  36.75 73. 50} |
032 28.36  2836.00f 15.79 1579. 00| |  45.54 4554 00| ]
033 24.13 96. 52| | I 29.93 119. 72| |
034 2.79 27. 901 f M 3.85 38. 50} 4.18 41, 80|
035  56. 85 284. 25| | |  55.84 279.20!  48.14 240. 701
036 29.52  1180.80| 54. 68 2187. 20| | 39.64 1685, 60| ]
037 79.94 1119.18}  46.53 651. 42 | 55.00 770.00]  46.92 656. 88/
038 17.79 177. 90| ; | 25.55 255. 50 _
039 .76 72. 96| ] | 82. 761 |
040 | | | 176,13 9687. 15] i
041 | ! | 80.00 900. 00| |
042 52.34 157. 02} i |  38.56 115. 68|  40. 68 122. 04
043 76.25 162, 50| | | 44.92. 89.84|  34.08 68. 16}
044  18.36 36. 72| [ | 33.84 67.28|  41.88 83. 761
045  27.93 279. 30! | | 26.88 268.80| 42,48 424. 80|
046  29.03 174. 18} i | 35,24 211. 44 . _
047  50.50  2020.00| 2224 889. 60| | 56.00 2240, 00 !
048  12.25 367. 50| | I 15.22 456.60|  12.78 383. 40]
048  34.93 349.30)  25.96 259. 60| {3112 311. 20| |
TOTALS 56257. 98 15772, 544 13598. 60] 53653. 914 3265. 58| 3486. 00
GROUP# 3

TSP MAI NTENANCE S |
001 _
002 | | | | _

003 | | | ! !
004 [ | | | ]



C085- 010- 14 BIDS BY 1 TEM - SUMMVARY 113/ 14 PAGE 5
TSP MAI NTENANCE S

GROUPY 3
005 i m _ |

006 _ | | I
007 | * i |
008 | m _ w
009 i ; | _
010 _ | ] I
011 _ | | ;
012 | m | _
013 i ; | m
014 | | ] !
015 | * | A
0186 i [ | |
017 | % !
018 | ] ! ]
019 | ~ m |
020 | | _ _
02t 48.853  2426. 50| | i |
022 | | M !
023 “ | | _
024 | w | |
025 | | ] I
026 m | [ _
027 w ] _ *
028 ! | | !
029 | | | ]
030 | _ _ _
031 _ | “ _



0085-010- 14 BIDS BY | TEM - SUNVMARY 1/13/14 PAGE 6
TSP MAI NTENANCE S

GROUP# 3
032  22.94  2294.00] | m _ i

033 | | ] ! |
034 | _ _ | _
035 “ m | _ i
036 I | f ! m
037 | | ] | !
038 _ ~ _ | !
039 | | m | !
040 137.61  7568.55] ! I ! _
041 80.00 900. 00| _ ! | |
042 I _ _ _ m
043 | } i _ ]
044 | ] ] ! _
045 _ | | “ _
048 _ R _ _ f
047 I I | | |
048 | | ] I |
049 | | ! m _
TOTALS 13189. 05} “ ! J
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20 CS TRASH BAGS 24 X 33, 6 M CRON, CLEAR

MB AND COMPANIES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, §NC

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP,
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, iNC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

100 C8 TRASH BAGS 33 X 40, 22 M CRON, CLEAR

VB AND CONMPANIES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMNERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, | NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORi AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

B DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

19. 28

22.87

13. 20

23,52

i4. 98

28. 31

32. 35

14. 70
33. 58

14. 48

ANDUNT
385. 60
NC BI D
457 .40
NO BI D
NO BI D
264, 00
470. 40
NO BI D
299. 60
NO B D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC BI D
2,831.00
NO BID
3, 235.00
NO BI D
NG Bi D
1, 470.00
3. 358. 00
NO BI D
1,448. 00
NO BID
NO Bl D

%

1113/ 14

PAGE

1

20.
20.
20.
20.
20,
20,
20.
20.
20,
20.
20.
20.
20.

LCWBI D CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100.
100,
100.
100.
1C0.
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Q0o
000
000
co0
000
0G0
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
ey
000
000
000
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0085- 010- 14

PRI CE

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, 1INC
TSP WAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BIDS BY I TEM

1/13/14 PAGE
AMDUNT %
NO BI D
NO BID

500 CS TRASH BAGS 38 X 58 X 60, 2.0 ML GAUGE

EXTRA HEAVY, BLACK
MB AND CONPANFES, | NC. 25. 45
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANERI CAN POLY 18. 05
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON 14. 20
MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 36. 80
SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGE NG CORP. 17. 48
ALL CLEAN JANI TOR! AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDE CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY. LLC

3 Cs FLOOR BRUSH 24"
MB AND CONMPANI ES, 1 NC. 47. 94
PYRAM [ SCHOQL. PRODUCTS 53. b2
ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNi TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, §NC 75.18

12, 725.

NO

9, 025,

NC
NO

7. 100.
18, 450.

NO

8, 740.

NO
NG
NO

143.
160.

NG
NO
NG
NO

225.

co
8l D
00
BID
BI D
00 *
00
Bi D

82
56
BID
Bt D
BI D
BID

54

100.
100.

LOWBID | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500.
500,
500.
500.
500.
500,
500,
500.

LOWBID CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
Q00
000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000

000
000

. 000
. QoG



0085%- 010- 14

006
02854
096186
08840

SPRUCE ! NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

168 CS TOI LET TISSUE, SiZE: 1500
MB AND CONPANIES, 1 NC
FYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, INC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY €D
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LiLC

10 EA  WASTEBASKETS { PLASTI C}
VB AND CONMPAN: ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
AlLL ANERI CAN POLY

BI DS BY

PRI CE

BO. 74

53

. 46

SHEETS PER ROLL

34

40

59
50

84

2

.00

. 00

. B0
.99

.72

94

LTEM 1/ 13/ 14 PAGE 3
AMDUNT %
NC Bi G
NO BID
152.22 *
160. 38
NO BI D
NO BID
.............................. LOWBID MB AND CONMPANI ES, 1 NC.
5,712.00
NC BiD
NO BI D
NO BI D
6, 720. 00
NO BI D
g, 996. 00
g, 566. 32
NO BI D
14, 232. 95
NC BID
NO BfD
NO BI D
.............................. LOWBID MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC.
NO Bi D
29. 40
NG BI D

168.
168.
168.
168,
168.
168.
168.
188,
168.
168,
168.
168,
168.

10.
10.
10,

C00
000
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
o000
000
000
000
Q00
000
000
0CC
000

000
00O
000



0085- 010- 14

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWVELL, [NC

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

| NTERBORO PACKAGE NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JAN! TOR! AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MED! CAL GLOVES, INC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 EA  MDOP HANDLES
MB AND CONMPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANER]I CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, [NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY O
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC
TSP MAlI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BIDS BY I TEM

PRI CE

4.45

7.60
5. 75

4. 55
8. 34

5. 55

1%1. 865
10. 81

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NC BID
NG Bl D
4450
NO BI D
NC BI D
76. 00
57.50
NC BI D
NO BID
22.75
41. 70
NO BID
NC BI D
NO Bi D
NO BI D
27.75
NO BID
NG BID
58. 25
54.05
NO Bl D
NO BI D

%

1113/ 14

PAGE

4

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

LOWBID NB AND COMPANI ES,

I NC.

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
0.

coo
000
0060
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000

000

. 00O
. 000

000

. 000

000
000

. 000
. 000



0085- 010- 14

PRI CE

36 EA  TRI GGER SPRAYER & BOTTLE COMBO
MB AND COMPAMI ES, |NC. 1.05
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 1.19
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNt TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 5. 04
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGH NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL, SUPPLY CO 1.898
SAM TELL & SON 1. 03
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BI DS BY | TEM

............................................................................................ LOWBID SAM TELL & SON

144 EA SPONGES
MB AND CONPANIES, | NC. .95
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 1.78
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, §NC .72
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 3. 37
SAM TELL & SON

113/ 14 PAGE 5
ANDUNT %
37. 80
42.84
NG Bi D
NG BI D
NO Bi D
NO BID
181. 44
NO BID
NO BI D
71.28 *
37.08
NO BI D
NO BI D
136. 80
256, 32
NC B! D
NG BiD
NO BI D
NO BI D
103. 68
NC BI D
NO BI D
485, 28 *
NO BI D

36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
38.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.
36.

144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144,
144.
144,

144.

000
elole}
000
Q00
000
coo
co0
000
000
000
000
a8l
000

ele)
000
000
Coo
000
000
G0
000
000
000
000



0085- 010- 14

02854
09616
09640
33548
385667
43057
50967

PRI CE

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

4 Cs CLOTHES SOAP
MB AND COWPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS §0. 99
ALl AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN BEERE LANDSCAPES
UNt TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC 60. 50
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 44, 50
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDi CAL GLOVES, ! NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

30 Cs LI QUI D DI SH soaApP
MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 44.98
ALL AMER! CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOWVELL, [NC 30.12

BI DS BY ! TEM

.............................. LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL,

144,
144,

| NC

4

A

000
QGco

. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000
co0
000
000
000

. 600

000

.............................. LOWBID ALL CLEAN JAN! TORI AL SUPPLY CO

ANDUNT
NC BI D
NO BED
NC BiD

243. 96
NO BI D
NOC BI D
NO BiD
NG BI D

242,00
NO Bi D
NO BI D

178, 00
NO BI D
NO BID
NO 81D
NC BI D

1,349. 40
NG B D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID

803. 60

30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

000
000
000
000
00C
000
000



0085- 010- 14

PRI CE
SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 48,10

SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC
TSP MAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 Cs CAR WASH
ME AND CONMPAMI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 30. 88
ALL AMER] CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, ENC 25,24
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANITOR: AL mCmu._umU\ CO 31.97
SAM TELL & SON
DASH NED! CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

30 BAGS OIL DRY
MB AND COMPANI ES, 1 NC. 4.85
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANMER! CAN POLY

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NO Bi D

1,443. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC BID
NO BI D

154.90
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC BI D

126. 20
NO Bi b
NOC BID

158. 85
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D

145, 50
NC BI D
NO BID

%

113114

PAGE

7

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

i NC

30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

30.
30.
30.

000
000
GO0
000
000
000

. 000
. 000

000
0co
000

. DOC
. D00

000
000
000

. 000
. 0oC
. 000

000
000
Q00



0085-010- 14 BI DS BY | TEM 1713714 PAGE g

PRI CE ANDUNT %

33546  JOMN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO Bi D 30. 000
38567  UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO BI D 30. 000
43057  CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D 30. 000
50967  MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC 8. 23 246. 90 30. 000
51935  SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI £S NG Bi D 30. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO 8 D 30. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 30. 000
54944  SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 30. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC NOC BI D 30. 000
56833 TSP MAINTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 30. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBID NB AND COMPANIES, | NC.

014 150 BAGS | CE MELTING PELLETS ( CALCI UM CHLORI DE)

02854 M3 AND COMPANI ES, | NC. NG Bi D 150, 000
09616  PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS NO BI D 160. 000
09640  ALL AMERI CAN POLY NO BI D 150. 000
33546  JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES 12.75 1,912,550 * 150. 000
38567  UNITED SALES USA CORP NO BI D 150, 000
43057  CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NO BI D 150. 000
50967  MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 13. 80 2,070. 00 150. 000
51935  SPRUCE | NDUSTRIES NO Bi D 150. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 150. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO NO BI D 150. 000
54944  SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 150. 000
56161 DASH NEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC NO BID 150. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO 81 D 150. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES



0085- 010- 14

016
02854
08616
09640
33548
38587
43057
50967
51935
535685
539861
54844

20 Cs SCRUB PADS 8" X 8"
MB AND CONMPANIES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALl ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC
SPRUCE 1| NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JAN! TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MED! CAL GLOVES, |INC
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 EA PAILS, 15 QT
VB AND CONPANE ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANER] CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC
SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORC PACKAG!I NG CORP
AlLL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

Bi DS BY | TEM

FPRi CE

12. 45

12. 39

42.30

43. 87
13. 67

18. 12

22. 31
16. 01

ANDUNT
249,00
247.80
NO Bl D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
846. 00
NO BI D
NO BI D
877. 40
273. 40
NO BI'D
NO BI D
NO BiD
NO BID
NO Bl D
NO BID
NG Bi D
NO BI D
80. 80
NO Bi D
NO BI D
114.05
80. 05

%

/13714

PAGE

8

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

20.
20.
20.
20,
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.
20.

AN R L C S I S I <

000
00oC
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

. 000

000
000

. 000

000
000

. 600
. 000
. 000
. 000
. 000



0085- 010- 14

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, [NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

60 EA METAL-TI P, THREADED END BROOM HANDLE

MB AND COMPANE ES, [ NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL ANERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNt TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOWMELL, 1NC

SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

18 EA BRUTE PLASTiI C BUCKETS
MB AND COWPAN!I ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMER!I CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON -
MADSEN & HOWELL, 1NC

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

2.35
2. 69

5. 15
3.13

11.70
6. 98

13. 20

1/13/ 14 PAGE
ANMDUNT %
NG Bi D
NO BID
141. 00
161. 40
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
195. 00
NO BID
NC BI D
309.00 *
187. 80
NO BID
NG BI D
210. 60
125, 64
NO BID
NO B1 D
NO BID
NC Bl D
237. 80

10

LOWBID SAM TELL & SON

LOWBID ©MB AND COMPANI ES,

P NC.

60.
60.
60.
60.
60.
60.
80.
60.
60.
60.
60,
60.
60.

18.
i8.
18

18.
18.
18.
18,

. 000
. 000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000G
000
000
000

0c0
oy
000
0co
000
coo
ooC



0085- 010- 14

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH WEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

TSP WAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

80 C8 NED! CAL GLOVES
VB AND COMPANI ES,
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

I NC.

ALL ANERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC
SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, iNC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

2 BX FLIP UP DUST PAN
MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

Bi bS BY

PRi CE

15, 98
13.78

44,10

41,95

38. 90
42, 70

44. 94

[ TEM 1713714 PAGE
ANDUNT %
NO B D
NO BI D
287.82
247. 68
NO BI D
NO Bi D
NO BI D
3, 528. 00
NO BI D
NG B! D
NO 81D
NO BI D
3, 356. 00
NO B1D
3,112.00
3,976. 00
NO 81D
3, 496. 00
NO Bi D
NO B! D
89. 88
NO BI D

11

LOWBI D

LOWEBID

18.
18.
18.
18.
18.
18.

PYRAM D SCHOOQL PRODUCTS

80.
80.
a0.
80.
80.
80.
80.
80.
80.
80.
80.
80,
80.

| NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP,

000
000
Qoo
000
0c0
000

GO0
000
Gco
ele)
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
oo

. 600
. 000
. 000



0085- 010- 14

JOHN DEERE [ ANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDE CAL GLOVES, INC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

50 Cs SHOP TOVELS
MB AND CONMPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOCL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE | ANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, | NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
i NTERBORO PACKAGH NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, 1NC

TSP MA]I NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

Bl BS BY [ TEM

PRI CE

66. 09

90. 00
46. 50

64.89

43. 20

73.69

1/13/14 PAGE
ANDUNT %
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
132.18
NO BI D
NO BID
180.00 *
93. 00
NO Bl D
NO Bi D
NO BI D
3, 234. 50
NO BI D
NO BID
NG Bi D
NO BI D
2. 160. 00
NO BID
NO Bt D
3, 684. 50
NO BI D
NO BID
2,4286. 50

12

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NG

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
bO.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

MONORNNN e N NN

. 000
. 000

0Co
000
000
slele)
000
000
000

. GO0

000G
000
000
000
G000
000
gele)
000
000
000
000
000
000



0085- 010- 14

8 EA ROLL TOWEL DI SPENSER
MB AND COWMPAN! ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMER! CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI! ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, {NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

2 EA SANI TARY NAPKI N RECEPTACLE

ME AND CONPANI ES, |NC,
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALE AMER!I CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
SPRUCE { NDUSTRI £S

I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALE CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

BIDS BY | TEM

PRI CE

39. 15

37.45

43.73

24,69

23.69

34. 58

1113/ 14 PAGE 13

ANDUNT %

NO BI D

213. 20

NO BI D
NO BID

NO BID

NO BI D

299. 60

NO 8ID

NO BI D

349, 84

NO Bi D

NO BI D

NO BI D

.............................. LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL,

NO BI D

49. 38

NO BI D

NO BI D

NO BID

NO BI D

47.38

NO BI D

NO Bi D

59. 16 )
- NO BI D

I NC

Bi D10

. 000
. 000
. 000
0G0
000
000
. 000
000
000
. 000
coo
. 00G
. 000

. 000
GO0
000
000
000
000
. 000
000
yels)
. 000

MR NN NN RN NN

. 000



0085- 010- 14

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

15 EA TOILET PAPER DI SPENSER

WE AND COMPANI ES,
PYRAM D SCHOOL PR
ALL AMER] CAN POLY

I NC.
ODUCTS

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA
CENTRAL POLY CORP
MADSEN & HOWELL,

SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES

CORP
ORATI ON
I NC

I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JAN! TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CALL GLOVES, | NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE S

UPPLY,

LLC

BI DS BY

PRI CE

23.15

22.43

30. 55

16 EA HAND CLEANER, HEAVY DUTY

MB AND CONPANI ES,
PYRAM D SCHOCL PR
ALL AMERI CAN POLY

I NC.
ODUCTS

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA
CENTRAL POLY CORP
MADSEN & HOWELL,

CORP
ORATI ON
I NC

18. 99

11. 34

FTEM 1713714 PAGE
ANDUNT %
NO BID
NC Bi D
NO BID
347. 25
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC Bi D
336. 45
NG BI D ¢
NO BID
458. 25
NO BID
NO BID
NO BID
NO BiD
303. 84
NO BI D
NO Bi D
NO Bl D
NO w_U
181. 44

14

LOWSBID MADSEN & HOWELL,

LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL,

§ NC

I NC

15.
15.
15.
15

15,
18,
15.
15.
15,
15.
15.
15.
15.

16.
16.
16,
16.
16.
16.
186.

. 000
. 000

000
Q00
000
000
000
000
000
000
elele]
000
000
000
000

000
Co0
000
000
coo
000
00



0085-010- 14

PRI CE

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORi AL SUPPLY CO 66. 28

SAM TELL & SON

DASH MED! CAL GLOVES, [ NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC
50 Cs FOAM SKI N CLEANSER

MB AND CONPANI ES, INC

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 39. 45

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP 41,74

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL,

SPRUCE

I NC 30,79
I NDUSTRI ES 29. 99
| NTERBOROC PACKAGI NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 48.78
SAM TEEL & SON

i NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

DASH MEDi CAL GLOVES,

BI DS BY | TEM

027
02854
096186
058640

10 CS LI QUI D HAND SQAP ( GL)

ME AND CONMPANI ES, | NC,
FYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 41.59

ALL AMER! CAN POLY

1/13/ 14 PAGE
ANDUNT %
NO Bl D
NO BI D
1,060, 48
NO BiD
NO Bl B
NO BID
NO BI D
1,872.50
NC Bi D
NO BI D
2,087. 00
NG BID
1,539. 50
1, 498. 50
NO BID
2,439. 00
NO BID
NO Bl D
NO BID
NO BI D
415. 90
NG BiD

15

LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

LOWBID SPRUCE ! NDUSTRIES

I NC

16,
16,
16.
16.
18.
16.

50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.
50.

10.
10.
10.

Coo
000
000
000
000
GO0

000
000
000
00C
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

0C0
000
000



0085- 010- 14 BIDS BY | TEM 1113/ 14 PAGE 18

PRI CE ANDUNT %

33548 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 10. 000
38567 UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO BI D 10. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D 10. 000
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, iNC 37. 60 376. 00 10. 000
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 13. 99 139. 90 10. 000
53585 I NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP. NO BI D 10. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 41.83 418. 30 10. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 10. 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, 1 NC NO BI D 10. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 10. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BI D SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

028 10 EA  CORN BROOM

02854 MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC. 3. 30 33.00 10. 000
08616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 4.18 41.80 10. 000
09640 ALL ANERI CAN POLY NO Bl D 10. 00C
33546 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC BI D 10. 000
38567 UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO Bi D 10. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO BI D 10. 000
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC 4.17 41.70 10. 000
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO BI D 10. 00C
53585 I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 10. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 5. 25 52.50 * 10. 000
54944 SAM TELL & SON 5. 31 53. 10 10. 000
56161 DASH NMEDI CAL GLOVES, 1 NC NO Bl D 10. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BID 10. 000

............................................................................................ LOWBID M AND COMPANIES, 1 NC.



0085-010- 14 BIDS BY I TEM

PRI CE ANDUNT

30 BX Df SPOSABLE GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY, LARGE

WB AND COMPAN! ES, 1 NC. NO
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 4. 41 132
ALL ANERI CAN POLY NO
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO
UN! TED SALES USA CORP NO
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NC
MADSEN & HOVELL, |NC 9.75 292
SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES NO
I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP. NO
ALL CLEAN JANI TOR! AL SUPPLY CO 7.00 210.
SAM TELL & SON NO
BDASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC NO
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NC

30 BX DI SPOSABLE GLOVES, HEAVY DUTY, X LARGE

MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC. NO
PYRAM D SCHOOQL PRODUCTS 4.41 132
ALL AMER]I CAN POLY NO
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO
UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NO
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC 9.75 2092
SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES NO
I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP. NO
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 7. 00 270.
SAM TELL & SON NO

Bl D

. 30

Bi D
Bi D
BI D
Bi D

. 50

Bl D
BI D

BI D

.30

Bl D
8l D
BID
BID

. BO

BI D
BI D
0o

Bt D

17

LOWBI D PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

30.
30.
30,
30.
30.
30.
30,
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30,
30.
30.

000
Q00
000
0o
000
000
000
000
0Co
000
Qo
coo
000G

000
oo
000
000
00C
000
000
000
000
000
000



0085-010- 14

032
02854
09616
08640
33546
38667
43057
50967

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY,

2 Cs CLOROX CLEAN- UP W BLEACH

MB AND CONMPANI ES,

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALEL AMER! CAN POLY

UNI TED SALES USA

I NC.

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

CORP

| NC

LLC

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL,
SPRUCE 1| NDUSTRI ES

I NC

I NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVI

100 Cs SCOTTFOLD "W

M3 AND COMPANI ES,

PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALEL AMER! CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSC
UNI TED SALES USA

ES, INC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

I NC.

APES
CORP

TOVEL

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI! ON

MADSEN & HOWELL,

I NC

BIDS BY | TEM

PRI CE

31. 80
33.74

32.78

36. 75

36. 99

356. 50

28. 36

113/ 14 PAGE 18
ANDUNT %
NO BID 30.
NO BI D 30
.............................. LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
63. 60 2
67.48 2
NO BI D 2.
NO BI D 2
NO BI D 2
NO BI D 2.
65. 52 2.
NO BI D 2.
NO BI D 2.
73. 50 2.
NO BI D 2
NO BI D 2.
NO BI D 2
.............................. LOWBID M AND COMPANIES, | NC.
NO BI D 100.
3, 699. 00 100.
NO BI D 100.
NO BID 100,
3, 550. 00 100.
NO BI D 100.
2, 836. 00 100

600

. 000

. 000
. 000

000

. Q00
. 000

eloie]
000
Q00
000
GO0

. 000

000

. 000

000
000
000
oo
000
000

. 000



0085-010- 14

034
02854
09616
09640

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

| NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JAN TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

4 CS TOILET BOW. CLEANER
MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, | NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES
I NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH WEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

10 EA TAPERED BROOM HANDLE
MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANERI CAN POLY

BIDS BY | TEM

PR! CE

16,79

45, 54

17. 60

24,13

29.93

2.10
2.50

1/13/ 14 PAGE 19
ANMDUNT %
1, 579. 00
NO Bi D
4, 554. 00
NO BID
NO Bl D
2, 294. 00
.................................... LOWBI D SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
70. 40
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID
96. 52
NO BID
NO BID
119,72 *
NO BI D
NO BID
NC BI D
.............................. LOWBID MB AND CONPANI ES, | NC.
21.00
25. 00
NO BI D

10C,
100.
160.
100.
100.
100.

10.
10.
10.

A A A

000
000
000
Q00
000
C0oo

. 000
. 000G

000
000
000
00C
000
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000

000
000
000



0085- 010- 14

PRI CE
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC 2.79
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGE NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 3. 85
SAM TELL & SON 4.18

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, [NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

5 EA STRI NG VOP/ BUCKET VRI NGER CONBO
MB AND COMPAMNI ES, 1 NC. 41.10
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 39. 88
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CCRPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, I NC 56. 85
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGE NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 55. 84
SAM TELL & SON 48. 14

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP NMAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BI DS BY | TEM

ANDUNT
NO BI D
NOC BI D
NC BID
27.90
NO BI D
NO BID
38. 50
41. 80
NC BiD
NC BID

205. 50

189. 90
NG BID
NO BI D
NO BiD
NG BID

284. 25
NO BID
NO BID

27%. 20

240.70
NO BID
NC BI D

%

1713714

PAGE

20

LOWBID WNMB AND COWMPANI ES, | NC.

LOWBID PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

10.
10.
10,
10,
10,
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

olel0]
0Q0
000
el
000
000
000
000
000
00C

. 000
. 000

000
000

. 000

000
000
006

. 000

000

. 000
. 000
. 000



0085- 010- 14

40 CS WASP AND HORNET KiLLER

MB AND COWPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERi CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNE TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JAN! TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC
TSP MAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

PRI CE

35.
35.

74,

29.

54.

39.

30

76

B2

68

64

BIDS BY | TEM

ANDUNT

1,412,
1,421

NO

2, 980.

NO
NO

1, 180,
2,187.

NG

1. B85,

00
60
BI D
40
BID
BI D

1113/ 14 PAGE 21

%

............................................................................................ LOWBI D MADSEN & HOWELL,

14 CS STRI NG MOP HEAD
MB AND COMPANIES, 1 NC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
t NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY O
SAM TELL & SON

47.
51.

79.
48,

90
72

94
53

55.00

46.

92

670.

724,

NO
NO
NO
NO
1,119,
651.
NO
770.
656.

60
08
BI D
Bl D
BI D
BID
18
42
Bl D
0¢
g8

I NC

40.
40.
40,
40,
40,
40.
40,
40.
40.
40.
40.
4Q.
40,

14.
14.
14.
14,
14.
14,
14,
14.
14.
14.
4.

000
000
olele)
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000G
000

000
000
000
000
000
€00
000
000
000
000
000



0085- 010- 14

039
02854
09616
08640
33545
385867
43057
50967

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

10 Cs WAX LI N
MB AND COMPANI ES,

ERS

{ NC

t NC.

PYRAM D SCHOCL PRODUCTS

ALL AMERI CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNETED SALES USA CORP

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON

MADSEN & HOWELL,
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

i NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP
ALL CLEAN JANI TOR!I AL SUPPLY CO

SAM TELL & SON

I NC

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES,

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

96 EA  SOAP BARS
MB AND COMPANIES, INC.
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

ALL AMER]I CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP

I NC

CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON

MADSEN & HOVELL,

I NC

Bl DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

17. 80
14.19

17.79

25. 55

. 86

.76

ANDUNT
NC BIi D
NC Bi D

176. 00

141. 90
NO BID
NO 8I D
NO BI D
NG BI D

177.90
NO BID
NO BI D

255. 50
NO BID
NOQ BID
NO BI D
NG BiD
82. 56
NO Bl D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC Bi D
72,96

%

1713/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBID SPRUCE 1 NDUSTRI ES

LOWBI D PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS

14,
14.

10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
0.
10.
10.
10.

96.
96.
96.
98.
96.
96.
96.

coo
000

000
000
ele]
000
000
000
000
000
0G0
000
000
000
000

000
000
000
000
000
000
000G



0085- 010- 14 Bi DS BY [ TEM

02854
09616

PRI CE AMDUNT
SPRUCE | NDUSTR!I ES NO BID
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NC BI D
ALL CLEAN JANI TOR! AL SUPPLY CO 82.76
SAM TELL & SON NO B8I D
DASH MED! CAL GLOVES, |INC ’ NO BI D
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BID

55 CS HYDROGEN PEROXI DE/ ORANGE Ol L CLEANER
CONCENTRATE, SAN TI ZER/ VI RUC! DE

MB AND COMPANI ES, I NC, NO
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS NO
ALL ANMERI CAN POLY NG
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO
UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON NO
MADSEN & HOVELL, iNC NOC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES NO
} NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CCRP. NO
ALL CLEAN JANI TOR! AL SUPPLY CO 176.13 9, 687
SAM TELL & SON NO
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES. iINC NG
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC 137. 61 7, 568.

10 EA HYDROGEN PEROXi DE/ CONCENTRATE, AUTOMAT! C
PUSH BUTTON GALLON Di SPENSER

VB AND CONMPAN: ES, | NC. NO
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS NO

BI D
BI D
Bl D
BED
B D
Bl D
BI D
B D
Bl D

.15

Bl D

BI D

BI D
Bt D

%

1/ 13/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL, 1NC

LOWEID TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY,

96.
98.
86.
98.
96.
96.

55.
55.
65,
B5.
55.
5.
55.
55,
Bb.
bb,
55,
55,

55.
LLC

10.
10.

¢lele
000
000
000
000
Coo

000
el
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000
000

Q00
CCo



0085- 010- 14

PRI CE

ALl AMER! CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES

UNI TED SALES USA CORP

CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOVELL, 1NC

SPRUCE 1| NDUSTRI ES

| NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP.

ALL CLEAN JAN!I TOR! AL SUPPLY CO 90. 00
SAM TELL & SON

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

3 Cs DECK BRUSH
MB AND COWMPANI ES, | NC
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 53. 16
ALL AMER]I CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL. POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, 1NC

SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

52.34

| NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CCRP.

ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 38. 56
SAM TELL & SON 40. 68
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC

TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

BI DS BY | TEM

ANOUNT
NO BiD
NO BI D
NO BI D
NO BI D
NC BID
NC BID
NO BI D

800. 00
NO BI D
NO BID

§00. co
NO BID

159. 48
NC B! D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID

167.02
NC BI D
NG BiD

115. 68

122. 04
NO BID
NO BID

%

113/ 14

PAGE
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10, 000
10. 000
10. 000
10. 000
10. 000
1G. 000
10. 000
10. 000
10. 000
10. 000

10. 000
LOWRBID TIE BID

3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000
3. 000

3. 000
LOWBID ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO



0085- 010- 14

2 Cs STREET BRUSH
MB AND CONPANI ES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHOCL PRODUCTS
ALL ANERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, INC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JAN!I TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |INC
TSP MAl NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

2 Cs SCRUB BRUSH
VB AND COMPANI ES, 1 NC.
FYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL ANER] CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON
MADSEN & HOWVELL, INC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
| NTERBORD PACKAGE NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON

BI DS BY { TEM

PRI CE

41.10
47.88

76. 25

44,92
34.08

12.72

18. 36

33. 64
41. 88

ANMDUNT
g2 20
95.78
NO Bi D
NO Bi D
NO Bl D
NO BID

152. 60
NO BID
NO BID
89. 84
68. 16
NC Bl D
NG BI D
25. 44
NC Bl D
NO BID
NO Bt D
NO BI D
NO BID
36.72
NO BID
NO BID
67. 28
83. 76

%

1713/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBID SAM TELL & SON

PN NN N RN N NN N

. 000

000
000
000
000
€00
000
000

. 000
. 000

000

- 000
. 000

. 00

000
000
000

. 000
. o0

000
Q00
000

. 000
. 000



0085- 010- 14

DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, I NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LIC

10 PK ANGLE BROOM
M8 AND COMPANEES, | NC.
PYRAM D SCHCOL PRODUCTS
ALl ANERI CAN POLY
JOHN DEERE L ANDSCAFPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL PCLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOWELL, [NC
SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES
I NTERBORO PACKAG| NG CORP.
ALL CLEAN JAM TORI AL SUPPLY CO
SAM TELL & SON
DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC
TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC

6 CS POVDER/ ABRASI VE CLEANER

M8 AND COMPANIES, | NC
PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
ALL AMER!I CAN POLY

JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES
UNI TED SALES USA CORP
CENTRAL POLY CORPORATI ON
MADSEN & HOMELL, {NC

BI DS BY | TEM

PRI CE

20.00
27.98

27.93

26. 88
42. 48

45. 60
30. 47

29.03

ANMDUNT %
NO BI D
NC BI D

200. 00

279. 60
NO BI D
NO BID
NO BI D
NO BID

27%. 30
NO BI D
NG Bi D

268. 80

424, 80
NO BI D
NC B D

273. 60

182. 82
NO BI D
NO BI B
NO BID
NG Bl D

174.18

1713/ 14

PAGE
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LOWBID MB AND CONPANI £S,

LOWSBID NB AND CONPANI ES,

I NC.

[ NC.

10.
10,
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.
10.

. 000
. 0OC

000
000
000
000
0C0
000
ele)
0oC
Co0o
000
000
000
000

. 000
. 000

000

. 000
. 00C
. 000
. Q00



0085-010- 14 BI DS BY I TEM 113714 PAGE 27

PRI CE ANDUNT %
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRi ES NO BID 6. 000
53585 | NTERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO 81D 6. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 35. 24 211. 44 6. 000
54944  SAM TELL & SON NO BI D 6. 000
56161 DASH MED! CAL GLOVES, 1INC NO Bi D 6. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO B D 6. 000
............................................................................................ LOWBI D MADSEN & HOVELL, INC
047 40 CS DI SINFECTANT AEROSOL SPRAY
02854 MB AND COMPANEES, | NC. NO BI D 40. 000
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 22. 22 888. 80 40. 000
09640  ALL AMERI CAN POLY NO BID 40. 000
33546 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NO BI D 40. 000
38567 UNI TED SALES USA CORP 50. 00 2, 00C. 00 40. 000
43057 CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NO BI D : 40, 000
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, | NC 50. 50 2,020.00 40. 000
51935 SPRUCE 1 NDUSTR! ES 22, 24 889. 80 40. 000
53585 | NTERBORC PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D 40. 000
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORIi AL SUPPLY CO 56. 00 2, 240. 00 40, 0G0
54944  SAM TELL & SON _ NO Bt D 40, 000
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, INC NO BI D 40. 000
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D 40. 000
............................................................................................ LOW BI D, PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS
048 30 EA  REPLACEMENT STEEL SPONGE MOP HEAD
02854 MB AND COMPANIES, | NC. NO BI D 30. 000
09616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS NO BI D 30. 000

09840 ALL ANMERI CAN POLY NO BI D 36. 000



0085-010- 14 BI DS BY | TEM 1/13/ 14 PAGE
PRI CE AMDUNT %
33546 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC Bi D
38567 UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO BI D
43067 CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NO BI D
50967 MADSEN & HOVELL, INC 12.25 367. 50
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTR! ES NO Bl D
53585 I NTERBORO PACKAG! NG CORP, NO BI D
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 16, 22 456. 60 *
54944 SAM TELL & SON 12.78 383. 40
56161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, | NC NO BI D
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BI D
049 10 Cs FURN! TURE POL| SH
02854 MB AND COMPANI ES, | NC, NC BI D
08616 PYRAM D SCHOOL PRODUCTS 26, 59 265. 90
098640 ALL ANERI CAN POLY NO BI B
33546 JOHN DEERE LANDSCAPES NC BI D
38567 UNI TED SALES USA CORP NO Bi D
43067 CENTRAL POLY CORPORAT! ON NO BID
50987 MADSEN & HOWVELL, {NC 34. 93 349. 30
51935 SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES 25.96 259, 80
53585 I NFERBORO PACKAGI NG CORP. NO BI D
53961 ALL CLEAN JANI TORI AL SUPPLY CO 31.12 311. 20
54944 SAM TELL & SON NO BiD
B6161 DASH MEDI CAL GLOVES, |NC NO Bi D
56833 TSP MAI NTENANCE SUPPLY, LLC NO BID

28

LOWBID MADSEN & HOVELL,

LOWBID SPRUCE | NDUSTRI ES

I NC

30.
30.
30,
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.
30.

10.
10.
10,
10,
10.
10.
10,
10.
10C.
10.
10.
10,
10.

Goo
000
000
coo
000
000
000
000
000
coo

Coo
000
000
tely
Q00
000
000
000
000
000
000
000G
000
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PRI CE ANDUNT %o



