

COUNTY OF MONMOUTH  
STATE OF NEW JERSEY

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 F-44-2022

**INCLUDES:**

- |                                    |                                    |
|------------------------------------|------------------------------------|
| NOTICE TO BIDDERS                  | NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT            |
| GENERAL CONDITIONS                 | ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGMENT            |
| EEO LANGUAGE                       | BID DOCUMENT CHECKLIST             |
| EEO QUESTIONNAIRE                  | REQUEST FOR BID                    |
| BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIREMENTS | ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS (if any) |
| STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP             | SIGNATURE PAGE                     |
| IRAN DISCLOSURE FORM               | ANTI-DISCRIMINATION IN EMPLOYMENT  |
| AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT    |                                    |

AUTHORIZED: May 13, 2021

ADVERTISED: December 2, 2021

**THOMAS A. ARNONE**  
DIRECTOR OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

**MARION MASNICK**  
CLERK OF THE BOARD

**TERI O'CONNOR**  
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

**HELEN P. FIORE**  
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

NAME OF BIDDER: W.B. Mason Co. Inc.

ADDRESS: 300 Prospect Plains Rd.

Cranbury, NJ 08512

Phone: 888-926-2766 Fax: 888-926-4183

**PLEASE INCLUDE ONE (1) UNBOUND ORIGINAL BID WITH SIGNATURE(S) AND TWO COPIES**

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

RFB must be received no later than: December 15, 2021 10:30AM

For Delivery to: Various Delivery Locations. See Details Below.

Delivery Date: 1/1/2022 - 12/31/2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
<b>CLEANERS, DRAIN OPENERS, STAIN REMOVERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE</b>				
1	ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, FANTASTIC 32 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 32 OZ BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>FANTASTIK</u> Product No: <u>SJN311836</u> Variances, if any: _____	9,600 OZ	<u>\$.0887</u>	<u>\$851.52</u>
2	ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, REFILL - NO SPRAYER, FANTASTIC 64 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 1 GALLON BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>FANTASTIK</u> Product No: <u>SJN682269</u> Variances, if any: <u>1 GALLON BOTTLE (128 OZ)</u>	3,840 OZ	<u>\$.0471</u>	<u>\$180.864</u>
3	LYSOL TOILET BOWL CLEANER, PLASTIC BOTTLE 24 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 24 OZ BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>LYSOL</u> Product No: <u>RAC98012</u> Variances, if any: _____	43,200 OZ	<u>\$.1299</u>	<u>\$5,611.68</u>
4	GLASS CLEANER WITH AMMONIA D - PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, WINDEX ORIGINAL 32 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 32 OZ BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WINDEX</u> Product No: <u>SJN687374</u> Variances, if any: _____	95,856 OZ	<u>\$.1765</u>	<u>\$16,918.584</u>
6	FOAM GLASS CLEANER, AEROSOL CANS, WINDEX BOMB 20 OZ.	16,800 OZ	<u>\$.2211</u>	<u>\$3,714.48</u>



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>EACH, 19 OZ CAN</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WEIMAN</u> Product No: <u>WNM10</u> Variances, if any: <u>19 OZ CAN</u>			
9	HEAVY DUTY CLEANER AND DEGREASER, LIQUID LIGHTNING 1 GAL.  Packaging: <u>CASE, 4 GALLONS PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL106129</u> Variances, if any: <u>CASE OF 4 GALLONS</u>	120 GAL(S)	\$5.45	\$654.00
10	MULTIPURPOSE CLEANER - NON AEROSOL, SPRAY KLEEN 32 OZ.  Packaging: <u>CASE, 4 GALLONS PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL066529</u> Variances, if any: <u>CASE OF 4 GALLONS</u>	13,824 OZ	\$0.0544	\$752.0256
11	ALL PURPOSE POWDER CLEANSER, COMET, LEMON, - PLASTIC CONTAINERS ONLY 17 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 21 OZ CANISTER</u> MFG/Brand: <u>COMET</u> Product No: <u>PGC32987EA</u> Variances, if any: <u>21 OZ CANISTER</u>	6,732 OZ	\$0.1031	\$694.07
12	ALL PURPOSE AND GLASS DISINFECTANT (LIQUID), PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, SPIC & SPAN 32 OZ.  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 8 32 OZ BOTTLES PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>SPIC AND SPAN</u> Product No: <u>PGC058775</u> Variances, if any: <u>CARTON OF 8 32 OZ BOTTLES</u>	43,200 OZ	\$0.1981	\$8,557.92
13	DRAIN OPENER, PROFESSIONAL STRENGTH, LIQUID PLUMBER 64 OZ.	11,520 OZ	\$0.0699	\$804.71



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>ETOH, 32 OZ BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL176045EA</u> Variances, if any: <u>32 OZ BOTTLE</u>			
14	NON-CAUSTIC DRAIN OPENER/CLEANER 64 OZ.	11,520 OZ	\$0.1680	\$1,935.36
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 32 OZ BOTTLES PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ZEP</u> Product No: <u>AMR02701CT</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 32 OZ BOTTLES</u>			
15	BLEACH, CLOROX 1 GAL.	660 GAL(S)	\$2.94	\$1,946.34
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 6 GALLONS PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>PURE BRIGHT</u> Product No: <u>KIK11008635042</u> Variances, if any: <u>6 GALLONS PER CARTON</u>			
16	STAIN & ODOR REMOVER, CLEAN & FRESH 20 OZ.	3,600 OZ	\$0.0945	\$340.20
	Packaging: <u>CASE, 12 32 OZ BOTTLES PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL182136</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 32 OZ BOTTLES PER CASE</u>			
17	LIQUID DISH WASHING DETERGENT, DAWN 64 OZ.	3,072 OZ	\$0.1326	\$407.35
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 4 GALLONS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>DAWN</u> Product No: <u>PG057445CT</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 GALLON BOTTLES PER CT</u>			
18	FURNITURE POLISH, PLEDGE, NO LEMON OIL 19 OZ.	2,250 OZ	\$0.1969	\$443.03

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>  EACH, 19 OZ CAN  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  BOARDWALK  </u> Product No: <u>  BWK346AEA  </u> Variances, if any: _____			
19	ALUMINUM & STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, CAMEO POWDER 17 OZ.	1,224 OZ	/	NO BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
20	STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER/POLISH 16 OZ	1,536 OZ	\$0.1638	\$251.60
	Packaging: <u>  CASE, 12 18OZ CANS PER CASE  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL2006  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  12 18OZ CANS PER CASE  </u>			
21	MULTI SURFACE CLEANER, PINE-SOL 40 OZ.	51,200 OZ	\$0.1879	\$9620.48
	Packaging: <u>  CASE  </u> <u>  4 GALLONS PER CASE  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL407235  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  4 GALLONS PER CASE  </u>			
<b>SOAPS - PERSONAL USE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE</b>				
23	PERSONAL SIZE BAR SOAP, IVORY 3.5 OZ.	1,505 OZ	\$0.1761	\$265.03
	Packaging: <u>  CARTON, 72 3.1OZ BARS per CT  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  IVORY  </u> Product No: <u>  PGC12364  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  72 3.1OZ BARS per CT  </u>			
24	HAND CLEANER, GO-JO 14 OZ.	2,520 OZ	\$0.2756	\$694.51

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>EACH, 14 OZ BOTTLE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>GOJO</u> Product No: <u>GOJD95712EA</u> Variances, if any: _____			
25	HAND CLEANER, GO-JO 72 OZ.	8,640 OZ	\$0.2316	\$2001.02
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 6 4.5LB PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>GOJO</u> Product No: <u>GOJ111506</u> Variances, if any: <u>6 4.5LB PER CARTON</u>			
26	POWDERED HAND SOAP, BORAXO 12 OZ.	11,520 OZ	\$0.0906	\$1043.71
	Packaging: <u>EACH, 5 LB BOX</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BORAXO</u> Product No: <u>DIA02561EA</u> Variances, if any: <u>5LB BOX</u>			
<b>DISPENSERS AND REFILLS - SOAPS AND SANITIZERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE</b>				
27	LOTION CLEANER REFILL, SANI-FRESH 800 ML.	1,152,000 ML(S)		NO BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
28	SANI-FRESH DISPENSERS, #798015	72 EACH		NO BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
				NO BID



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
30	HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER - X3 FOAM SANITIZER DISPENSER (#10080) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	6 EACH		NO BID
31	HAND SANITIZER CARTRIDGE - X3 FOAM SANITIZER REFILLABLE CARTRIDGE (#10070) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	6 EACH		NO BID
32	HAND SANITIZER FOAM - ALCOHOL FREE, X3 FOAM SANITIZER, (#10004) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1 GALLON/128 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	1,536 OZ		NO BID
34	BACTERIOSTATIC LOTION HAND SOAP MUST FIT DIAL DISPENSER 1 GALLON/128 OZ. Packaging: <u>CASE, 6 1,000ML PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL044657</u> Variances, if any: <u>6 1,000 ML PER CASE, REQUIRES FREE DISPENSER CHANGE</u>	15,360 OZ	\$0.1535	\$2,357.76

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
37	VERTICAL LIQUID SOAP DISPENSER, STAINLESS STEEL, TAMPER/THEFT PROOF, TOP FILL WITH SERVICE KEY, 40 OZ CAPACITY, 4-7/8"W X 2-11/16"D X 8-3/16"H * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      BOBRICK      </u> Product No: <u>      BOB 2112      </u> Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH	\$46.3412	\$556.09
38	ANTIBACTERIAL SOAP, 1 GALLON REFILL * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1 GALLON Packaging: <u>      GALLON      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      NCL      </u> Product No: <u>      NCL0415296L      </u> Variances, if any: _____	96 GAL(S)	\$11.2647	\$1,081.41
39	D-LEAD HONEY ALMOND LIQUID HAND SOAP, 1 GALLON, #4222ES-4 1 GAL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		NO BID
40	ANTIBACTERIAL ULTRA MILD SOAP WITHOUT FORMALDEHYDE, NATURAL BASED, GO-JO 800 ML Packaging: <u>      CARTRON, 12 800ML Per CT      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      GOSO      </u> Product No: <u>      GOS921212CT      </u> Variances, if any: <u>      12 800ML Per CT      </u>	48,000 ML(S)	\$0.0109	\$523.20

CLOTHS, TOWELS, TOLIET TISSUE, DISPENSERS AND RAGS



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
41	WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON 100 LBS.  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 25LBS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>TEXTILE WASTE COMPANY</u> Product No: <u>TWY219D176</u> Variances, if any: <u>25LBS CARTON</u>	1,750 LB(S)	\$2.2353	\$3,911.78
43	TERRY BAR RAGS, WHITE, 15" X 18", SEWN ON FOUR SIDES * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 25 LB. BAGS, (190-200 CLOTHS/BAG) Packaging: <u>CARTON, 25 LBS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>HOSPECO</u> Product No: <u>HOS53725</u> Variances, if any: _____	125 LB(S)	\$30.8329	\$3,854.11
44	RECLAIMED POLO WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON ONLY - NO EXCEPTIONS  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 25 LBS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>HOSPECO</u> Product No: <u>HOS45525BP</u> Variances, if any: _____	2,500 LB(S)	\$2.9835	\$7,458.75
45	TREATED NON-WOVEN DUSTING CLOTHS, 24" X 24", GOLDEN DUSTERS 50 RAGS  Packaging: <u>CASE OF 100 RAGS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>HOSPECO</u> Product No: <u>HOSNDSHFY2</u> Variances, if any: <u>CASE OF 100 RAGS</u>	5,000 EACH	\$0.2094	\$1,047.00
46	2 PLY TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, SCOTT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 500 SHEETS/ROLL	80,768 ROLL(S)	\$0.3529	\$28,503.03



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 96 ROLLS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ATLAS</u> Product No: <u>ALM275</u> Variances, if any: <u>96 ROLLS PER CT</u>			
47	DISPENSER FOR TOILET TISSUE TO FIT ABOVE ITEM	50 EACH	\$15.5647	\$778.24
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>SAN JAMAR</u> Product No: <u>STM200XC</u> Variances, if any: _____			
48	1 PLY TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, SCOTT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1,000 SHEETS/ROLL Packaging: <u>CARTON, 96 RLS PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ATLAS</u> Product No: <u>ALM15</u> Variances, if any: <u>CARTON 96 RLS PER CARTON,</u>	57,600 ROLL(S)	\$0.3873	\$27308.48
49	2 PLY JUMBO ROLL TOILET TISSUE, SCOTT JUMBO JR. 1000 FT /ROLL Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 ROLLS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ATLAS</u> Product No: <u>ALM700</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 RLS PER CARTON</u>	15,000,000 FT	\$0.0019	\$28500.00
50	DISPENSERS TO FIT JUMBO TOILET TISSUE ROLLS Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>SOFIDEL</u> Product No: <u>HVN410304</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 EACH	\$11.0824	\$554.12
51	PLY FOLD TOWELS, WHITE, ABSORBENCY RATE 20 SCC. PER .1CC WATER, MUST FIT BAY WEST DISPENSERS 4000 SHEETS	24,000 SHEET(S)	\$0.0043	\$105.20

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 4,000 SHEETS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>MARCAL</u> Product No: <u>MRCP200B</u> Variances, if any: _____			
52	ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL FOLDED TOWELS, NATURAL WHITE, 9.125" X 9.5", RENOWN LABEL BY BAY WEST (# REN06116-WB) 4000 SHEETS Packaging: <u>CARTON, 4,000 SHEETS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>MARCAL</u> Product No: <u>MRCP200N</u> Variances, if any: _____	500,000 SHEET(S)	\$0.0039	\$1,950.00
53	BAY WEST DISPENSER TO FIT PLY FOLD AND ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL FOLDED TOWELS Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>GEN</u> Product No: <u>GEN1608</u> Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH	\$16.8353	\$404.05
54	ROLL TOWELS, WHITE, ABSORBENCY RATE 13 SCC PER .1CC WATER, MUST FIT BAY WEST DISPENSERS 630 FT/ROLL Packaging: <u>CARTON, 6 RLS PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>TORK</u> Product No: <u>TRK8031600</u> Variances, if any: <u>6 RLS PER CARTON</u>	347,760 FT	\$0.0174	\$6051.02
55	ECOSOFTGREEN SEAL ROLL TOWELS, NATURAL WHITE, (#BWP46200) 350 FT/ROLL Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 RLS PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>MARCAL</u> Product No: <u>MRCP120N</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 RLS PER CARTON</u>	6,120,000 FT	\$0.0038	\$23,256.00
56	BAY WEST LEVER ROLL TOWEL DISPENSER, TO FIT ITEMS 61 & 62	24 EACH	\$47.4700	\$1139.29



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      GEORGIA PACIFIC      </u> Product No: <u>      GPC54338A      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
57	C-FOLD PAPER TOWELS, WHITE, SIZE 11"L X 9.625"W, ABSORBENCY RATE 80-120 SEC TESTED WITH 0.1 ML ON 1 PLY, 100% RECYCLED CONTENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 200 SHEETS/PK	1,664,000 SHEET(S)		
	Packaging: <u>      CARTON, 2400 SHEETS PER CARTON      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      MARCAL      </u> Product No: <u>      MRC-P100B      </u> Variances, if any: <u>      CARTON OF 2400 SHEETS      </u>			\$0.0066 \$10,982.40
58	GEORGIA PACIFIC VISTA ROLL TOWEL DISPENSER, (#GEP 54338)	50 EACH		
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      GEORGIA PACIFIC      </u> Product No: <u>      GPC54338A      </u> Variances, if any: _____			\$47.4706 \$2373.53
FLOOR AND CARPET CARE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE				
60	FLOOR SWEEPING COMPOUND, WAX BASE 75 LBS./DRUM	300 LB(S)		
	Packaging: <u>      CARTON, 100 LBS      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      BOARDWALK      </u> Product No: <u>      BWK W4 COHO      </u> Variances, if any: <u>      100 LBS CARTON      </u>			\$0.5466 \$163.98
61	FLOOR WAX 55 GALS./DRUM	165 GAL(S)		
	Packaging: <u>      DRUM, 55 GALLONS      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      NCL      </u> Product No: <u>      NCL050232      </u> Variances, if any: _____			\$8.2694 \$1364.45



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
62	DEWAXER 55 GALS./DRUM  Packaging: <u>DRUM, 55 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL105118</u> Variances, if any: _____	165 GAL(S)	\$10.6023	\$1,749.38
63	HEAVY DUTY RUG SHAMPOO FOR WATER EXTRACTION MACHINES, CARPET MAGIC 64 OZ.  Packaging: <u>GALLON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL67529</u> Variances, if any: <u>GALLON</u>	4,096 OZ	\$0.0533	\$218.32
64	SPRAY BUFF 1 GAL.  Packaging: <u>CASE, 4 GALLONS PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL250129</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 GALLONS PER CASE</u>	30 GAL(S)	\$26.2443	\$787.33
65	DEFOAMER 1 GAL.  Packaging: <u>CASE, 4 GALLONS PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL65029</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 GALLONS PER CASE</u>	30 GAL(S)	\$10.2443	\$307.33
66	FLOOR STRIPPER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: NO RINSE FLOOR STRIPPER #FS409-55 OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM	5 DRUM(S)	\$868.750	\$4343.75



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>DRUM, 55 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL106918</u> Variances, if any: _____			
67	FLOOR FINISHER/WAX, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: ULTRAGLOSS WET LOOK FINISH #FW-120-55 OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: <u>DRUM, 55 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL050232</u> Variances, if any: _____	8 DRUM(S)		\$454.818 \$3638.55
68	FLOOR CLEANER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: CHEM-TEK NEUTRA-KLEEN DIAMOND SHINE PLUS FLOOR CLEANER #SB-351OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: <u>DRUM, 55 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL093518</u> Variances, if any: _____	3 DRUM(S)		\$182.284 \$546.85
69	SCOLX X-FACTOR FLOOR FINISH, #SFXFACT 5 GAL/PAIL Packaging: <u>EACH, 5 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL51021</u> Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		\$12.8045 \$1280.45



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
70	SCOLES LIFT OFF FLOOR FINISHER, #SFLIFTOF05 5 GAL/PAIL  Packaging: <u>EACH, 5 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL052121</u> Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)	\$10.0409	\$1004.09
71	SCOLES BLUE CONCENTRATE, HEAVY DUTY NO RINSE CLEANER, #ESBLUE5 5 GAL/PAIL  Packaging: <u>EACH, 5 GALLONS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL93521</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 GAL(S)	\$4.9545	\$247.73
72	SCOLES GREEN CLEAN #SGREENG 1 GAL  Packaging: <u>CASE, 4 GALLONS PER CASE</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL404829</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 GALLONS PER CASE</u>	50 GAL(S)	\$2.0511	\$102.56
<b>FLOOR PADS: STRIPPING, BUFFING, BURNISHING, CLEANING</b>				
74	BUFFER PAD, AC, WHITE, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM410020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$2.6024	\$130.12
75	BUFFER PAD, AC, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM720020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$2.6776	\$133.88

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
76	BUFFER PAD, AC, RED, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM510020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$3.4635	\$173.18
78	STRIPPING PAD, 3M, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM720020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$2.7741	\$138.71
81	QUICK STRIP STRIPPING PADS, 20" DIAMETER (#HP20) 5/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM740020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$3.4635	\$173.18
83	NATURAL HAIR BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCED FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM350020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	20 PAD(S)	\$2.7741	\$55.48
84	HEAVY BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON / 3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM740020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)	\$3.4635	\$173.18



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
85	LIGHT BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, WHITE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON   3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM330020WB</u> Variances, if any: _____	100 PAD(S)	\$2.7741	\$277.41
86	SURFACE PREPARATION PAD, 14" X 20", MAROON * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: <u>CARTON, 5 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ACS</u> Product No: <u>ACS531420</u> Variances, if any: _____	40 PAD(S)	\$3.2071	\$128.28
89	SCRUBBING PAD, 14" X 20", RED * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: <u>CARTON, 10 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>WB MASON   3M</u> Product No: <u>WBM510020X14WB</u> Variances, if any: <u>10 PADS PER CT</u>	40 PAD(S)	\$2.4859	\$99.44
90	SWIVEL PAD, SUPER DUTY, BLACK, 4.5" X 10" (#FUP05) 5 PADS/BAG Packaging: <u>CARTON, 40 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>3M</u> Product No: <u>mmm05241</u> Variances, if any: <u>40 PADS PER CT</u>	100 PAD(S)	\$2.3415	\$234.15
91	SWIVEL PAD THREADED HOLDER (#FUP200T)	10 EACH	\$7.5647	\$75.65

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing  
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
1 East Main Street  
Freehold, NJ 07728  
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      BOARDWALK      </u> Product No: <u>      BWK 00405EA      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
<b>CLEANING AIDS: BRUSHES, BROOMS, MOPS, BUCKETS, PLUNGERS, DUSTERS, SQUEEGEES, SPONGES, LITTER STICKS</b>				
92	BOWL BRUSH, WOODEN HANDLE (TAMPICO #09-0436)	72 EACH	\$3.3765	\$243.11
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      BOARDWALK      </u> Product No: <u>      BWK 6217      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
93	TOILET BOWL BRUSH, ONE PIECE, SYNTHETIC BRISTLES, WHITE, PLASTIC HANDLE ONLY (NORSHEL #N-82) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	120 EACH	\$1.9765	\$237.18
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      RUBBERMAID      </u> Product No: <u>      RCP 631000WE      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
94	POT BRUSH, HEAVY DUTY WITH HANDLE WITH FOAM BLOCK (HOLCOMBE)	25 EACH	\$4.20	\$105.00
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      WINCO      </u> Product No: <u>      WNC BRP10      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
95	12" DECK BRUSH WITH HANDLE AND FOAM BLOCK	24 EACH	\$5.29	\$126.96
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			

# County of Monmouth



RFB# F-44-2022

## REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

### FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
96	DECK BRUSH HEAD- 10" FOAM BLOCK WITH THREADED HANDLE HOLE - SPLIT BRUSH SHAPE, STRAIGHT AND ANGLED MULTILEVEL BRISTLES, LONG LASTING BLUE POLYPROPYLENE FIBERS, STAIN RESISTANT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	60 EACH		No Bid
97	8" LONG COUNTER BRUSH WITH HANDLE, PLASTIC HORSEHAIR BLEND, 2.13" BRISTLE TRIM Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARD WALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK5208</u> Variances, if any: _____	25 EACH	\$5.28	\$132.
98	DUST BRUSH, BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLE, 8" FACE WITH 4" HANDLE, ALL ONE PIECE PLASTIC AND A HANGING HOLE ON THE HANDLE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	60 EACH		NO BID
99	12" TOILET BOWL MOP, PLASTIC HANDLE Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>IMPACT</u> Product No: <u>IMP204</u> Variances, if any: _____	100 EACH	\$0.71	\$71.00

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing  
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
1 East Main Street  
Freehold, NJ 07728  
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
100	PLUNGERS, TOILET, LARGE  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>IMPACT</u> Product No: <u>IMP9201</u> Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH	\$3.88	\$38.80
101	17" TOILET PLUNGER - ALL PLASTIC HANDLE WITH RUBBER END, BLACK, LARGE CUP SIZE - THREADED HANDLE  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWL09201EA</u> Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH	\$4.69	\$46.90
102	16" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM WITH HANDLE, 5 ROWS NATURAL BASS FIBER, 6-1/4" TRIM  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWL71160</u> Variances, if any: _____	70 EACH	\$10.09	\$706.30
104	24" GARAGE SWEEPER WITH HANDLE (DBQ) (PALMYRA #10703)  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWL73160</u> Variances, if any: _____	48 EACH	\$13.27	\$636.96
105	#8 CORN BROOM  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP6373BRD</u> Variances, if any: _____	36 EACH	\$6.15	\$221.40
107	14" ANGLE BROOM, 100% POLY PROPYLENE ONLY (BRISTLE GIANT, QUICKIE #735)  Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	15 EACH	\$16.28	\$244.20

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      RUBBERMAID      </u> Product No: <u>      RCP6356RA      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
108	18" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM HEAD, FOAM PLASTIC BLOCK WITH 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES, COURSE BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES	72 EACH	\$13.28	\$956.16
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      BOREDWALK      </u> Product No: <u>      BWK73160      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
109	LOBBY BROOM, BRISTLE - POLYPROPYLENE FILL, 7.5" L X 2" W X 35" H, BLACK	25 EACH	\$5.38	\$134.50
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      RUBBERMAID      </u> Product No: <u>      RCP637400BLA      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
110	12" HEAVY DUTY DUST PAN, 20 GAUGE STEEL, BEVELED EDGE	24 EACH	\$3.99	\$95.76
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      IMPACT      </u> Product No: <u>      IMP4212      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
111	LOBBY PRO DUST PAN WITH UPRIGHT 30" LONG HANDLE AND 12" WIDE DUST BIN	24 EACH	\$14.82	\$355.68
	Packaging: <u>      EACH      </u> MFG/Brand: <u>      RUBBERMAID      </u> Product No: <u>      RCP253100BK      </u> Variances, if any: _____			
112	12" DUST PAN, HAND HELD, ALL PLASTIC WITH NO METAL, WITH HANDLE HOLE (RUBBERMAID TYPE OR EQUIVALENT)	12 EACH	\$1.65	\$19.80



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>CONTINENTAL</u> Product No: <u>COCP 712BK</u> Variances, if any: _____			
113	24" PUSH BROOM HEAD, FINE/MEDIUM BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES, STRUCTURAL FOAM PLASTIC BLOCK, 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP 204004R</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	\$23.69	\$1075.08
114	60" WOOD BROOM HANDLES, 1-1/8" DIAMETER, TAPERED Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 122</u> Variances, if any: _____	48 EACH	\$2.46	\$118.08
115	60" BROOM HANDLES, METAL THREAD, PUSH BROOM THREADED Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 136</u> Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH	\$3.29	\$78.96
116	24" DUSTLESS MOPS, COMPLETE (DURALON) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK HL245BSPC</u> Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH	\$34.19	\$410.28

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
117	24" DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS	24 EACH	\$6.66	\$159.84
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>INSCO</u> Product No: <u>BBP170224</u> Variances, if any: _____			
119	DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS, 36" X 5", SYNTHETIC GREEN, OPEN LOOP, LINT FREE COTTON * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	48 EACH	\$7.65	\$367.20
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK1636</u> Variances, if any: _____			
120	DUSTLESS MOP FRAME, 36" X 5" METAL WIRE FRAME, RUST RESISTANT AND POWDER COAT PAINTED WITH SWIVEL SNAP-TO HANDLE	10 EACH	\$5.31	\$53.10
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK1436</u> Variances, if any: _____			
121	60" THREADED HANDLE - 1" DIAMETER, YELLOW FIBERGLASS, MESH-VEILED TO PREVENT SPLINTERING WITH SUPER TOUGH BLACK NYLON PLASTIC STANDARD THREAD END * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	216 EACH	\$10.28	\$2220.48
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK636</u> Variances, if any: _____			
122	60" MOP HANDLE, 1" DIAMETER, FIBERGLASS, LATCH STYLE, QUICK CHANGE, HIGH IMPACT PLASTIC HEAD (SNAP-N-GO)	10 EACH	\$6.99	\$69.90



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 620</u> Variances, if any: _____			
123	MOP HEADS, 24 OZ., 8 PLY, RAYON, CLOSED LOOP	150 EACH	\$6.4059	\$960.89
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 MOP HEADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ABCO</u> Product No: <u>ABOCLM203LCSWB</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 MOP HEADS PER CT</u>			
124	MOP HANDLES FOR 24 OZ. MOP HEAD, WHITE	24 EACH	\$7.58	\$181.92
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 610</u> Variances, if any: _____			
125	MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CLOSED LOOP * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	1,872 EACH	\$4.4922	\$8409.46
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 MOP HEADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ABCO</u> Product No: <u>ABOCLM303LWB20</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 MOP HEADS PER CT</u>			
126	MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CUT END	144 EACH	\$4.5216	\$651.11
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ABCO</u> Product No: <u>ABOCLM31020</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 PER CARTON</u>			



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
127	WAX MOP HEAD, 24 OZ, 1" HEAD BAND, LOOPED END, RAYON, BLUE/WHITE STRIPED, 4-PLY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>CARTON, 12 PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>ABCO</u> Product No: <u>ABOLM203LCS</u> Variances, if any: <u>12 PER CARTON</u>	144 EACH	\$5.6931	\$819.81
128	DUST BRUSHER (FOXTAILS) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWL13FD</u> Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH	\$7.21	\$173.04
129	LAMBS WOOL DUSTER, TELESCOPIC, EXTENDS 33" - 60" Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>IMPACT</u> Product No: <u>IMP3106</u> Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH	\$9.05	\$108.60
130	PLASTIC POLYWOOL DUSTER - BRIGHT, MULTICOLOR SYNTHETIC, FLEXIBLE POSITIONING HEAD, TELESCOPIC HANDLE Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWL9442</u> Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH	\$8.14	\$81.40
131	INSTITUTIONAL BUCKET AND WRINGER, 35 QUART BUCKET AND ONE PIECE FUNNEL SHAPED WRINGER, NON-SCUFFING WHEELS, ALL PLASTIC, NO HANDLE (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	12 EACH	\$46.94	\$563.28



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  CONTINENTAL  </u> Product No: <u>  C.DCP335312YW  </u> Variances, if any: _____			
132	MOP BUCKET, 3" CASTERS, 26 QT. (RUBBERMAID #6111 BRUTE)	20 EACH	\$58.75	\$1175.00
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
133	MOP BUCKET, 14 QT. (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	20 EACH	\$	No BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
134	DOWNWARD PRESSURE WRINGERS FOR 26 QT. BUCKET (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	10 EACH		No BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
135	24" PUSH AND PULL SQUEEGEE	12 EACH	\$20.32	\$243.84
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  UNGER  </u> Product No: <u>  UNGFEB00  </u> Variances, if any: _____			

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
137	8" BLACK RUBBER SQUEEGEE BLADE WITH ALL PLASTIC 20" HANDLE AND 8" SYNTHETIC SPONGE IN NYLON MESH FOR DURABILITY AND ABRASIVE SCRUBBING, TOOL MUST BE ALL PLASTIC NO METAL AND NO SCREWS * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BIRDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 824</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	\$3.45	\$248.40
138	20" FLOOR SQUEEGEE HEAD, ALL PLASTIC, SOLID ONE PIECE WITH THREADED END FOR HANDLE (CARLSILE #3656703) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNG HM 30K</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	\$59.59	\$4290.48
140	6 GALLON WINDOW CLEANING BUCKET TO ACCOMMODATE 18" WASHERS AND SQUEEGEES (UNGER PRO BUCKET) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNG QB 220</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	\$49.28	\$98.56
141	13' TELESCOPING POLE - 2-SECTIONS (#PPM-UNGEZ400 UNGER) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNG E245D</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	\$53.35	\$106.70



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
142	VISA VERSA SQUEEGEE WITH 18" STRIP WASHER (#PPM-UNGVP45 UNGER)  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNGVP450</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	\$41.45	\$82.90
143	STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGE HANDLE WITH RUBBER GRIP (UNGER PRO #PPM-UNGPR00)  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNGPR00</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	\$11.13	\$22.26
144	18" STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGEE (UNGER PRO #PPM-UNGPR45)  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNGPR45</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	\$20.19	\$40.38
145	SPONGES, 4" X 6" X 2"  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 24 PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK CS2</u> Variances, if any: <u>24 SPONGES PER CT</u>	264 EACH	\$1.0157	\$268.14
146	SCRUBBER SPONGES, SCRUBBER ON ONE SIDE AND SPONGE ON OTHER, 3" X 6" (S.O.S.) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 20 PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>BOARDWALK</u> Product No: <u>BWK 174</u> Variances, if any: <u>20 PER CARTON</u>	2,100 EACH	\$0.6382	\$1340.22



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
147	MAGIC ERASER BATHROOM SCRUBBER, 4-1/2" X 3-1/5" (PROCTER & GAMBLE) 2 EA/BOX  Packaging: <u>BOX, 4 per BOX</u> MFG/Brand: <u>MR CLEAN</u> Product No: <u>PGC 82038</u> Variances, if any: <u>4-3/5" X 2-2/5", 4 per BOX</u>	20 EACH	\$1.0157	\$20.31
148	SCOURING PADS, HEAVY DUTY, 6" X 3.85" (3M SCOTCH BRITE)  Packaging: <u>CARTON, 40 PADS PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>3M</u> Product No: <u>MMM34738</u> Variances, if any: <u>40 PDS PER CARTON</u>	110 PAD(S)	\$1.1294	\$124.23
149	ALUMINUM LITTER STICKS, 36" (PICS)  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>IMPACT</u> Product No: <u>IMP3706</u> Variances, if any: _____	100 EACH	\$31.36	\$3136.00
151	NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 36" REACH  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNGN900</u> Variances, if any: _____	36 EACH	\$27.29	\$982.44
152	NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 51" HANDLE  Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>UNGER</u> Product No: <u>UNGN140</u> Variances, if any: _____	25 EACH	\$43.54	\$1088.50

INSECT PESTICIDES AND RELATED ITEMS



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
153	ROACH AND ANT KILLER (BLACK FLAG) 20 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 17.5 OZ</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RAID</u> Product No: <u>SJN660549</u> Variances, if any: <u>17.5 OZ</u>	2,880 OZ	\$0.3234	\$931.39
154	HOUSE AND GARDEN SPRAY, MUST INCLUDE WASPS & HORNETS (JOHNSON'S RAID) 20 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 14 OZ</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RAID</u> Product No: <u>SJN668006</u> Variances, if any: <u>14 OZ</u>	4,080 OZ	\$0.3815	\$1556.52
155	FLYING INSECT SPRAY (RAID) 20 OZ.  Packaging: <u>EACH, 15 OZ</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RAID</u> Product No: <u>SJN 638602</u> Variances, if any: <u>15 OZ</u>	3,060 OZ	\$0.4878	\$1492.67
<b>PERSONAL HYGIENE ITEMS</b>				
156	PAPER TOILET SEAT COVERS (HANDY KLENZ 250T #74020250) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>CARTON, 2,500 PER CT.</u> MFG/Brand: <u>HOSPECO</u> Product No: <u>HOSHG2500CT</u> Variances, if any: <u>2,500 PER CT</u>	70 BOX(S)	\$2.8059	\$161.41
157	URINAL SCREENS (S.FREEDMAN AND SONS) 24 BLOCKS	1,680 EACH	\$1.2157	\$2042.38



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>DOZEN</u> MFG/Brand: <u>HOSPECO</u> Product No: <u>HOS01901</u> Variances, if any: <u>DOZEN</u>			
<b>MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES</b>				
158	LOOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT FOR PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, GREASES AND OTHER LIKE LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE WHEN USED WITH PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, MEETS OSHA STANDARDS (OIL-DRI) 36 LBS/32QT/BAG Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	26,800 LB(S)		NO BID
159	LOOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT, FOR PLANT-BASED OILS, ANTIFREEZE, COOLANTS AND OTHER LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE WHEN USED WITH PLANT-BASED OILS (PIG-DRI PLP213) 40 LBS./BAG Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	1,200 LB(S)		NO BID
160	ICE MELTING PELLETS 50 LB. BAGS Packaging: <u>BAG, 50 LBS</u> MFG/Brand: <u>KISSNER</u> Product No: <u>KISLAVAMELT</u> Variances, if any: _____	75,000 LB(S)	\$0.2421	\$18157.50
161	WET FLOOR SIGNS - YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 25" HIGH, 2 SIDED, FOLDING * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	48 EACH	\$10.68	\$512.64

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>    EACH    </u> MFG/Brand: <u>    RUBBERMAN    </u> Product No: <u>    RCP611277YWI    </u> Variances, if any: _____			
162	PLASTIC SYPHON DRUM PUMP, HEAVY DUTY, MUST FIT 55 GAL DRUM W/2" OPENING * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH		NO BID
163	32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH SPRAYER, CLEAR OR WHITE (EMPTY) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>    EACH    </u> MFG/Brand: <u>    CONTINENTAL    </u> Product No: <u>    TOL120125    </u> Variances, if any: _____	292 EACH	\$0.89	\$259.88
164	32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH SPRAYER, YELLOW (EMPTY) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH		NO BID
165	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: RED * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	250 EACH	\$0.54	\$135.00



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>TOLCO</u> Product No: <u>TDL110246</u> Variances, if any: _____			
166	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: GREEN * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	300 EACH		NO BID
167	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: BLUE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>TOLCO</u> Product No: <u>TDC 110242</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	\$0.54	\$38.88
168	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: WHITE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL 6804</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	\$0.71	\$51.12
169	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: YELLOW * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	72 EACH	\$	NO BID

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
170	WHITE FOAM COFFEE CUPS, 8 OZ. 1000/CASE	6,000 CUP(S)	\$0.0295	\$177.00
	Packaging: <u>CARTON, 1,000 PER CARTON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>DART</u> Product No: <u>DCE 810</u> Variances, if any: _____			
171	TWO-PLY POLY TWINE, 10 LB., NYLON	18 ROLL(S)		NO BID
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
<b>WASTE AND RECYCLING CONTAINERS</b>				
172	32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, GRAY (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	30 EACH	\$75.61	\$2,268.30
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP 863292GRA</u> Variances, if any: _____			
173	32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, WHITE (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	10 EACH	\$26.98	\$269.80
	Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP 2632WHI</u> Variances, if any: _____			



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
174	WASTE BASKETS, 14.25" X 10.5" X 15", BLACK, MUST BE FLAME RETARDANT (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH, 7 GALLON</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP254300BK</u> Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH	\$31.27	\$750.48
175	13 QT. WASTE BASKET (RUBBERMAID #2955-2) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP295500BK</u> Variances, if any: _____	75 EACH	\$5.07	\$380.25
176	28 1/2 QT. WASTE BASKET (RUBBERMAID #RCP2956) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP295600BK</u> Variances, if any: _____	75 EACH	\$6.02	\$451.5
177	20 GALLON WHEELED TRASH CAN WITH LID Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	20 EACH		No Bid
178	20 GALLON TRASH CAN WITH LID (RUBBERMAID #2620) Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP262000GRA</u> Variances, if any: _____	20 EACH	\$26.87	\$537.40

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
1 East Main Street  
Freehold, NJ 07728  
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
179	55 GALLON ROUND WASTE CONTAINER, GRAY, NO WHEELS, FLAME RETARDANT (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	32 EACH		NO BID
185	SANITARY TILT TRUCK - ERGONOMIC, CONTOURED STRUCTURAL FOAM BODY, 10" WHEELS, 450 LB. CAPACITY, BLACK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>EACH</u> MFG/Brand: <u>RUBBERMAID</u> Product No: <u>RCP9T13BLA</u> Variances, if any: _____	4 EACH	\$ 411.76	\$ 1,647.04
<b>ENVIROX BRAND PRODUCTS</b>				
187	ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117, SANITIZER/MIRUCIDE CLEANER 4 GAL/CASE Packaging: <u>CARTON, 4 80 OZ BOTTLES PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL507824</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 80 OZ BOTTLES PER CT * FOR USE IN DISPENSER ITEM #189</u>	100 GAL(S)	\$23.2864	\$2323.64
188	ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117, SANITIZER/MIRUCIDE CLEANER - BULK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: <u>CARTON, 4 80 OZ BOTTLES PER CT</u> MFG/Brand: <u>NCL</u> Product No: <u>NCL507824</u> Variances, if any: <u>4 80 OZ BOTTLES PER CT * FOR USE IN DISPENSER ITEM #189</u>	265 GAL(S)	\$23.2364	\$6157.65

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing  
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor  
 1 East Main Street  
 Freehold, NJ 07728  
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo  
 732-431-7370 x7381

**FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022**

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
189	E2B2 WALL MOUNT DISPENSING SYSTEM W/COLOR-CODED/ BI-LINGUAL SUPPORT MATERIALS	4 EACH	∅	∅
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL4113  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  NO CHARGE DISPENSER  </u>			
190	ENVIROX H2GO PORTABLE DISPENSER FOR USE WITH H2ORANGE2 117	4 EACH	\$10.22	\$40.88
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL 4165  </u> Variances, if any: _____			
191	ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) GREEN LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H2ORANGE2, 32 OZ CAPACITY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	262 EACH	∅	∅
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL-LABELS  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  NO CHARGE LABELS  </u>			
192	ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) RED LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H2ORANGE2, 32 OZ CAPACITY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	262 EACH	∅	∅
	Packaging: <u>  EACH  </u> MFG/Brand: <u>  NCL  </u> Product No: <u>  NCL - LABELS  </u> Variances, if any: <u>  NO CHARGE LABELS  </u>			

TOTAL: \$ 307,383.16