

ORIGINAL

RFB# F-44-2022

COUNTY OF MONMOUTH
STATE OF NEW JERSEY

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 F-44-2022

INCLUDES:

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
GENERAL CONDITIONS
EEO LANGUAGE
EEO QUESTIONNAIRE
BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIREMENTS
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP
IRAN DISCLOSURE FORM
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGMENT
BID DOCUMENT CHECKLIST
REQUEST FOR BID
ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS (if any)
SIGNATURE PAGE
ANTI-DISCRIMINATION IN EMPLOYMENT

AUTHORIZED: May 13, 2021

ADVERTISED: December 2, 2021

THOMAS A. ARNONE
DIRECTOR OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

MARION MASNICK
CLERK OF THE BOARD

TERI O'CONNOR
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

HELEN P. FIORE
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

NAME OF BIDDER: United Sales USA Corp

ADDRESS: 185 30th street

Brooklyn NY 11232

Phone: 718-709-5900 Fax: 718-709-7705

PLEASE INCLUDE ONE (1) UNBOUND ORIGINAL BID WITH SIGNATURE(S) AND TWO COPIES

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

RFB must be received no later than: December 15, 2021 10:30AM

For Delivery to: Various Delivery Locations. See Details Below.

Delivery Date: 1/1/2022 - 12/31/2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
CLEANERS, DRAIN OPENERS, STAIN REMOVERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE				
1	ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, FANTASTIC 32 OZ. Packaging: <u>384 oz/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>American cleaning solutions</u> Product No: <u>5502</u> Variances, if any: _____	9,600 OZ	.0488	580
2	ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, REFILL - NO SPRAYER, FANTASTIC 64 OZ. Packaging: <u>512 oz / cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>american cleaning solutions</u> Product No: <u>5502</u> Variances, if any: _____	3,840 OZ	.0366	174
3	LYSOL TOILET BOWL CLEANER, PLASTIC BOTTLE 24 OZ. Packaging: <u>32 oz /12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Lysol</u> Product No: <u>74278</u> Variances, if any: _____	43,200 OZ	.0824	3,559.11
4	GLASS CLEANER WITH AMMONIA D - PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, WINDEX ORIGINAL 32 OZ. Packaging: <u>32 oz/12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>First Force</u> Product No: <u>95090</u> Variances, if any: _____	95,856 OZ	.0309	2,965.55
6	FOAM GLASS CLEANER, AEROSOL CANS, WINDEX BOMB 20 OZ.	16,800 OZ	.0987	1,658.78

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>19 oz / 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>chase spraypak</u> Product No: <u>4334101</u> Variances, if any: _____			
9	HEAVY DUTY CLEANER AND DEGREASER, LIQUID LIGHTNING 1 GAL.	120 GAL(S)	.1246	1,914.25
	Packaging: <u>28 oz / 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Clorox</u> Product No: <u>33910</u> Variances, if any: _____			
10	MULTIPURPOSE CLEANER - NON AEROSOL, SPRAY KLEEN 32 OZ.	13,824 OZ	.1060	1,465.78
	Packaging: <u>32 oz / 8/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Fantastik</u> Product No: <u>306387</u> Variances, if any: _____			
11	ALL PURPOSE POWDER CLEANSER, COMET, LEMON, - PLASTIC CONTAINERS ONLY 17 OZ.	6,732 OZ	.0798	537.29
	Packaging: <u>21 oz 24/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Comet</u> Product No: <u>32987</u> Variances, if any: _____			
12	ALL PURPOSE AND GLASS DISINFECTANT (LIQUID), PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER, SPIC & SPAN 32 OZ.	43,200 OZ	.1770	7,648.39
	Packaging: <u>32 oz 8/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Spic & Span</u> Product No: <u>58775</u> Variances, if any: _____			
13	DRAIN OPENER, PROFESSIONAL STRENGTH, LIQUID PLUMBER 64 OZ.	11,520 OZ	.0646	738.09

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>32 oz 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>608000-12ESSN</u> Variances, if any: _____			
14	NON-CAUSTIC DRAIN OPENER/CLEANER 64 OZ.	11,520 OZ	.0646	738.09
	Packaging: <u>32 oz 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>608000-12ESSN</u> Variances, if any: _____			
15	BLEACH, CLOROX 1 GAL.	660 GAL(S)	2.3089	1,523.85
	Packaging: <u>Gallon / 6/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>KIK</u> Product No: <u>3520210</u> Variances, if any: _____			
16	STAIN & ODOR REMOVER, CLEAN & FRESH 20 OZ.	3,600 OZ		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
17	LIQUID DISH WASHING DETERGENT, DAWN 64 OZ.	3,072 OZ	.0291	89.25
	Packaging: <u>gallon/4/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>certo</u> Product No: <u>14228</u> Variances, if any: _____			
18	FURNITURE POLISH, PLEDGE, NO LEMON OIL 19 OZ.	2,250 OZ		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
19	ALUMINUM & STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER, CAMEO POWDER 17 OZ. Packaging: <u>19 oz / 12cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>chase spraypak</u> Product No: <u>4334111</u> Variances, if any: _____	1,224 OZ	.1179	144.27
20	STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER/POLISH 16 OZ. Packaging: <u>19 oz/ 12cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>chase spraypak</u> Product No: <u>4334111</u> Variances, if any: _____	1,536 OZ	.1179	181.04
21	MULTI SURFACE CLEANER, PINE-SOL 40 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	51,200 OZ		
SOAPS - PERSONAL USE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE				
23	PERSONAL SIZE BAR SOAP, IVORY 3.5 OZ. Packaging: <u>3.1 oz/ 72/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Ivory pgc</u> Product No: <u>12364</u> Variances, if any: _____	1,505 OZ	.1505	226.52
24	HAND CLEANER, GO-JO 14 OZ.	2,520 OZ	.2273	572.77

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>14 oz 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>GoJo</u> Product No: <u>0957-12</u> Variances, if any: _____			
25	HAND CLEANER , GO-JO 72 OZ.	8,640 OZ	.2141	1,849.77
	Packaging: <u>72 oz / 6 cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Gojo</u> Product No: <u>1115-06</u> Variances, if any: _____			
26	POWDERED HAND SOAP, BORAXO 12 OZ.	11,520 OZ	.0918	1,057.89
	Packaging: <u>5 lb / 10 cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Boraxo</u> Product No: <u>02203</u> Variances, if any: _____			
DISPENSERS AND REFILLS - SOAPS AND SANITIZERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE				
27	LOTION CLEANER REFILL, SANI-FRESH 800 ML.	1,152,000 ML(S)	.0027	3,078.97
	Packaging: <u>800 ml 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Gojo</u> Product No: <u>9128-12</u> Variances, if any: _____			
28	SANI-FRESH DISPENSERS, #798015	72 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
30	HAND SANITIZER DISPENSER - X3 FOAM SANITIZER DISPENSER (#10080) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	6 EACH		
31	HAND SANITIZER CARTRIDGE - X3 FOAM SANITIZER REFILLABLE CARTRIDGE (#10070) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	6 EACH		
32	HAND SANITIZER FOAM - ALCOHOL FREE, X3 FOAM SANITIZER, (#10004) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1 GALLON/128 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	1,536 OZ		
34	BACTERIOSTATIC LOTION HAND SOAP MUST FIT DIAL DISPENSER 1 GALLON/128 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	15,360 OZ		



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
37	VERTICAL LIQUID SOAP DISPENSER, STAINLESS STEEL, TAMPER/THEFT PROOF, TOP FILL WITH SERVICE KEY, 40 OZ CAPACITY, 4-7/8"W X 2-11/16"D X 8-3/16"H * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH		
38	ANTIBACTERIAL SOAP, 1 GALLON REFILL * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1 GALLON Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	96 GAL(S)		
39	D-LEAD HONEY ALMOND LIQUID HAND SOAP, 1 GALLON, #4222ES-4 1 GAL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		
40	ANTIBACTERIAL ULTRA MILD SOAP WITHOUT FORMALDEHYDE, NATURAL BASED, GO-JO 800 ML Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	48,000 ML(S)		

CLOTHS, TOWELS, TOLIET TISSUE, DISPENSERS AND RAGS

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
41	WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON 100 LBS. Packaging: <u>25 lb</u> MFG/Brand: <u>international wiper</u> Product No: <u>3095150</u> Variances, if any: _____	1,750 LB(S)	.9600	1,680
43	TERRY BAR RAGS, WHITE, 15" X 18", SEWN ON FOUR SIDES * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 25 LB. BAGS, (190-200 CLOTHS/BAG) Packaging: <u>25 lb</u> MFG/Brand: <u>international wiper</u> Product No: <u>3095192</u> Variances, if any: _____	125 LB(S)	1.8595	232.44
44	RECLAIMED POLO WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON ONLY - NO EXCEPTIONS Packaging: <u>10 lb</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Hospeco</u> Product No: <u>245-10</u> Variances, if any: _____	2,500 LB(S)	1.2612	3,153.00
45	TREATED NON-WOVEN DUSTING CLOTHS, 24" X 24", GOLDEN DUSTERS 50 RAGS Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	5,000 EACH		
46	2 PLY TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, SCOTT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 500 SHEETS/ROLL	80,768 ROLL(S)	.2762	22,311.32

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>96/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>nittany</u> Product No: <u>962u</u> Variances, if any: _____			
47	DISPENSER FOR TOILET TISSUE TO FIT ABOVE ITEM	50 EACH	24.96	1,248
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>2026</u> Variances, if any: _____			
48	1 PLY TOILET TISSUE, WHITE, SCOTT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 1,000 SHEETS/ROLL	57,600 ROLL(S)	.3605	20,763.60
	Packaging: <u>96/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>gen</u> Product No: <u>218</u> Variances, if any: _____			
49	2 PLY JUMBO ROLL TOILET TISSUE, SCOTT JUMBO JR. 1000 FT /ROLL	15,000,000 FT	.0012	17,988.75
	Packaging: <u>12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>nittany</u> Product No: <u>73041000</u> Variances, if any: _____			
50	DISPENSERS TO FIT JUMBO TOILET TISSUE ROLLS	50 EACH	27.24	1,362.10
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>2009</u> Variances, if any: _____			
51	PLY FOLD TOWELS, WHITE, ABSORBENCY RATE 20 SCC. PER .1CC WATER, MUST FIT BAY WEST DISPENSERS 4000 SHEETS	24,000 SHEET(S)	.0044	104.83



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>4000/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>marcal</u> Product No: <u>p200b</u> Variances, if any: _____			
52	ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL FOLDED TOWELS, NATURAL WHITE, 9.125" X 9.5", RENOWN LABEL BY BAY WEST (# REN06116-WB) 4000 SHEETS Packaging: <u>4000/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>marcal</u> Product No: <u>p200n</u> Variances, if any: _____	500,000 SHEET(S)	.0040	2,007
53	BAY WEST DISPENSER TO FIT PLY FOLD AND ECOSOFT GREEN SEAL FOLDED TOWELS Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>2506</u> Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH	66.94	1,606.50
54	ROLL TOWELS, WHITE, ABSORBENCY RATE 13 SCC PER .1CC WATER, MUST FIT BAY WEST DISPENSERS 630 FT/ROLL Packaging: <u>6/cs 630'</u> MFG/Brand: <u>nittany</u> Product No: <u>6630YW</u> Variances, if any: _____	347,760 FT	.0068	2,366.98
55	ECOSOFTGREEN SEAL ROLL TOWELS, NATURAL WHITE, (#BWP46200) 350 FT/ROLL Packaging: <u>12/cs 350'</u> MFG/Brand: <u>nittany</u> Product No: <u>12350EN</u> Variances, if any: _____	6,120,000 FT	.0043	26,490.86
56	BAY WEST LEVER ROLL TOWEL DISPENSER , TO FIT ITEMS 61 & 62	24 EACH	95	2,736



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
57	C-FOLD PAPER TOWELS,WHITE, SIZE 11"L X 9.625"W, ABSORBENCY RATE 80-120 SEC TESTED WITH 0.1 ML ON 1 PLY, 100% RECYCLED CONTENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 200 SHEETS/PK Packaging: <u>2400/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>marcal</u> Product No: <u>P050B</u> Variances, if any: _____	1,664,000 SHEET(S)	.0062	10,382.67
58	GEORGIA PACIFIC VISTA ROLL TOWEL DISPENSER, (#GEP 54338) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 EACH		
FLOOR AND CARPET CARE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE				
60	FLOOR SWEEPING COMPOUND, WAX BASE 75 LBS./DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	300 LB(S)		
61	FLOOR WAX 55 GALS./DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	165 GAL(S)		



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
62	DEWAXER 55 GALS./DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	165 GAL(S)		
63	HEAVY DUTY RUG SHAMPOO FOR WATER EXTRACTION MACHINES, CARPET MAGIC 64 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	4,096 OZ		
64	SPRAY BUFF 1 GAL. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	30 GAL(S)		
65	DEFOAMER 1 GAL. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	30 GAL(S)		
66	FLOOR STRIPPER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: NO RINSE FLOOR STRIPPER #FS409-55 OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM	5 DRUM(S)		



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
67	FLOOR FINISHER/WAX, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: ULTRAGLOSS WET LOOK FINISH #FW-120-55 OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	8 DRUM(S)		
68	FLOOR CLEANER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE BRAND: CHEM-TEK INDUSTRIES, INC PRODUCT: CHEM-TEK NEUTRA-KLEEN DIAMOND SHINE PLUS FLOOR CLEANER #SB-351OR EQUIVALENT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	3 DRUM(S)		
69	SCOLES X-FACTOR FLOOR FINISH, #SFXFACT 5 GAL/PAIL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
70	SCOLES LIFT OFF FLOOR FINISHER, #SFLIFTOF05 5 GAL/PAIL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		
71	SCOLES BLUE CONCENTRATE, HEAVY DUTY NO RINSE CLEANER, #ESBLUE5 5 GAL/PAIL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 GAL(S)		
72	SCOLES GREEN CLEAN #SGREENG 1 GAL Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 GAL(S)		
FLOOR PADS: STRIPPING, BUFFING, BURNISHING, CLEANING				
74	BUFFER PAD, AC, WHITE, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		
75	BUFFER PAD, AC, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
76	BUFFER PAD, AC, RED, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		
78	STRIPPING PAD, 3M, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		
81	QUICK STRIP STRIPPING PADS, 20" DIAMETER (#HP20) 5/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		
83	NATURAL HAIR BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCED FLOOR MACHINE 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	20 PAD(S)		
84	HEAVY BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	50 PAD(S)		



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
85	LIGHT BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, WHITE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 PAD(S)		
86	SURFACE PREPARATION PAD, 14" X 20", MAROON * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	40 PAD(S)		
89	SCRUBBING PAD, 14" X 20", RED * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 5 PADS/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	40 PAD(S)		
90	SWIVEL PAD, SUPER DUTY, BLACK, 4.5" X 10" (#FUP05) 5 PADS/BAG Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 PAD(S)		
91	SWIVEL PAD THREADED HOLDER (#FUP200T)	10 EACH		



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
CLEANING AIDS: BRUSHES, BROOMS, MOPS, BUCKETS, PLUNGERS, DUSTERS, SQUEEGEES, SPONGES, LITTER STICKS				
92	BOWL BRUSH, WOODEN HANDLE (TAMPICO #09-0436)	72 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
93	TOILET BOWL BRUSH, ONE PIECE, SYNTHETIC BRISTLES, WHITE, PLASTIC HANDLE ONLY (NORSHEL #N-82) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	120 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
94	POT BRUSH, HEAVY DUTY WITH HANDLE WITH FOAM BLOCK (HOLCOMBE)	25 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
95	12" DECK BRUSH WITH HANDLE AND FOAM BLOCK	24 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
96	DECK BRUSH HEAD- 10" FOAM BLOCK WITH THREADED HANDLE HOLE - SPLIT BRUSH SHAPE, STRAIGHT AND ANGLED MULTILEVEL BRISTLES, LONG LASTING BLUE POLYPROPYLENE FIBERS, STAIN RESISTANT * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	60 EACH		
97	8" LONG COUNTER BRUSH WITH HANDLE, PLASTIC HORSEHAIR BLEND, 2.13" BRISTLE TRIM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	25 EACH		
98	DUST BRUSH, BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLE, 8" FACE WITH 4" HANDLE, ALL ONE PIECE PLASTIC AND A HANGING HOLE ON THE HANDLE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	60 EACH		
99	12" TOILET BOWL MOP, PLASTIC HANDLE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
100	PLUNGERS, TOILET, LARGE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH		
101	17" TOILET PLUNGER - ALL PLASTIC HANDLE WITH RUBBER END, BLACK, LARGE CUP SIZE - THREADED HANDLE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH		
102	16" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM WITH HANDLE, 5 ROWS NATURAL BASS FIBER, 6-1/4" TRIM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	70 EACH		
104	24" GARAGE SWEEPER WITH HANDLE (DBQ) (PALMYRA #10703) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	48 EACH		
105	#8 CORN BROOM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	36 EACH		
107	14" ANGLE BROOM, 100% POLY PROPYLENE ONLY (BRISTLE GIANT, QUICKIE #735)	15 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
108	18" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM HEAD, FOAM PLASTIC BLOCK WITH 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES, COURSE BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES	72 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
109	LOBBY BROOM, BRISTLE - POLYPROPYLENE FILL, 7.5" L X 2" W X 35" H, BLACK	25 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
110	12" HEAVY DUTY DUST PAN, 20 GAUGE STEEL, BEVELED EDGE	24 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
111	LOBBY PRO DUST PAN WITH UPRIGHT 30" LONG HANDLE AND 12" WIDE DUST BIN	24 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
112	12" DUST PAN, HAND HELD, ALL PLASTIC WITH NO METAL, WITH HANDLE HOLE (RUBBERMAID TYPE OR EQUIVALENT)	12 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
113	24" PUSH BROOM HEAD, FINE/MEDIUM BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES, STRUCTURAL FOAM PLASTIC BLOCK, 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH		
114	60" WOOD BROOM HANDLES, 1-1/8" DIAMETER, TAPERED Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	48 EACH		
115	60" BROOM HANDLES, METAL THREAD, PUSH BROOM THREADED Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH		
116	24" DUSTLESS MOPS, COMPLETE (DURALON) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
117	24" DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH		
119	DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS, 36" X 5", SYNTHETIC GREEN, OPEN LOOP, LINT FREE COTTON * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	48 EACH		
120	DUSTLESS MOP FRAME, 36" X 5" METAL WIRE FRAME, RUST RESISTANT AND POWDER COAT PAINTED WITH SWIVEL SNAP-TO HANDLE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH		
121	60" THREADED HANDLE - 1" DIAMETER, YELLOW FIBERGLASS, MESH-VEILED TO PREVENT SPLINTERING WITH SUPER TOUGH BLACK NYLON PLASTIC STANDARD THREAD END * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	216 EACH		
122	60" MOP HANDLE, 1" DIAMETER, FIBERGLASS, LATCH STYLE, QUICK CHANGE, HIGH IMPACT PLASTIC HEAD (SNAP-N-GO)	10 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
123	MOP HEADS, 24 OZ., 8 PLY, RAYON, CLOSED LOOP	150 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
124	MOP HANDLES FOR 24 OZ. MOP HEAD, WHITE	24 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
125	MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CLOSED LOOP * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	1,872 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
126	MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CUT END	144 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
127	WAX MOP HEAD, 24 OZ, 1" HEAD BAND, LOOPED END, RAYON, BLUE/WHITE STRIPED, 4-PLY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	144 EACH		
128	DUST BRUSHER (FOXTAILS) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH		
129	LAMBS WOOL DUSTER, TELESCOPIC, EXTENDS 33" - 60" Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH		
130	PLASTIC POLYWOOL DUSTER - BRIGHT, MULTICOLOR SYNTHETIC, FLEXIBLE POSITIONING HEAD, TELESCOPIC HANDLE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>bwk9442</u> Variances, if any: _____	10 EACH	7.20	72
131	INSTITUTIONAL BUCKET AND WRINGER, 35 QUART BUCKET AND ONE PIECE FUNNEL SHAPED WRINGER, NON-SCUFFING WHEELS, ALL PLASTIC, NO HANDLE (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	12 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
132	MOP BUCKET, 3" CASTERS, 26 QT. (RUBBERMAID #6111 BRUTE)	20 EACH	52	1,040
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>1026yw</u> Variances, if any: _____			
133	MOP BUCKET, 14 QT. (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	20 EACH	7.56	151.20
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>1214</u> Variances, if any: _____			
134	DOWNWARD PRESSURE WRINGERS FOR 26 QT. BUCKET (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	10 EACH	42.90	429
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>1011</u> Variances, if any: _____			
135	24" PUSH AND PULL SQUEEGEE	12 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
137	8" BLACK RUBBER SQUEEGEE BLADE WITH ALL PLASTIC 20" HANDLE AND 8" SYNTHETIC SPONGE IN NYLON MESH FOR DURABILITY AND ABRASIVE SCRUBBING, TOOL MUST BE ALL PLASTIC NO METAL AND NO SCREWS * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>hwk824</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	5.17	372.24
138	20" FLOOR SQUEEGEE HEAD, ALL PLASTIC, SOLID ONE PIECE WITH THREADED END FOR HANDLE (CARLSILE #3656703) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>unger</u> Product No: <u>unghm30k</u> Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH	51.87	3,734.64
140	6 GALLON WINDOW CLEANING BUCKET TO ACCOMMODATE 18" WASHERS AND SQUEEGEES (UNGER PRO BUCKET) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH		
141	13' TELESCOPING POLE - 2-SECTIONS (#PPM-UNGEZ400 UNGER) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>unger</u> Product No: <u>ungez400</u> Variances, if any: _____	2 EACH	58.9950	117.99

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
142	VISA VERSA SQUEEGEE WITH 18" STRIP WASHER (#PPM-UNGV45 UNGER)	2 EACH	44.0100	88.02
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>unger</u> Product No: <u>ungvp450</u> Variances, if any: _____			
143	STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGE HANDLE WITH RUBBER GRIP (UNGER PRO #PPM-UNGPR00)	2 EACH	12.45	24.90
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>unger</u> Product No: <u>ungpr00</u> Variances, if any: _____			
144	18" STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGEE (UNGER PRO #PPM-UNGPR45)	2 EACH	23.0250	46.05
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>unger</u> Product No: <u>ungpr45</u> Variances, if any: _____			
145	SPONGES, 4" X 6" X 2"	264 EACH	.8245	217.668
	Packaging: <u>24/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>bwkcs2</u> Variances, if any: _____			
146	SCRUBBER SPONGES, SCRUBBER ON ONE SIDE AND SPONGE ON OTHER, 3" X 6" (S.O.S.) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	2,100 EACH	.729	1,530.90
	Packaging: <u>20/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>bwk174</u> Variances, if any: _____			

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
147	MAGIC ERASER BATHROOM SCRUBBER, 4-1/2" X 3-1/5" (PROCTER & GAMBLE) 2 EA/BOX Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	20 EACH	NO BID	
148	SCOURING PADS, HEAVY DUTY, 6" X 3.85" (3M SCOTCH BRITE) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	110 PAD(S)	NO BID	
149	ALUMINUM LITTER STICKS, 36" (PICS) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 EACH	NO BID	
151	NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 36" REACH Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	36 EACH		
152	NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 51" HANDLE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	25 EACH		

INSECT PESTICIDES AND RELATED ITEMS

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
153	ROACH AND ANT KILLER (BLACK FLAG) 20 OZ. Packaging: <u>12/cs 17.5oz</u> MFG/Brand: <u>raid</u> Product No: <u>669798</u> Variances, if any: _____	2,880 OZ	.2755	793.40
154	HOUSE AND GARDEN SPRAY, MUST INCLUDE WASPS & HORNETS (JOHNSON'S RAID) 20 OZ. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	4,080 OZ		
155	FLYING INSECT SPRAY (RAID) 20 OZ. Packaging: <u>10 oz / 12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>chase spraypak</u> Product No: <u>4334106</u> Variances, if any: _____	3,060 OZ	.3220	985.32
PERSONAL HYGIENE ITEMS				
156	PAPER TOILET SEAT COVERS (HANDY KLENZ 250T #74020250) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>250/bx</u> MFG/Brand: <u>Boardwalk</u> Product No: <u>usk2500bwk</u> Variances, if any: _____	70 BOX(S)	24.4680	1,712.76
157	URINAL SCREENS (S.FREEDMAN AND SONS) 24 BLOCKS	1,680 EACH	14.30	24,024

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: <u>12/cs</u> MFG/Brand: <u>janico</u> Product No: <u>7001</u> Variances, if any: _____			
MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES				
158	LOOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT FOR PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, GREASES AND OTHER LIKE LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE WHEN USED WITH PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, MEETS OSHA STANDARDS (OIL-DRI) 36 LBS/32QT/BAG Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	26,800 LB(S)		
159	LOOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT, FOR PLANT-BASED OILS, ANTIFREEZE, COOLANTS AND OTHER LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE WHEN USED WITH PLANT-BASED OILS (PIG-DRI PLP213) 40 LBS./BAG Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	1,200 LB(S)		
160	ICE MELTING PELLETS 50 LB. BAGS Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	75,000 LB(S)		
161	WET FLOOR SIGNS - YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 25" HIGH, 2 SIDED, FOLDING * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	48 EACH	7.20	345

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: <u>alpine</u> Product No: <u>alp499</u> Variances, if any: _____			
162	PLASTIC SYPHON DRUM PUMP, HEAVY DUTY, MUST FIT 55 GAL DRUM W/2" OPENING * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	12 EACH		
163	32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH SPRAYER, CLEAR OR WHITE (EMPTY) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	292 EACH		
164	32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH SPRAYER, YELLOW (EMPTY) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH		
165	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: RED * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	250 EACH		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
166	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: GREEN * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	300 EACH		
167	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: BLUE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH		
168	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: WHITE * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	72 EACH		
169	SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE (ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: YELLOW * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED.	72 EACH		



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
170	WHITE FOAM COFFEE CUPS, 8 OZ. 1000/CASE	6,000 CUP(S)	26.28	26,280
	Packaging: 1000 MFG/Brand: Dart Product No: 8J8 Variances, if any: _____			
171	TWO-PLY POLY TWINE, 10 LB., NYLON	18 ROLL(S)		
	Packaging: NO BID MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
WASTE AND RECYCLING CONTAINERS				
172	32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, GRAY (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	30 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			
173	32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, WHITE (RUBBERMAID BRUTE)	10 EACH		
	Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____			

REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
174	WASTE BASKETS, 14.25" X 10.5" X 15", BLACK, MUST BE FLAME RETARDANT (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	24 EACH		
175	13 QT. WASTE BASKET (RUBBERMAID #2955-2) Packaging: <u>each</u> MFG/Brand: <u>rubbermaid</u> Product No: <u>rcp2955gra</u> Variances, if any: _____	75 EACH	7.7640	582.30
176	28 1/2 QT. WASTE BASKET (RUBBERMAID #RCP2956) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	75 EACH		
177	20 GALLON WHEELED TRASH CAN WITH LID Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	20 EACH		
178	20 GALLON TRASH CAN WITH LID (RUBBERMAID #2620) Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	20 EACH		



REQUEST FOR BID

---- This Is Not An Order ----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
179	55 GALLON ROUND WASTE CONTAINER, GRAY, NO WHEELS, FLAME RETARDANT (RUBBERMAID) * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	32 EACH		
185	SANITARY TILT TRUCK - ERGONOMIC, CONTOURED STRUCTURAL FOAM BODY, 10" WHEELS, 450 LB. CAPACITY, BLACK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: <u>each</u> MFG/Brand: <u>rubbermaid</u> Product No: <u>rcp9t13bla</u> Variances, if any: _____	4 EACH	487.73	1,950.91
ENVIROX BRAND PRODUCTS				
187	ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117, SANITIZER/VIRUCIDE CLEANER 4 GAL/CASE Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	100 GAL(S)		
188	ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117, SANITIZER/VIRUCIDE CLEANER - BULK * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. 55 GALLON DRUM Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	265 GAL(S)		

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
189	E2B2 WALL MOUNT DISPENSING SYSTEM W/COLOR-CODED/ BI-LINGUAL SUPPORT MATERIALS Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	4 EACH		
190	ENVIROX H2GO PORTABLE DISPENSER FOR USE WITH H2ORANGE2 117 Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	4 EACH		
191	ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) GREEN LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H2ORANGE2, 32 OZ CAPACITY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	262 EACH		
192	ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) RED LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H2ORANGE2, 32 OZ CAPACITY * THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE REQUESTED. Packaging: _____ MFG/Brand: _____ Product No: _____ Variances, if any: _____	262 EACH		

TOTAL: 214,439.10

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



RFB# F-44-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL AND PAPER SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
-------	-------------	---------------	------------	-------------

*** ALL ITEMS MUST BE BID IN THE UNIT OF MEASURE ***

**** SEE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS ****

ALL INQUIRIES MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO:
FORMALBIDQUESTIONS@CO.MONMOUTH.NJ.US

Various Delivery Locations:

Division of Highway
Public Works Complex
250 Center Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
Cassandra Deckle 732-431-6550

Buildings & Grounds/Trades
Special Services Complex
300 Halls Mill Road
Freehold, NJ 07728
Karen Retzer 732-431-7360 x2136

Division of Fleet Services
Public Works Complex
250 Center Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
Joe Ponisi 732-431-7830 x7165

Sheriff's Office - Correctional Institution
P.O. Box 5007
1 Waterworks Road
Freehold, NJ 07728
Jeff Sauter 732-431-7860 x1203