- RFB#F-37-2022

COUNTY OF MONMOUTH

s STATE OF NEW JERSEY =~ = |

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI- FREEZE ' DEGREASERS,
' CLEANERS AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY

DIVISIONS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31 2022 (MONMOUTH-
COUNTY CO OP) F-37- 2022 o o

INCLUDES: S o L ‘
'NOTICETOBIDDERS =~ .~ .. NON- COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT -~
GENERAL CONDITIONS .~ ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGMENT .
EEOLANGUAGE. . -~ . BD DOCUMENT CHECKLIST .
' EEO QUESTIONNAIRE - . REQUESTFORBID:
BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIREMENTS . ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS (if any)
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP~ ~ .. SIGNATUREPAGE . . . T
IRAN DISCLOSUREFORM -~ =~ . ANTI DISCRIMINATION IN EMPLOYMENT o

AMERICANS WITH: DISABILITIES ACT

L “AUTHORIZED May 13, 2021

':ADVERTISED October 14 2021

 HOMAS A. ARNONE = -~
~ DIRECTOR OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS :

o jMARION MASNICK .
. CLERK OF THE BOARD -

TERIO'CONNOR
. '-COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

B .‘HELEN P. FIORE : L
:-__-'DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING ) o

NAME OF BIDDER Lawson Products Inc K

ADDRESS 8770 W Brvn Mawr Ave., Su1te 900 -

Chlcago iL. 60631 :

phone soo 890 8198 . L Fax‘ 312- 267 1734

PILEASE I.NCLUDE ONE 1 '_ UNBOUND ORIGINAL BID WITH SIGNATURE 'S AND TWO COPIES _
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RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID _
~---- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FORTHE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

RFB must be received no later than: November 5, 2021 10:30AM

For Delivery to: ~ Various Delivery Locations. See Details Below.

‘Delivery Date: 1/1/2022 - 12/31/2022
ITEN# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
ANTIFREEZE . : - . . T
1 ANTIFREEZE, HEAVY DUTY, CONCENTRATED ELC 4 DRUM(S)
(EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT)

BRAND 1: PEAK GLOBAL HD FINAL CHARGE

BRAND 2: VALVOLINE HD EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
HF A

VIRGIN STOCK, CONCENTRATED, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
55 GAL/DRUM NO BID

' Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

2  ANTIFREEZE, HEAVY DUTY, CONCENTRATED ELC 800 GAL(S)
(EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT)
BRAND 1: PEAK GLOBAL HD FINAL CHARGE
BRAND 2: VALVOLINE HD EXTENDED LIFE COOLANT
HF
VIRGIN STOCK, CONCENTRATED, NO SUBSTITUTIONS
. BULK DELIVERY

NO BID
~— Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if/ any:

3 ANTIFREEZE, EXTENDED LIFE - CONCENTRATED 6 DRUM(S)
BRAND 1: SHELL ROTELLAELC
BRAND 2: VALVOLINE ZEREX EXTENDED LIFE
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM !

NO BID
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No: -
Variances, if any: -
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
--=-= This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
" Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

4  ANTIFREEZE, PROPYLENE TYPE - CONCENTRATED
BRAND 1: PEAK GLOBAL ANTIFREEZE EXTENDED LIFE
- PROPYLENE TYPE - CONCENTRATED
BRAND 2: PRESTONE LOW-TOX
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM

Packaging:

NO BID

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

10 DRUM(S)

fAUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID

5 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID - DEXTRON VI FULL
SYNTHETIC ATF
BRAND 1: CAM2
BRAND 2: CASTROL
BRAND 3: SYSTEM 7 M4 ATF LOW VIS
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

10 DRUM(S)

6 AUTOMATIC TRANSMISSION FLUID FOR HEAVY DUTY
DIESEL APPLICATIONS
BRAND 1: ALLISON TRANSYND FULL SYNTHETIC
TRANSMISSION FLUID
BRAND 2: MOBIL DELVAC SYNTHETIC
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GALLON/DRUM NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

3 DRUM(S)

pIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FORBID
~---- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEVH DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

7  DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID (DEF)
BRAND 1: ULTRA-PURE DEF, TERRACAIR BY
" BRENNTAG (MUST BE 32.5% UREA SOLUTION)
BRAND 2: BLUE SKY 32.5% DIESEL EXHAUST FLUID
(DEF) #30003-330
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
2.5 GAL/JUG (FILLED) o gD

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

1,540 JUG(S)

;ENGINE oL

8 ENGINE OIL FOR DIESEL APPLICATIONS
BRAND 1: SUNOCO SUPER C 15W-40 CK-4
BRAND 2: CHEVRON DELO 400 SDE 15W-40 #222290
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM

Packaging:

NO BID

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

2 DRUM(S)

9 ENGINE OIL FOR DIESEL APPLICATIONS
BRAND 1: SUNOCO SUPER C 15W-40 CK-4
BRAND 2: CHEVRON DELO 400 SDE 15W-40 #222290
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
BULK DELIVERY NO BID

Packaging:
- MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

2,000 GAL(S)

10  ENGINE OIL, 5W-20, FULL SYNTHETIC MOTOR OIL,
DEXOS1 GEN 2
BRAND 1: MAG 1 .
BRAND 2: CHEVRON SUPREME 5W-20 #220 135
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

BULK DELIVERY NO BID

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

600 GAL(S)
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Cdunty of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----= This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

11

ENGINE OIL, 30-W MOTOR OIL, HEAVY DUTY
BRAND 1: SHELL ROTELLA
BRAND 2: PENNZOIL
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM NO BID
'Packaging:

" MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

6 DRUM(S)

13

ENGINE OIL, 5W-30 FULL SYNTHETIC, DEXOS1 GEN 2
BRAND 1: MAG 1

BRAND 2: PENNZOIL

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

BULK DELIVERY NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

600 GAL(S)

14

ENGINE OIL, OW-20 FULLY SYNTHETIC DEXOS MOTOR
OIL

BRAND 1: PENNZOIL

BRAND 2: MAG 1

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

55 GAL/DRUM NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

4 DRUM(S)

15

ENGINE OIL, 0W-20 FULLY SYNTHETIC DEXOS MOTOR
oL

BRAND 1: PENNZOIL

BRAND 2: MAG 1

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

BULK DELIVERY NO BID

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

600 GAL(S)
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order =----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-0OP)

ITEN#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

16

ENGINE OIL, OW-40 FULLY SYNTHETIC OIL
BRAND 1: PENNZOIL -

" BRAND 2: MAG 1

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
12 QUARTSICASE  \o D

Packaging:

60 QUART(S)

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

GREASE

17

GREASE - CHASSIS LUBE GREASE, EXTREME
PRESSURE (EP)

BRAND 1: MOBILITH SHC220 NLGI GRADE 2
BRAND 2: SHELL GADUS S5V 220 NO.2

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

120 LBS/KEG

Packaging:

NOBID

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

3 KEG(S)

19

GREASE - CHASSIS LUBE GREASE, EXTREME
PRESSURE (EP)

BRAND 1: MOBILITH SHC220 NLGI GRADE 2
BRAND 2: SHELL GADUS S5 V 220 NO.2 #550036432
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

14.1 OZ/CARTRIDGE

Packaging:

NO BID

750 CARTG(S)

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

20

GREASE - 5TH WHEEL GREASE
BRAND 1: MOBIL GREASE HTS
BRAND 2: CAM2

"NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

400 LBS/DRUM NO BID
Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

1 DRUM(S)
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-0OP)

ITENH DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
21 MOBIL MOBILITH SHC 1000 SPECIAL SYNTHETIC 6 PAIL(S)
GREASE
MANUFACTURER #103471
5 GALIPA'IL NO BID
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:

Variances, if any:

22 BEL-RAY HEAVY DUTY CONSTRUCTION GREASE
MANUFACTURER #72560-CG
14.1 OZ/CARTRIDGE

Packaging: 12

MFG/Brand: Lawson Products

Product No: DN4380D

Variances, if any:

120 CARTG(S)
$3.31 $397.20

23 BEL-RAY MOLYTUBE SF100 OGL MEDIUM GREASE
MANUFACTURER # 77010-CC
14.1 OZ/CARTRIDGE

Packaging: 1

MFG/Brand: _Lawson Products

Product No: 81397

Variances, if any:

120 CARTG(S)
$5.76 $691.20

24 MOBILGREASE XHP 222, LITHIUM COMPLEX
MANUFACTURER #105842

5 GALLONS/PAIL
i NOBID

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

2 PAIL(S)

HYDRAULICOIL -

25 HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32 PREMIUM ANTIWEAR (AW)
HYDRAULIC OIL
BRAND 1: SHELL
BRAND 2: CHEVRON
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

55 GAL./DRUM
NO BID
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RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order =----

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEN# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT ‘ UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

26 HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 32 PREMIUM ANTIWEAR (AW) 1,000 GAL(S)
HYDRAULIC OIL
BRAND 1: SHELL
BRAND 2: CHEVRON
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
BULK DELIVERY NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

27 HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 46 PREMIUM ANTIWEAR (AW) 30 PAIL(S)
HYDRAULIC OIL '
BRAND 1: SHELL
BRAND 2: CHEVRON
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
5 GAL./PAIL NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

29 HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 68 PREMIUM ANTIWEAR (AW) 4 DRUM(S)
HYDRAULIC OIL
BRAND 1: CASTROL DUAL RANGE HV
BRAND 2: MOBIL EXCEL 68
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL./DRUM . NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

30 HYDRAULIC OIL ISO 68 PREMIUM ANTIWEAR (AW) 50 PAIL(S)
HYDRAULIC OIL
BRAND 1: CASTROL DUAL RANGE HV
BRAND 2: MOBIL EXCEL 68
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
5 GAL./PAIL NO BID
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----= This Is Not An Order ~----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street '

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
;SPRAY LUBRICANTS, DEGREASERS AND CLEANERS
31 BEL-RAY 6 IN 1 MULTIPURPOSE LUBRICANT 120 CAN(S)
MANUFACTURER #12310-A400W $3.96 $475.20
400ML/CAN
Packaging: 3
MFG/Brand: _Lawson Products
Product No: 97673
Variances, if any:
32 BEL-RAY WATERPROOF CHAIN LUBE 120 CAN(S)
MANUFACTURER #66410-A400W $3.64
400ML/CAN ' $436.80
Packaging: 3
MFG/Brand: Lawson Products
Product No: 28179
Variances, if any:
33 CRC BRAKLEEN BRAKE AND PARTS CLEANER 120 CAN(S)
MANUFACTURER #05089
10.42
190Z/CAN $ $1,250.40
Packaging: 12
MFG/Brand: __Lawson Products
Product No: 900021623
Variances, if any:
34 WD40 SPECIALIST ELECTRICAL CONTACT CLEANER 180 CAN(S)
MANUFACTURER #300554 $6.36
110Z/CAN $1,144.80
Packaging: 1
MFG/Brand: Kent Automotive
Product No: KT14928
Variances, if any:
35 CRC POWDER LUBE MULTIPURPOSE LUBRICANT 10 GAL(S)
MANUFACTURER #05007
8.47
1 GAL/CONTAINER $ $101.64
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RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728 .
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID '
---== This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT - UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE -

Packaging: 12
MFG/Brand: Lawson Products

Product No: 1616442
Variances, if any:

36 SUPERCLEAN LIQUID CLEANER AND DEGREASER 18 GAL(S)
MANUFACTURER #101723 $12.16 $145.92
1 GAL/CONTAINER ’

Packaging: 12
MFG/Brand: _Lawson Products
Product No: 1373029

Variances, if any:

37 ZEP CONCRETE DISSOLVING FLUID 10 GAL(S)
MANUFACTURER #165635 {
5 GAL/CONTAINER

Packaging: 5 gal
MFG/Brand: . Lawson Products
Product No: 900014007

Variances, if any:

38 DYNAFLUX ALUMINUM AND STAINLESS CLEANER 2 GAL(S)
(REMOVES OXIDE LAYER PRIOR TO WELDING) ) $10.94 $21.88
MANUFACTURER #781
1 GAL/CONTAINER

Packaging: 1
MFG/Brand: Lawson Products -

Product No: P12101
Variances, if any:

SPECIALTY GEAR OILS

39 - BEL-RAY AIR TOOL OIL 4 GAL(S)
MANUFACTURER #62620-BT4
1 GAL/CONTAINER

NO BID

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
" Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

---== This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street '

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo /

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEN®

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

40

SYNTHETIC BEARING AND CIRCULATING OIL
BRAND 1: SHELL MORLINA S4 B 220
MANUFACTURER #850042915

'BRAND 2: CHEVRON CETUS HIPERSYN 220

NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

5 GAL/PAIL NO BID

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

6 PAIL(S)

41

MOBIL DTE HEAVY/MEDIUM OIL
R&O CIRCULATING OIL
MANUFACTURER #100959

1 GAL/CONTAINER

NO BID
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

2 GAL(S)

42

MOBIL GLYGOYLE 460 SYNTHETIC BEARING & GEAR
oL

MANUFACTURER #103078

5 GALICONTAINER o i

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

" Product No:

Variances, if any:

5 GAL(S)

43

MOBIL VELOCITE #6 SPINDLE OIL
MANUFACTURER #105482
5 GAL/CONTAINER

NO BID
Packaging: '

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

5 GAL(S)

MOBIL VELOCITE #10 SPINDLE OIL
MANUFACTURER #105481
5 GAL/CONTAINER

NO BID
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RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Halil of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
-==== This Is Not An Order --=--

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
45 TAP MAGIC EP-XTRA CUTTING FLUID 2 GAL(S)
MANUFACTURER #10128E $25.74 $51.48
1 GAL/CONTAINER
Packaging: 1
MFG/Brand: Lawson Products
Product No: 1568365
Variances, if any:
46 ENVIROLOGIC TERRASOLVE #1486, 10 GAL(S)
BIODEGRADEABLE HYDRAULIC OIL
MANUFACTURER #EO14605
5 GAL/CONTAINER NO BID
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:

Variances, if any:

50 HYDRAULIC OIL/CIRCULATING LUBRICANT 5 PAIL(S)
BRAND 1: MOBIL DTE 12M
BRAND 2: SUNOCO SUNVIS 1022 HVI
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
5 GAL/PAIL NO BID

Packaging: =<
MFG/Brand:
Product No: =
Variances, if any:

SMALL ENGINE ITEMS

51 TRUFUEL 4 CYCLE ETHANOL FREE FUEL , 5 GAL(S)
(FOR SMALL ENGINES)
MANUFACTURER #301597210180
1 GAL/CONTAINER

i NO BID
Packaging:

MFG/Brand: ,
Product No: :
Variances, if any:
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RFB# F-37-2022

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID ,
-—- This Is Not An Order -——-

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER LUBRICANTS, MOTOR OILS, ANTI-FREEZE, DEGREASERS, CLEANERS
AND WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DIVISIONS FOR THE
PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OF)

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

52 BAR AND CHAIN OIL (APPLICABLE FOR CHAINSAW 114 GAL(S)
USE) 193 DEGREES C, VISCOSITY @ 100C, 11CST
BRAND 1: ITASCA BAR / CHAIN OIL
BRAND 2: STIHL WOODCUTTER BAR AND CHAIN OIL
VIRGIN STOCK
BULK DELIVERY

NO BID
Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No: -
Variances, if any:

53 MOTOR OIL -2 CYCLE, WITH A 2.60Z PRE-MEASURING 288 PINT(S)
DEVICE
BRAND 1: MAG 1
BRAND 2: VP
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK

24 PINTS/CASE NO BID
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID .

54 WINDSHIELD WASHER FLUID - PRE-MIXED TO -20 F. 22 DRUM(S)
FREEZE PROTECTION FORMULA
BRAND 1: PRESTONE AS-657-55
BRAND 2: CAMCO EXTREME BLUE
BRAND 3: WW-55 SPLASH PRE-MIX
NO SUBSTITUTIONS, VIRGIN STOCK
55 GAL/DRUM NO BID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

" TOTAL: $4,919.44
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