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SIGNATURE PAGE

RFQ# F-27-2025
To the Board of County Commissioners of the County of Monmouth:

THE UNDERSIGNED HEREBY DECLARES THAT
I (WE) HAVE CAREFULLY EXAMINED THE SPECIFICATIONS.
| (WE) HEREBY CERTIFY PRICES QUOTED ARE IN ACCORDANCE
WITH YOUR REQUIREMENTS.

Company Name: Agni Enterprises LLC (dba) Head to Heels Safety Supplies
(PRINT)

Preparer's Name: Subbarayan R Pochi

(PRINT)

Signature: PKJ TN 10/16/2024
(- (DATE)

Address: 8021 SW 94th Street, Unit 510, Miami FL 33176’

Telephone No.: 305-712-6653
Fax No.: 888-592-3667

E-Mail Address:  cservice@headtoheels.net

***(This should be the email where Contracts would be sent)***

Contact Person: Subbarayah R Pochi

FEIN:
(Federal Employee ID)

(Revised 9/2015)



RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

RFB must be received no later than: October 17, 2024 10:30AM

For Delivery to: Various Delivery Locations. See Details Below.

Delivery Date: 1/1/2025-12/31/2025
ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
'CLEANERS, DRAIN OPENERS, STAIN REMOVERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE
1 ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED 9,240 OZ
SPRAYER $0.1753 | $1,619.77
32 OZ.
Packaging: 12/Carton,32 oz

MFG/Brand: Z2ep Commercial
Product No:  ZEEZUALL32CT

Variances, if any:

2 ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, REFILL - NO SPRAYER 3,840 0Z _
64 OZ. No Bid

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

3  TOILET BOWL CLEANER, PLASTIC BOTTLE 40,320 OZ
24 0Z. $0.1958 | $7,894.66

12/Carton,24 oz

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: ~.Clorox

Product No: ~ =£9000%1CT
Variances, if any:

4  WINDEX (OR EQUIVALENT) GLASS CLEANER WITH 95,496 OZ
AMMONIA D - PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED $0.1746 | $16,673.60
SPRAYER
320z

Packaging: 12/Carton,32 oz

MFG/Brand: Z0ARDWALK
Product No: BWKA47112A
Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact:

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
5 FOAM GLASS CLEANER, AEROSOL CANS 200 0Oz
20 OZ. $0.4273 | $85.46
Packaging: 6/Carton,20 oz
MFG/Brand: ~Windex
Product No: SIN333813
Variances, if any:
6 HEAVY DUTY CLEANER AND DEGREASER 140 GAL(S)
1 GAL. $16.85 $2,359.00
Packaging: 2/Carton
MFG/Brand; Boardwak
Product No: BWK47a4
"Variances, if any:
7 MULTIPURPOSE CLEANER - NON AEROSOL 13,824 OZ
32 0Z. $0.1886 | $2,607.21
PaCkaglngZ B/Carton,32 0z
MFG/Brand: TFantasti
Product No: SJN366094 _
Variances, if any:
8 ALL PURPOSE POWDER CLEANSER, LEMON, - 5,712 OZ
PLASTIC CONTAINERS ONLY $0.1494 $853.37
17 OZ.
Packaging: 24/Carton, 21 OZ
MFG/Brand: Somet
Product No: PGC32987CT
Variances, if any: Scent :Pine Capacity:21 0z
9 KAIBOSH DISINFECTANT (OR EQUIVALENT) ALL 43,200 OZ
PURPOSE AND GLASS DISINFECTANT (LIQUID)
PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER $0.3076 $13,288.32
DILUTION RATE 2 OZ /1 GALLON
3202Z.
Packaging: 8/Carton,32 oz
MFG/Brand: Spicand Span
Product No;: ~ ZCC58775CT

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact:

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

10 DRAIN OPENER, PROFESSIONAL STRENGTH
64 OZ.

Packaging: 12/Canon,32OZ

MFG/Brand: [Boardwalk

Product No: BWK4823

. . Capacity:32 oz
Variances, if any: pacy

11,620 OZ

- $0.1805

$2,079.36

11 NON-CAUSTIC DRAIN OPENER/CLEANER
64 OZ. '

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

11,520 OZ

No Bid

12 BLEACH
1 GAL.

6/Case,1 Gal

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: KIK Consumer Products

Product No: 11008635042

Variances, if any:

660 GAL(S)

|$5.10

$3,367.65

13 STAIN & ODOR REMOVER
200Z.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

360 OZ

No Bid

15 FURNITURE POLISH, NO LEMON OIL
19 OZ.

Packaging: 12/Carton,19 OZ

MFG/Brand; Boardwalk

Product No; ~ 2WK346ACT
Lemon Scent

Variances, if any:

2,250 0Z

$0.3236

$728.10
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

16 ALUMINUM & STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER

1,224 0Z .
$0.3227 | $394.98

17 OZ.
Packaging: 12/Carton,18 oz
MFG/Brand; [Boardwalk
Product No: BWKS47ACT
Variances, if any: 180z
17 STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER/POLISH 1,535 0OZ .
16 0Z No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
- Product No:
Variances, if any;
18 MULTI SURFACE CLEANER 51,200 OZ
40 OZ. $0.2974 | $15,226.88
Packaging: 8/ Carton,40 OZ
MFG/Brand: Pine-Sol
Product No;  -S2164CT
Variances, if any:
SOAPS - PERSONAL USE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE
19 PERSONAL SIZE BAR SOAP 805 OZ
3.50Z $0.4095 | $329.65
Packaging: 72/Carton,3.1 oz
MFG/Brand: lvry
Product No: PGCQS:M
Variances, if any: 30z
20 HAND CLEANER 2,520 OZ

14 OZ.

Packaging: 12/Carton,14 oz

MFG/Brand: B9J0

Product No: 095712CT

Variances, if any:

$0.4582 $1,154.66
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -—----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT ~ UNITPRICE TOTAL PRICE

21 HAND CLEANER 4,320 0Z _
72 OZ. No Bid

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

22 POWDERED HAND SOAP ) 5,760 OZ

12 OZ. No Bid

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

DISPENSERS AND REFILLS - SCAPS AND SANITIZERS -PACKAGING VARRIATIONS FOR DISPENSER REFILLS WILL NOT
BE ACCEPTED, REFILLS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS
-ALL [TEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE

23 LOTION CLEANER REFILL, SANI-FRESH 1,152,000 ML(S)

**NO PACKAGING VARAINCES WILL BE ACCEPTED, | $0.0082 $9,446.40
MUST BE 800 ML PACKAGING TO BE COMPATIBLE
WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS

800 ML.
PaCkaging: 12 btl/cs,800 mi
MFG/Brand: Gdi°
Product No:  -S0J9106-12

Variances, if any:

24  SANI-FRESH DISPENSERS 12 EACH
$29.68 $356.24

**MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH 800 ML RE-FILLS (ITEM

23)
Packaging: -24/Cs
MFG/Brand; .Goio
Product No; 22803312
Variances, if any:
27 X3-10004 X3 (OR EQUIVALENT) FOAM HAND SANITIZER, 1,536 OZ
ALCOHOL FREE $0.5231 $803.48
1 GALLON
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

Contact:

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT

UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: EA4L
MFG/Brand: X3

Product No: 10004

Variances, if any:

28

BACTERIOSTATIC LOTION HAND SOAP
1 GAL

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

130 GAL(S)

No Bid

30

ANTIBACTERIAL SOAP, REFILL
1 GALLON

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

50 GAL(S)

No Bid

31

HONEY ALMOND LIQUID HAND SOAP
1 GAL

4/Case,1 Gal

Packaging:
MFG/Brand:

Victoria Bay Products

Product No: Looof12

Variances, if any:

100 GAL(S)

$19.33 $1,933.88

32

ANTIBACTERIAL ULTRA MILD SOAP WITHOUT
FORMALDEHYDE, NATURAL BASED

**NO PACKAGING VARAINCES WILL BE ACCEPTED,

MUST BE 800 ML PACKAGING TO BE COMPATIBLE
WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS
800 ML

Packaging: 12/Carton,800 mL

MFG/Brand: 9IS

Product No:  221212CT

Variances, if any:

4,800 ML(S)

$0.0156 | $74.88

CLOTHS, WIPES, AND RAGS
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY

DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
33 WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON 2,500 LB(S)
100 LBS. No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
1 34 TERRY BAR RAGS, WHITE, 15" X 18", SEWN ON FOUR 25 LB(S)
| SIDES No Bid
25 L B. BAGS, (190-200 CLOTHS/BAG)
| Packaging:
| MFG/Brand:
| Product No:
Variances, if any:
35 RECLAIMED POLO WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON ONLY 900 LB(S) .
| - NO EXCEPTIONS $2.81 $2,534.40
Packaging: 1/Case,25 Ib
MFG/Brand; Monarch
Product No; ~ N-WPKSM-25
Variances, if any:
|
|
| 36 TREATED NON-WOVEN DUSTING CLOTHS, 24" X 24" 1,000 EACH

50 RAGS
Packaging: -20%/Case
MFG/Brand; .Lavex
Product No: 248WIPERDYL

Its Not non-woven

Variances, if any:

$0.2847 $284.70

FLOOR AND CARPET CARE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE

38 FLOOR SWEEPING COMPOUND, WAX BASE

75 LBS./DRUM

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

75 LB(S) \o Bid
o Bi
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

39 FLOOR WAX
55 GALS./DRUM

110 GAL(S)
$23.91 $2,630.67

Packaging: 55 Gal. Drum
MFG/Brand: VISIONS™
Product No:
Variances, if any:
40 DEWAXER 110 GAL(S)
55 GALS./DRUM $27.03 $2,973.72
Packagjng: 55 Gal. Drum
MFG/Brand: BARE BONES
Product No:
Variances, if any:
41 HEAVY DUTY RUG SHAMPOO FOR WATER 640 OZ
EXTRACTION MACHINES No Bid
64 OZ.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
42 SPRAY BUFF 24 GAL(S)
1 GAL. $14.74 $353.95
Packaging: 4/Case, 1 Gal
MFG/Brand: JIheochem
Product No: 100483
Variances, if any:
43 DEFOAMER 24 GAL(S)

1 GAL.

Packaging: 2Case

MFG/Brand: _Theochem

Product No: 100801

Variances, if any:

$1787 | $428.88
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

44

CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT) FLOOR STRIPPER,
NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE
55 GALLON DRUM

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

14 DRUM(S)
No Bid

45

CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT) FLOOR FINISHER/WAX,
NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE
55 GALLON DRUM

Packaging: 252

MFG/Brand: NCL

2
Product No: 22

) ; CONCENTRATE
Variances, if any:

16 DRUM(S)
$1,315.03

$21,040.56

46

NEUTRA CLEAN BY CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT)
FLOOR CLEANER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO
USE )

55 GALLON DRUM

Packaging: ~>52

MFG/Brand: NCL

Product No:

) . CONCENTRATE
Variances, if any:

14 DRUM(S)
$737.31

$10,322.34

47

SCOLES X-FACTOR FLOOR FINISH OR EQUIVALENT
5 GAL/PAIL

Packaging: 252

MFG/Brand: NCL

Product No: 0510

Variances, if any:

100 GAL(S)
' $31.10

$3,110.40

48

SCOLES LIFT OFF FLOOR FINISHER OR EQUIVALENT
5 GAL/PAIL

Packaging: 28

MFG/Brand: MNCt

Product No: 2321

Variances, if any:

100 GAL(S) $28.37

$2,837.10
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

49 SCOLES BLUE CONCENTRATE, HEAVY DUTY NO

RINSE CLEANER OR EQUIVALENT

20 GAL(S)
$12.00 $240.19

5 GAL/PAIL
Packaging: >%a
MFG/Brand: JTheachem
Product No: 100445
Variances, if any:
50 SCOLES GREEN CLEAN OR EQUIVALENT 20 GAL(S)
1 GAL $14.74 $294.96
/
Packaging: 4/case,1 Gal
MFG/Brand: Iheochem
Product No: 100483
Variances, if any:
FLOOR PADS: STRIPPING, BUFFING, BURNISHING, CLEANING
51 BUFFER PAD, AC, WHITE, 20" DIAMETER FOR 10 PAD(S)
ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE $8.10 $81.00
5 PADS/CASE
Packaging: 5/Carton
MFG/Brand: [Boardwalk
Product No:  BYK4020WHI
Variances, if any:
52 BUFFER PAD, AC, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER FOR 10 PAD(S)
ADVANCE FLOOR MACHINE $8.10 $81.00
5 PADS/CASE '
Packaging: ~2<arton
MFG/Brand: Beardwalk
Product No: BWK4020BLA
Variances, if any:
53 BUFFER PAD, AC, RED, 20" DIAMETER FOR ADVANCE 10 PAD(S)

FLOOR MACHINE
5 PADS/CASE
5/Carton

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: Boardwalk

Product No: BWIK4020RED .

Variances, if any:

$8.10 $81.00
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

54 SUPER STRIPPING PAD, BLACK, 20" DIAMETER, 10 PAD(S)
BURGUNDY _ . $8.10 $81.00

Packaging: S/Carton

MFG/Brand: Boardwalk
Product No: BWK4020BLA

, \ Black
Variances, if any:

55 LIGHT QUICK STRIP STRIPPING PADS, 20" DIAMETER, 90 PAD(S)
GREEN $8.14 $732.60

5/CASE

Packaging: ~-2.caron

MFG/Brand: Boardwalk
Product No: BWK4020GRE

Variances, if any:

56 NATURAL HAIR BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER FOR 10 PAD(S)
ADVANCED FLOOR MACHINE $8.31 $83.10
5 PADS/CASE

5/Carton

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:; .Boardwalk
Product No-  EYVKAG20NHE

Variances, if any:

57 HEAVY BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK 10 PAD(S)

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A $8.10 $81.00
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A .
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

REQUESTED.

5 PADS/CASE
Packaging: ~ 2<aron
MFG/Brand; .Boardwalk
Product No: ~ WK4020BLA

Variances, if any:

58 LIGHT BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, WHITE 10 PAD(S)

*THIS PRODUCT MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

5 PADS/CASE

$8.21 $82.10
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025 N

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: -2/Caron

MFG/Brand: [Boardwak
Product No:  EXVKA0ZONAT

Variances, if any:

59 SURFACE PREPARATION PAD, 14" X 20", MAROON 110 PAD(S)

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FORUSE INA
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

5 PADS/CASE

$5.69 $625.90

Packaging: -2Y/Case

MFG/Brand; -Scrubble
Product No:  2/14x20
Variances, if any:

60 SCRUBBING PAD, 14" X 20", RED 110 PAD(S)

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A

CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION- PLEASE INCLUDE A $5.30 $583.00
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

5 PADS/CASE

10/Case

Packaging:

MFG/Brand: .Scardwalk
Product No:  BWKA402014RED

Variances, if any:

61 SWIVEL PAD, SUPER DUTY, BLACK, 4.5" X 10" 10 PAD(S)
5 PADS/BAG $1.94 $19.40

Packaging: 2%/Carton

MFG/Brand: Boardwalk
Product No: BWk403
Variances, if any:

Brown

62 SWIVEL PAD THREADED HOLDER 10 EACH
$8.28 $82.80
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
. 1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: ~J2/Carton
MFG/Brand: Boardwalk
Product No: BWK00405
Variances, if any:
63 TURF PAD, 14" X 20" GREEN FOR TILE AND GROUT 60 PAD(S) No Bid
O bl

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

CLEANING AIDS: BRUSHES, BROOMS, MOPS, BUCKETS, PLUNGERS, DUSTERS, SQUEEGEES, SPONGES, LITTER STICKS

64 BOWL BRUSH, WOODEN HANDLE 72 EACH
No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
65 TOILET BOWL BRUSH, ONE PIECE, SYNTHETIC 40 EACH
BRISTLES, WHITE, PLASTIC HANDLE ONLY $4.35 $174.00
Packaging: £2
MFG/Brand: .Lavex
Product No:  .897tbb14wh
Variances if any: Bristle Material Polypropylene
66 POT BRUSH, HEAVY DUTY WITH HANDLE WITH FOAM 25 EACH
BLOCK $6.27 $156.75
Packaging: 22
MFG/Brand; \Weiler
Product No: 22262
Variances, if any:
67 12" DECK BRUSH WITH HANDLE AND FOAM BLOCK 24 EACH
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact:

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
68 DECK BRUSH HEAD- 10" FOAM BLOCK WITH 24 EACH
THREADED HANDLE HOLE - SPLIT BRUSH SHAPE,
STRAIGHT AND ANGLED MULTILEVEL BRISTLES, LONG
LASTING BLUE POLYPROPYLENE FIBERS, STAIN
RESISTANT 'No Bid
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED. '
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
69 8"LONG COUNTER BRUSH WITH HANDLE, PLASTIC 24 . EACH

HORSEHAIR BLEND, 2.13" BRISTLE TRIM

EA

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: .Boardwalk

Product No: BWKS308

Polypropylene Bristles

Variances, if any:

$6.51 | $156.24

71 12" TOILET BOWL MOP, PLASTIC HANDLE

Packaging: 25/Carton

MFG/Brand: Boardwalk

Product No: BWK00160

Variances, if any:

100 EACH

$1.94 $194.00

72  PLUNGERS, TOILET, LARGE
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10 EACH

No Bid




County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY

DECEMBER 31, 2025

DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
73 17" TOILET PLUNGER - ALL PLASTIC HANDLE WITH 10 EACH
RUBBER END, BLACK, LARGE CUP SIZE - THREADED $7.45 $74.50
HANDLE
Packaging: -£/Caron
MFG/Brand; Boardwalk
Product No: BWKOSZT -
Variances, if any: 18™ Plastic Handle, Red/Black
74 16" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM WITH HANDLE, 5 60 EACH
ROWS NATURAL BASS FIBER, 6-1/4" TRIM No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
75 24" GARAGE SWEEPER WITH HANDLE 48 EACH
No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
76 #8 CORN BROOM 36 EACH
No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
77 14" ANGLE BROOM, 100% POLY PROPYLENE ONLY 12 EACH
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS IONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: 8/pk
MFG/Brand: Libman
Product No: 102

Variances, if any:

78 18" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM HEAD, FOAM _ 12 EACH $12.77 $153.25
PLASTIC BLOCK WITH 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES,
COURSE BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES

Packaging:  —12/CS
MFG/Brand; Boardwalk
Product No:  -BWK20318

Variances, if any:

79 LOBBY BROOM, BRISTLE - POLYPROPYLENE FILL, 24 EACH $14.98 $359.57
7.5" L X 2" W X 35" H, BLACK

6/cs

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid® Commercial
Product No;  RCP637400BLA

Variances, if any:

80 12" HEAVY DUTY DUST PAN, 20 GAUGE STEEL, 24 EACH $11.90 $285.77
BEVELED EDGE

12/cs

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: Impact
Product No: ~ -MP4212
Variances, if any:
81 DUST PAN WITH UPRIGHT 30" LONG HANDLE AND 12" 12 EACH $50.61 $607.35
WIDE DUST BIN
Packaging: Eac.h
MFG/Brand: Carlisle
Product No:  201410EC03

" Variances, if any:

82 12" DUST PAN, HAND HELD, ALL PLASTIC WITH NO 12 EACH $29.48 $353.85
METAL, WITH HANDLE HOLE '
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order --—--

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
. Packaging: Each
MFG/Brand; Lavex
Product No:  89ZHDP12PL
Variances, if any:
84 60" WOOD BROOM HANDLES, 1-1/8" DIAMETER, 48 EACH $8.53 $409.68
TAPERED
Packaging: ~ -12/CS
MFG/Brand; [Boardwalk
Product No: BWK125
Variances, if any:
85 60" BROOM HANDLES, METAL THREAD, PUSH BROOM 24 EACH $8.34 $200.23
THREADED
Packaging: 28
MFG/Brand: Boardwalk
Product No: BWK138
Variances, if any:
86 24" DUSTLESS MOPS, COMPLETE 12 EACH No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
89 DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS, 36" X 5", 12 EACH No Bid

SYNTHETIC GREEN, OPEN LOOP, LINT FREE COTTON

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

TOTAL PRICE

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE
90 DUSTLESS MOP FRAME, 36" X 5" METAL WIRE 12 EACH $8.60 $103.28
FRAME, RUST RESISTANT AND POWDER COAT
PAINTED WITH SWIVEL SNAP-TO HANDLE
Packaging:  -2lcs
MFG/Brand; Boardwalk
Product No: BWK1436
Variances, if any:
91 80" THREADED HANDLE - 1" DIAMETER, YELLOW 12 EACH No Bid
FIBERGLASS, MESH-VEILED TO PREVENT
SPLINTERING WITH SUPER TOUGH BLACK NYLON
PLASTIC STANDARD THREAD END
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
92 60" MOP HANDLE, 1" DIAMETER, FIBERGLASS, LATCH 68 EACH $12.27 $834.99
STYLE, QUICK CHANGE, HIGH IMPACT PLASTIC HEAD
(SNAP-N-GO)
Packaging: =ach
MFG/Brand; Lavex
Product No:  S9ZQFBHE0YL
Variances, if any:
93 MOP HEADS, 24 0OZ., 8 PLY, RAYON, CLOSED LOOP 120 EACH No Bid
" Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
94 MOP HANDLES FOR 24 OZ. MOP HEAD, WHITE 24 EACH No Bid
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -—-

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

95 MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CLOSED LOOP

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: 2/cs

MFG/Brand: 0-Cedar Commercial

Product No: 97312

Variances, if any:

1,375 EACH $10.06

$13,834.29

87 WAX MOP HEAD, 24 0Z, 1" HEAD BAND, LOOPED END,
RAYON, BLUE/WHITE STRIPED, 4-PLY

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

55 EACH No Bid

99 LAMBS WOOL DUSTER, TELESCOPIC, EXTENDS 33" -
60"

Packaging: Each
MFG/Brand: IMPACT PRODUCTS

Product No: 106

Variances, if any:

24 EACH $28.38

$681.12

100 PLASTIC POLYWOOL DUSTER - BRIGHT, MULTICOLOR

SYNTHETIC, FLEXIBLE POSITIONING HEAD,
TELESCOPIC HANDLE

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

12 EACH No Bid

101 INSTITUTIONAL BUCKET AND WRINGER, 35 QUART
BUCKET AND ONE PIECE FUNNEL SHAPED WRINGER,
NON-SCUFFING WHEELS, ALL PLASTIC, NO HANDLE
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2 EACH $88.11

$176.23




County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -—---

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: -Each
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: 2ZAMOPBCKTIN
Variances, if any:
102 MOP BUCKET, 3" CASTERS, 26 QT. 24 EACH $68.99 $1,655.91
Packaging: Each
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: 274MOPBCKTIN
Variances, if any:
103 MOP BUCKET, 14 QT. 24 EACH $28.48 $683.70
Packaging: -Each
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: 274PL14QGY
Variances, if any:
104 DOWNWARD PRESSURE WRINGERS FOR 26 QT. 12 EACH No Bid
BUCKET
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
105 24" PUSH AND PULL SQUEEGEE 12 EACH No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
108 6 GALLON WINDOW CLEANING BUCKET TO 6 EACH $47.48 $284.93

ACCOMMODATE 18" WASHERS AND SQUEEGEES
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -~

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: -=ach '
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No:  -B97WINCLBUCK
Variances, if any:
109 13' TELESCOPING POLE -2 SECTIONS 6 EACH No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
110 SQUEEGEE WITH 18" STRIP WASHER 6 EACH $25.82 $154.89
Packaging: 0/cs
MFG/Brand: Unger
Product No: UNGWCA450
Variances, if any:
111  STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGE HANDLE WITH RUBBER 6 EACH No Bid
GRIP
-Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
112 18" STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGEE 6 EACH $9.29 $55.74
Packaging: 1?/pk
MFG/Brand: Libman
Product No:
Variances, if any:
113 SPONGES, 4" X 6" X 2" 210 EACH $1.92 $403.73
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----= This Is Not An Order --—-

i

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: -24/cs
MFG/Brand: Boardwalk

Product No: BWKCS2

Variances, if any: Size: 3.67 x 6.08, 1.55"

114 SCRUBBER SPONGES, SCRUBBER ON ONE SIDE AND

SPONGE ON OTHER, 3" X 8"

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A

CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A

PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: .29/cS

MFG/Brand: [Boardwalk

Product No: BWK174

Variances, if any:

5,124 EACH $0.9280 $4,755.07

115 MAGIC ERASER BATHROOM SCRUBBER,4-1/2" X 3-1/5"

2 EA/BOX

Packaging: J2/pk
MFG/Brand: Lavex

Product No: 48312ERASERSPONGE

Variances, if any: Size: 4 3/4" x2 1/2"x 1"

24 EACH $2.72 $65.47

116 SCOURING PADS, HEAVY DUTY, 6" X 3.85"

Packaging:  -10/CS

MFG/Brand: _Scotch-Brite

Product No:  MMM22310CT

Variances, if any: Size: 3.8 x 6

24 PAD(S) $4.56 $1 09.47

117 ALUMINUM LITTER STICKS, 36"

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any: |

100 EACH No Bid
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
119 NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 36" REACH 86 EACH $29.73 $2,557.05
Packaging: £ach
MFG/Brand: UNGER
Product No: 92134
Variances, if any:
120 NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 51" HANDLE 22 EACH $47.57 $1,046.65
Packaging:  -/cS
MFG/Brand: Unger
Product No: UNGNN140
Variances, if any:
INSECT PESTICIDES AND RELATED ITEMS
121 ROACH AND ANT KILLER 2,880 0OZ $0.4148 ]1%$1,194.62
20 OZ.
Packaging: Each, 20 oz
MFG/Brand: Hot Shot
Product No: HG-96746
Variances, if any:
122 HOUSE AND GARDEN SPRAY, MUST INCLUDE WASPS 4,080 02 No Bid
& HORNETS '
20 0Z.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
123 FLYING INSECT SPRAY 3,060 OZ No Bid

20 OZ.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

PERSONAL HYGIENE ITEMS
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
— This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

124 PAPER TOILET SEAT COVERS 5,154 SHEET(S) $0.0107 $55.15

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

REQUESTED.
Packaging: .2000/cs
MFG/Brand: GEN
Product No: T EHGVTSC5000
Variances, if any:
125 URINAL SCREENS 1,680 SCREENS $229 $3,84283
12/PACKAGE
Packaging: 2
MFG/Brand: HOSPECO
Product No: ~ —2201%0]

Variances, if any:

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

126 |LOOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT FOR 15,000 LB(S) No Bid
PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, GREASES AND OTHER :
LIKE LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE
WHEN USED WITH PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, MEETS

OSHA STANDARDS
36 LBS/32QT/BAG
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
127 ICE MELTING PELLETS 75,000 LB(S) $0.4190 |[$31,425.00
50 LB. BAGS
Packaging: 201D

MFG/Brand: Paint Applicator Of America
Product No; 86700022

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

..... This Is Not An Order ----- Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

128 WET FLOOR SIGNS - YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 25" 24 EACH $21 24
HIGH, 2-SIDED, FOLDING

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

$509.70

Packaging: .Zach

MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: 274WFSGN25

Variances, if any: Material: Plastic

129 PLASTIC SYPHON DRUM PUMP, HEAVY DUTY, MUST 10 EACH $63.11
FIT 55 GAL DRUM WITH 2" OPENING

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

$631.08

Packaging: -Each
MFG/Brand: GROZ
Product No: 44402
Variances, if any:

130 32 OZ. SILK SCREENED PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH 10 EACH No Bid
SPRAYER, CLEAR OR WHITE (EMPTY) FOR USE WITH
KAIBOSH PRODUCTS (OR EQUIVALENT)

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

131 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE WITH SPRAYER, 10 EACH $4.22
YELLOW (EMPTY) -

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

$42.18
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: 2[Rk
MFG/Brand: Lavex

Product No:  00032KIT12YL

Variances, if any:

132

SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE
(ABOVE ITEM #165 AND #164) - COLOR: RED

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: 2/PK

MFG/Brand: Llavex

Product No: .J00STRM12TRRD

Variances, if any:

10 EACH 1$3.16

$31.55

133

SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE
(ABOVE ITEM #164) - COLOR: GREEN

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

. REQUESTED.

Packaging:  2/PK

MFG/Brand: Lavex

Product No: -J00STRM12TRGR

Variances, if any:

10 EACH $3.16

$31.55

134

SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE
(ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: BLUE

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: -2/pK
MFG/Brand: Lavex

Product No: JO0STRM12TRBL

Variances, if any:

10 EACH $3.16

$31.55
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
--=-- This Is Not An Order -~--~

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
135 SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE 10 EACH No Bid

(ABOVE ITEM #143 AND #164) - COLOR: WHITE OR

CLEAR

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION -PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

136 SPRAY NOZZLE TO FIT 32 OZ. PLASTIC SPRAY BOTTLE 10 EACH $3.16 $31.55
(ABOVE ITEM #163 AND #164) - COLOR: YELLOW

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FCOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

REQUESTED.
Packaging: 2/BK
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: 000STRM12TRYL

Variances, if any:

137 PAPER CUPS, 5 OZ , 1,000 CUP(S) $0.0343 1%$34.30
100/SLEEVE, 30 SLEEVES/CASE

Packaging: .3000/cs

MFG/Brand: Choice
Product No:  L80PCCOSW

Variances, if any:

138 WHITE FOAM COFFEE CUPS, 8 OZ. 1,000 CUP(S) $0.0545 $54.50
1000/CASE

Packaging: 25/bg, 40 bg/cs
MFG/Brand: Dart

Product No: DCCsJ8
Variances, if any:
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025 '

ITEM# DESCRIPTION ’ QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

139 TWO-PLY POLY TWINE, 10 LB., NYLON 2 ROLL(S) $62.49 $124.98

Packaging: .Each

MFG/Brand: _Tuff Tying
Product No:  —100poly2ply

Variances, if any:

WASTE AND RECYCLING CONTAINERS

140 32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, GRAY : 24 EACH $44.99 $1,079.70
Packaging: =ach
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No: A75tcl32gykt
Variances, if any:
141 32 GALLON CONTAINER WITH LID, WHITE 24 EACH $51.24 $1,229.70
Packaging: .Zach
MFG/Brand: Lavex
Product No:  275tci32whkt
Variances, if any:-
143 13 QT. WASTE BASKET , 48 EACH $11.49 $551.40
Packaging: .£ach
MFG/Brand: Llavex
Product No: 475WC13BK
Variances, if any:
144 28 1/2 QT. WASTE BASKET 24 EACH $10.83 $259.85
Packaging: -12/CS
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid
Product No: RCP295673BE

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

145 20 GALLON WHEELED TRASH CAN WITH LID

Packaging: .=ach

MFG/Brand; Lavex

Product No:  -A75tc20gykit

Variances, if any:

6 EACH $71.24 $427.43

146 RUBBERMAID (OR EQUIVALENT) 20 GALLON TRASH
CAN WITH LID, NO WHEELS

Packaging: -£ach

MFG/Brand: Lavex

Product No:  —475tcl20gykt

Variances, if any:

6 EACH $48.11 $288.68

148 SANITARY TILT TRUCK, BLACK, ERGONOMIC,
CONTOURED STRUCTURAL FOAM BODY
10" WHEELS, 450 LBS CAPACITY

Packaging: £2¢h
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid

Product No: LGST1300BLA

Variances, if any:

4 EACH $636.74 $2,546.94

ENVIROX BRAND PRODUCTS

149 ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117,
SANITIZER/VIRUCIDE CLEANER
4 GAL/CASE

Packaging: .2/cs

MFG/Brand: EnvirOx

Product No: 117-048

Variances, if any:

600 GAL(S) $62.09 $37,253.52

151 E2B2 WALL MOUNT DISPENSING SYSTEM

W/COLOR-CODED/ BI-LINGUAL SUPPORT MATERIALS

Packaging: £ach

MFG/Brand: EnVirOx

Product No: 4-252-117

Variances, if any:

6 EACH $232.03 $1,392.16
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RFB# F-27-2025

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
- ----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2025 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2025

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

152 ENVIROX H2GO PORTABLE DISPENSER FOR USE 4 EACH $74.03 $296.10
WITH H20RANGE2 117

Packaging: .=ach
MFG/Brand: EnVirox

Product No: EN-6-252-1
Variances, if any:

163 ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) GREEN LABEL, EMPTY 4 EACH $28.56 $114.24
SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H20ORANGEZ2, 32 OZ
CAPACITY

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: .5ach
MFG/Brand: .EnvirOx
Product No: 8-550
Variances, if any: '

154 ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) RED LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY 4 EACH $27.91 $111.65
BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H2ORANGEZ2, 32 0Z
CAPACITY

Packaging: ~.Each
MFG/Brand; .Envirox
Product No: 8232

Variances, if any:

TOTAL: $245,520.27

*** ALL ITEMS MUST BE BID IN THE UNIT OF MEASURE REQUESTED***
**** SEE ATTACHED SPECIFICATIONS ****

ALL INQUIRIES MUST BE SUBMITTED IN WRITING TO:
FORMALBIDQUESTIONS@CO.MONMQUTH.NJ.US

Various Delivery Locations:
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