

COUNTY OF MONMOUTH
STATE OF NEW JERSEY



FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS
MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP) F-24-2022

INCLUDES:

NOTICE TO BIDDERS
GENERAL CONDITIONS
EEO LANGUAGE
EEO QUESTIONNAIRE
BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIREMENTS
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP
IRAN DISCLOSURE FORM
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT

NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGMENT
BID DOCUMENT CHECKLIST
REQUEST FOR BID
ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS (if any)
SIGNATURE PAGE
ANTI-DISCRIMINATION IN EMPLOYMENT

AUTHORIZED: May 13, 2021

ADVERTISED: September 2, 2021

THOMAS A. ARNONE
DIRECTOR OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

MARION MASNICK
CLERK OF THE BOARD

TERI O'CONNOR
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

HELEN P. FIORE
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

NAME OF BIDDER: Keypart Army Navy

ADDRESS: PO Box 985
Brick NJ 08723

Phone: 732-673-5356 Fax: 732-264-6331

PLEASE INCLUDE ONE (1) UNBOUND ORIGINAL BID WITH SIGNATURE(S) AND TWO COPIES

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

RFB must be received no later than: September 29, 2021 10:30AM

For Delivery to: Various Delivery Locations. See Details Below.

Delivery Date: 1/1/2022 - 12/31/2022

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
WOLVERINE				
1	WOLVERINE BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS: ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$43,559.00 LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>42.5</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - () NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>25046.43</u> */PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
TIMBERLAND				



REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
2	<p>TIMBERLAND BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$12,225.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>25</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>9168.75</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
REEBOK				
3	<p>REEBOK BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$7521.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>42</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>4362.18</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
RED WING				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
4	RED WING BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR			
	IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:			
	ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$14,900.00			
	LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>42</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()			
	NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>8642.00</u>			
	*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
HITCHCOCK:				
5	HITCHCOCK BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR			
	IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:			
	ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$100.00			
	LESS DISCOUNT OF _____ % OFF (IF ANY) - ()			
	NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>NO BID</u>			
	*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
DOC MARTENS				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
6	<p>DOC MARTENS BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$100.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>0</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>100.00*</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
IRON AGE				
7	<p>IRON AGE BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$1400.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>25</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>1050.00</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
HERMAN SURVIVORS				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
8	<p>HERMAN SURVIVORS BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$100.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF _____ % OFF (IF ANY) - (_____)</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>NO BID</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
NEW BALANCE				
9	<p>NEW BALANCE BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$900.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>20</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - (_____)</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>720.00</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
TACTICAL SPORT				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
10	<p>TACTICAL SPORT BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$300.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF _____% OFF (IF ANY) - (_____)</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>NO BID</u></p> <p><i>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</i></p>			
CARHART				
11	<p>CARHART BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$2683.54</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>25</u>% OFF (IF ANY) - (_____)</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>2012.66</u></p> <p><i>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</i></p>			
CATERPILLAR				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
12	CATERPILLAR BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS: ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$1100.00 LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>20</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - () NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>880.00</u> */PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
CHIPPEWA				
13	CHIPPEWA BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS: ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$600.00 LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>20</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - () NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>480.00</u> */PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
BATES				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
14	<p>BATES BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$2000.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>35</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>1300 00</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
MAGNUM				
15	<p>MAGNUM BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$100.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>0</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>100 00</u></p> <p>*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
5.11 TACTICAL				

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
16	5.11 TACTICAL BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR			
	IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:			
	ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$1350.00			
	LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>20</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()			
	NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>1080.00</u>			
	*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			
SKETCHERS				
17	SKETCHERS BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR			
	IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:			
	ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$100.00			
	LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>0</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()			
	NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>100.00</u>			
	*/PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT			

DANNER

REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----



Monmouth County Purchasing
 Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
 1 East Main Street
 Freehold, NJ 07728
 (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Rebecca Szabo
 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY DEPARTMENTS FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2022 THROUGH DECEMBER 31, 2022 (MONMOUTH COUNTY CO-OP)

ITEM#	DESCRIPTION	QUANTITY/UNIT	UNIT PRICE	TOTAL PRICE
18	<p>DANNER BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$600.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF <u>20</u> % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>480.00</u></p> <p>*PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			
HAIX				
19	<p>HAIX BRAND WORK BOOTS AND SAFETY FOOTWEAR</p> <p>IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM ENTER THE NET COST TO THE COUNTY COMPUTED AS FOLLOWS:</p> <p>ESTIMATED AMOUNT AT MANUFACTURER'S SUGGESTED LIST PRICE: \$1100.00</p> <p>LESS DISCOUNT OF _____ % OFF (IF ANY) - ()</p> <p>NET COST TO COUNTY (ESTIMATED) \$ <u>No BID</u></p> <p>*PUT THIS AMOUNT IN THE "TOTAL PRICE" COLUMN FOR THIS ITEM. THE ACTUAL CONTRACT AND PURCHASE ORDER MAY USE A DIFFERENT AMOUNT AS AN ALLOWANCE FOR BOOTS, BUT BIDS WILL BE EVALUATED ON THIS AMOUNT</p>			

TOTAL: