RFB# F-16-2026

COUNTY OF MONMOUTH
STATE OF NEW JERSEY

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 F-16-2026

INCLUDES:
NOTICE TO BIDDERS NON-COLLUSION AFFIDAVIT
GENERAL CONDITIONS ADDENDUM ACKNOWLEDGMENT
EEO LANGUAGE BID DOCUMENT CHECKLIST
EEO QUESTIONNAIRE REQUEST FOR BID
BUSINESS REGISTRATION REQUIREMENTS ADDITIONAL SPECIFICATIONS (if any)
STATEMENT OF OWNERSHIP SIGNATURE PAGE

RUSSIA-BELARUS-IRAN DISCLOSURE FORM  ANTI-DISCRIMINATION IN EMPLOYMENT
AMERICANS WITH DISABILITIES ACT

AUTHORIZED: May 6, 2025

ADVERTISED: October 16, 2025

THOMAS A. ARNONE
DIRECTOR OF THE BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

TAMARA BROWN
CLERK OF THE BOARD

TERI O'CONNOR
COUNTY ADMINISTRATOR

HELEN P. FIORE
DIRECTOR OF PURCHASING

NAME OF BIDDER:wle
C»DM%,

ADDRESS: 25 Yraaw (oo coad Qover pewd pary
ACTSC QRO
o NJ
Phone: Q723 533 H}2b Fax: 73 233 172K
PLEASE INCLUDE ONE (1) UNBOUND ORIGINAL BID WITH SIGNATURE(S) AND TWO COPIES

 Page1ofs8 ’ BS-NS (Revised 9/2023)



County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
--=== This Is Not An Order -—---

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728 ‘
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

RFB must be received no later than: November 7, 2025 10:30AM

For Delivery to: Various Delivery Lodations. See Details Below.

. Delivery Date: 1/1/2026 - 12/31/2026
ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
;CLEANERS, DRAIN OPENERS, STAIN REMOVERS - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE
1 ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED 9,240 OZ
SPRAYER 0.0866 | 800.184
32 0Z.
Packaging: 1 2/3 2'02
MFG/Brand: -___Simoniz Clean Up
Product No: €0590012
Variances, if any:
2 ALL PURPOSE CLEANER, REFILL - NO SPRAYER 3,840 Oz
64 0Z. | 0.0542 | 208.128
Packaging: 4/1gal
MEG/Brand: Ridgedale Simoniz Lavender All Purpose Cleaner
Product No: R-2684AP4
Variances, if any:
3 TOILET BOWL CLEANER, PLASTIC BOTTLE 40,320 Oz
240z. 0.0804 | 3,241.73
Packaging: ' 12/320z
MFG/Brand: _Simoniz Freedom Mint
Product No: F1232012
Variances, if any:
4  WINDEX (OR EQUIVALENT) GLASS CLEANER WITH 95,496 OZ

AMMONIA D - PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED

SPRAYER

32 0Z.
Packaging: 8/3202
MFG/Brand: _Windex
Product No: 5CJ322338

Variances, if any:

0.1443 | 13,780.07
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----= This Is Not An Order -----

Contact:

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 '

DESCRIPTION

ITEM# QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
5 FOAM GLASS CLEANER, AEROSOL CANS 200 OZ ‘
20 0Z. 0.1057 21.14
Packaging: 12/320z
MFG/Brand: _Simoniz Aerosol Glass Cleaner
Product No: 33321012
Variances, if any:
6 HEAVY DUTY CLEANER AND DEGREASER 140 GAL(S)
1 GAL. ' 6.3167 | 884.338
Packaging: - 4 9?'
MFG/Brand: " Simoniz Blue Butyl
Product No: 80320004
Variances, if any:
7 MULTIPURPOSE CLEANER - NON AEROSOL 13,824 0Oz :
820z ‘ 0.0690 | 953.856
Packaging: - 12/ E_”ZOZ .
MFG/Brand: Simoniz Spray Kleen
‘Product No: 53440012
Variances, if any:
8  ALL PURPOSE POWDER CLEANSER, LEMON; - 5,712 0Z
PLASTIC CONTAINERS ONLY - 436.3968
PLAST | 0.0764
Packaging: 24/210z i
MFG/Brand: Colgate Ajax
Product No: 4278
Variances, if any:”
9 KAIBOSH DISINFECTANT (OR EQUIVALENT) ALL 43,200 Oz
PURPOSE AND GLASS DISINFECTANT (LIQUID)
PLASTIC BOTTLE WITH ATTACHED SPRAYER
DILUTION RATE 2 OZ /1 GALLON No Bid
32 0Z.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

--— This Is Not An Order ----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION : QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
10 DRAIN OPENER, PROFESSIONAL STRENGTH 11,520 OZ
64 OZ. 0.0603 | 694.656
Packaging: _ 41 ,9""' :
MFG/Brand: _>imoniz Open Up
Product No: 02449004
Variances, if any:
11 NON-CAUSTIC DRAIN OPENER/CLEANER 11,520 Oz _
64 0Z. . , 0.0603 | 694.656
Packaging:‘ - 4/_1 gal .
MEG/Brand: _Simoniz Open Up
Product No: - 02449004
Variances, if any:
12 BLEACH 660 GAL(S)
1 GAL. : . 43333 |2,859.978
Packaging: 6/1gal
MFG/Brand: Austin Generic 6%
Product No: 390
Variances, if any:
13 STAIN & ODOR REMOVER . 360 OZ
2002z 0.2644 | 95.184
Packaging: : 12/180z
MFG/Brand: Chase Products Aerosol Carpet Spot & Stain Remover
Product No; - —4%38-5146
Variances, if any:
15 FURNITURE POLISH, NO LEMON OIL 2,250 OZ
19 0Z. ' 0.1812 | 407.70
Packaging: - 12/190z
MFG/Brand: _Elite Furniture Polish
Product No: MD811

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
- (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# 'DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
16 ALUMINUM & STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER 1,224 OZ
1702 0.2663 | 325.9512
Packaging: - 12/ .ZOOZ —
MFG/Brand: _Claire Stainless Steel Cleaner & Maintainer
Product No: CLRC844
Variances, if any:
17 STAINLESS STEEL CLEANER/POLISH 1,635 OZ
100z 0.2891 | 443.7685
Packaging: 12/200:
MFG/Brand: _Claire Stainless Steel Polish / Cleaner
Product No: CLRC841
Variances, if any:
18 MULTI SURFACE CLEANER 51,200 OZ
40 0Z. 0.0595 | 3,046.40
Packaging: ' ' 12/320z
MFG/Brand: __Simoniz Clean Up All Purpose Cleaner
Product No: €0590012
Variances, if any: -
;SOAPS' - PERSONAL USE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE
19 PERSONAL SIZE BAR SOAP 805 OZ
3.5 0Z. .
0.3401 | 273.7805
Packaging: 72/3.10z
MFG/Brand: lvory Bar Soap P&G
Product No: PGC12364
Variances, if any:
20 HAND CLEANER 2,520 0OZ
14 OZ.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand: NO BID
_Product No:

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

-—-- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact:

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

21

HAND CLEANER
72 OZ.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

4,320 OZ

No BID

22

POWDERED HAND SOAP
12 0Z.

Packaging: 30lb Box

MFG/Brand: Simoniz Kem Suds Kleen

€S0350050

Product No:

Variances, if any:

5,760 OZ

0.0535 | 308.16

DISPENSERS AND REFILLS - SOAPS AND SANITIZERS -PACKAGING VARRIATIONS FOR DISPENSER REFILLS WILL NOT
BE ACCEPTED, REFILLS MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS
i-ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE

23

LOTION CLEANER REFILL, SANI-FRESH

**NO PACKAGING VARAINCES WILL BE ACCEPTED,
MUST BE 800 ML PACKAGING TO BE COMPATIBLE
WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS

800 ML.

Packaging: 12/800mL

1,152,000 ML(S)

MFG/Brand: Simoniz PHLO in a box Pink

Product No: P2410800

Variances, if any:

0.0035 |4,032.00

24

SANI-FRESH DISPENSERS

**MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH 800 ML RE-FILLS (ITEM

23)
1/ea

Packaging:

MFG/Brand: __Simoniz 800mL dispenser

Product No: DAADISP#1

Variances, if any:

12 EACH

11.36 136.32

27

X3-10004 X3 (OR EQUIVALENT) FOAM HAND SANITIZER,
ALCOHOL FREE
1 GALLON
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 ' ' '

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: 4/1gal
MFG/Brand: Kutol Alcohol Free
Product No: 68209
Variances, if any:
28 BACTERIOSTATIC LOTION HAND-SOAP 130 GAL(S)
1GAL A 8.225 | 1,069.25
Packaging: 4/1gal
MFG/Brand: _Simoniz Antibacterial Hand Soap
Product No: A0065004 -
Variances, if any: '
30 ANTIBACTERIAL SOAP, REFILL ‘ 48 GAL(S) )
! GALLON | 8.225 | 39480
Packaging: - 4/1gal :
MEG/Brand: Simoniz Antibacterial Hand Soap
Product No: A0065004 -

Variances, if any:

32 ANTIBACTERIAL ULTRA MILD SOAP WITHOUT 4,800 ML(S)
FORMALDEHYDE, NATURAL BASED

**NO PACKAGING VARAINCES WILL BE ACCEPTED,

MUST BE 800 ML PACKAGING TO BE COMPATIBLE - | 0.0043 | 20.64
WITH EXISTING COUNTY DISPENSERS .
800 ML

Packaging: 12/800mL

MFG/Brand: _hopak Antibacterial Hand Soap

Product No: 2031-404

Variances, if any:

CLOTHS, WIPES, AND RAGS

33 WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON ‘ 4,000 LB(S)
ANY COLOR _ .
NO LESS THAN 8" X 8" IN SIZE 1.596 6,384.00
100 LBS.
Packaging: SQIb Box
MFG/Brand: Imperial
Product No: R101W

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID

- This Is Not An Order --—- Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

’ (732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 :

ITEM# DESCRIPTION, QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
34 TERRY BAR RAGS, WHITE, 15" X 18", SEWN ON FOUR 25 LB(S) ‘
SIDES 50
25 LB. BAGS, (190-200 CLOTHS/BAG) 3.14 78.
Packaging: 251b Box
MFG/Brand: Hospeco
Product No: 237-25
Variances, if any:
35 RECLAIMED POLO WIPING RAGS, 100% COTTON ONLY 900 LB(S) .
- NO EXCEPTIONS ‘
ANY COLOR . 1.53 1,377.00
NO LESS THAN 8" X 8" IN SIZE
Packaging: 501b Box
MFG/Brand: Hospeto Reclaimed Colored Knits
Product No: ] 35f50
Variances, if any:
36 TREATED NON-WOVEN DUSTING CLOTHS; 24" X 24" 1,000 EACH
50 RAGS '
’ 0.2247 | 224.70
Packaging: 500/cs
MFG/Brand: _Sheppard 24x24 treated yellow dust cloths
Product No: EMEZT24YF
Variances, if any:
;FLOOR AND CARPET CARE - ALL ITEMS MUST BE FRAGRANCE FREE
38 FLOOR SWEEPING COMPOUND, WAX BASE 75 LB(S)
75 LBS./DRUM -
Packaging: No Bid
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
39 FLOOR WAX 55 GAL(S) ‘
55 GALS./DRUM
14.4545 | 794.9975
Packaging: - 55gal Drum
MFG/Brand: Simoniz Wet Look
Product No: (5074055

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
 REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 4317379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

TOTAL PRICE

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE
40 DEWAXER 55 GAL(S)
55 GALS./DRUM 8.6545 475.9975
Packaging: 55gal Drun
MFG/Brand: Simoniz Z-Strip Floor Stripper
Product No: Z4564055
Variances, if any:
41 HEAVY DUTY RUG SHAMPOO FOR WATER 640 OZ
EXTRACTION MACHINES 0.0928 59.392
64 OZ. ) )
Packaging: 4/1gal
MFG/Brand; Simoniz Carpet Shampoo .
Product No: €0520004
Variances, if any:
42 SPRAY BUFF 24 GAL(S)
1AL 12475 | 29940
Packaging: - 4 1 gal _
MFG/Brand: | Simoniz Maintain Spray Buff
Product No: €50725004 .
Variances, if any: -
43 DEFOAMER 24 GAL(S)
1 GAL.
10.175 244 20
Packaging: _4/1 gal
MFG/Brand: Simoniz No Foam Defoamer
Product No: N2600004
Variances, if any:
44 CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT) FLOOR STRIPPER, 1 DRUM(S)
NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE
55 GALLON DRUM No Bld

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
45 CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT) FLOOR FINISHER/WAX, 1 DRUM(S)
NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO USE 795.00 795.00
55 GALLON DRUM
Packaging: 559al Drum
MFG/Brand: _Simoniz Wet Look
. Product No: €5074055
Variances, if any: _
46 NEUTRA CLEAN BY CHEM-TEK (OR EQUIVALENT) 1 DRUM(S)
FLOOR CLEANER, NON-CONCENTRATE READY TO
USE
55 GALLON DRUM .
, No Bid
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
47 - SCOLES X-FACTOR FLOOR FINISH OR EQUIVALENT 100 GAL(S)
5 GAL/PAIL 16.78 1167800
Packaging: 5gal Pail
MFG/Brand: Simoniz Premier Plus Floor Finish
Product No: C350653009
" Variances, if any:
48 SCOLES LIFT OFF FLOOR FINISHER OR EQUIVALENT 100 GAL(S)
® CALPALL . 8.4 844.00
Packaging: ‘59al Pail -
MFG/Brand: Z-Strip Floor Stripper Simoniz
Product No: 24564005
Variances, if any:
49 SCOLES BLUE CONCENTRATE, HEAVY DUTY NO 20 GAL(S)
RINSE CLEANER OR EQUIVALENT
5 GAL/PAIL
Packaging: ' .
MFG/Brand: No Bid
Product No:

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

* Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026 -

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
. 732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# A DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
50 SCOLES GREEN CLEAN OR EQUIVALENT 20 GAL(S)
-1 GAL
Packaging: No Bld
MFG/Brand:
7 Product No:
Variances, if any:
FLOOR PADS: STRIPPING, BUFFING, BURNISHING, CLEANING
57 HEAVY BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, BLACK 10. PAD(S)
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A } .
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE 3.5013 | 35.013
REQUESTED. )
5 PADS/CASE
Packaging: 3/cs i
MFG/Brand: Professional Choice
Product No: PC20BLA
Variances, if any:
58 LIGHT BURNISHING PAD, 20" DIAMETER, WHITE 10 PAD(S)
*THIS PRODUCT MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A 3 576
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE . 35.76
REQUESTED.
5 PADS/CASE
Packaging: s/cs
MFG/Brand: Professional Choice
Product No: PC2OWHT
Variances, if any:’
59 SURFACE PREPARATION PAD, 14" X 20", MAROON 10 PAD(S)
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
-CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEG SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE 4.1373 41373
REQUESTED. )
5 PADS/CASE
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID _
----= This Is Not An Order -----

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

‘Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026
ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: 10/ cs .
MFG/Brand: __Professional Choice Maroon Pad
Product No: PAD14x20MAR
Variances, if any:
60 SCRUBBING PAD, 14" X 20", RED 10 PAD(S)

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION- PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

54346 | 54.346

REQUESTED.
5 PADS/CASE c
Packaging: fes
MFG/Brand: Professional Choice Red Pad
Product No: PAD14x20RD
Variances, if any:
61 SWIVEL PAD, SUPER DUTY, BLACK, 4.5" X 10" 10 PAD(S)
5 PADS/BAG 0.994 9.94
Packaging: 4/5pads —
MFG/Brand: Advantage Black Heavy Duty Utility Pad
Product No: ADV041-06
Variances, if any:
62 SWIVEL PAD THREADED HOLDER 10 EACH
52666 | 52.666
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: _Tolco Utility Swivel Pad Holder
Product No: 101280157
Variances, if any:
63 TURF PAD, 14" X 20" GREEN FOR TILE AND GROUT 10 PAD(S)

Packaging: 2/es
MFG/Brand: Jomar Industries 14x20 green turf pad
Product No: PAD14x20TURF

Variances, if any:

25.2533 | 252.533

:CLI_EANING AIDS: BRUSHES, BROOMS, MOPS, BUCKETS, PLUNGERS, DUSTERS, SQUEEGEES, SPONGES, LITTER STICKS
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
64 BOWL BRUSH, WOODEN HANDLE 21" 72 EACH
WINCO BR-21W OR EQUIVALENT 4.5867 |330.2424
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: 1omar Industries 15" Bowl Brush w/ Wooden Handle
Product No: TOL280103
Variances, if any:
65 NORSHELL N-82 POLYPROPELENE BRUSH OR 40 EACH
EQUIVALENT, ONE PIECE, SYNTHETIC BRISTLES, 1 5 2 00
WHITE, ALL PLASTIC 3.80 )
' Packaging: 1/ea -
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid
Product No: FG631000WHT-ea
Variances, if any:
66 POT BRUSH, HEAVY DUTY WITH HANDLE WITH FOAM 24 EACH
BLOCK
Packaging: n:
MFG/Brand: NO Bld
Product No:
Variances, if any:
67 12" DECK BRUSH WITH HANDLE AND FOAM BLOCK 24 EACH
Packaging: No Bid
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
‘68 DECK BRUSH HEAD- 10" FOAM BLOCK WITH 24 EACH
THREADED HANDLE HOLE - SPLIT BRUSH SHAPE,
STRAIGHT AND ANGLED MULTILEVEL BRISTLES, LONG
LASTING BLUE POLYPROPYLENE FIBERS, STAIN
RESISTANT No Bld

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

-—-- This Is Not An Order ~----

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 '

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
69 8"LONG COUNTER BRUSH WITH HANDLE, PLASTIC 24 EACH
HORSEHAIR BLEND,. 2.13" BRISTLE TRIM
Packaging: No Bid
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
70 DUST BRUSH, BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLE, 8" 36 EACH
" FACE WITH 4" HANDLE, ALL ONE PIECE PLASTIC AND
A HANGING HOLE ON THE HANDLE
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROV‘ED FORUSEINA .
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A .
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE No Bid
-REQUESTED. :
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
71 12" TOILET BOWL MOP, PLASTIC HANDLE 96 EACH
1.30 124.80
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: !mpact
Product No: IMP204
Variances, if any:
72 PLUNGERS, TOILET, LARGE 96 EACH
3.95 379.20
. 1/ea :
Packaging:
MFG/Brand: Professional Choice
- Product No: HBS01

Variances, if any:
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----= This Is Not An Order -----

- Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 '

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
73 17" TOILET PLUNGER - ALL PLASTIC HANDLE WITH . 12 EACH
* RUBBER END, BLACK, LARGE CUP SIZE - THREADED | 395 47.40
HANDLE , .
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Professional Choice
Product No: HBS01

Product is 21"

Variances, if any:

74 16" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM WITH HANDLE, 5 62 EACH :
ROWS NATURAL BASS FIBER, 6-1/4" TRIM : 16.60 |1,029.20
: ,029.

Packaging: 1/ea : :
MFG/Brand: _ABCO Street Broom 16" w/ Threaded Handle
Product No: BH-13003-ea

Variances, if any:

75 24" GARAGE SWEEPER WITH HANDLE B ' 48 EACH

17.40 835.20

Packaging: ' 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Carlisle Garage Broom Palmyra 24" w/ Threaded Handle

Product No: CAR3621912400
Variances, if any: S

76  #8 CORN BROOM . 36 EACH

11.50 414.00

Packaging: 6/cs

MFG/Brand: Performance Plus Corn Warehouse Broom
Product No: P33134 )

Variances, if any: -

77 14" ANGLE BROOM, 100% POLY PROPYLENE ONLY 12 EACH

6.7166 | 80.5992

Packaging: 12/cs
MFG/Brand: ABCO Large Angle Broom w/ Plastic Cap

Product No: BR-1024MH
Variances, if any: .
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431'-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

 REQUEST FOR BID
----- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION ‘ QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

78 18" HEAVY DUTY STREET BROOM HEAD, FOAM 12 EACH
PLASTIC BLOCK WITH 2 THREADED HANDLE HOLES,
COURSE BLACK POLYPROPYLENE BRISTLES .

Packaging: No Bld
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
. Variances, if any:
79 LOBBY BROOM, BRISTLE - POLYPROPYLENE FILL, 12 EACH )
7.5"LX2"W X 35" H, BLACK ) , 448 53.76
Packaging: 1/ ca
MFG/Brand: Performance Plus Lobby Broom
Product No: P36960-ea
Variances, if any:
80 12" HEAVY DUTY DUST PAN, 20 GAUGE STEEL, 12 EACH
JBEVELED EDGE . ‘ 9.8266 117.9192
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: _Hospeco Metal Heavy Duty Dust Pan
Product No: 4212-ea
Variances, if any: ,
81 DUST PAN WITH UPRIGHT 30" LONG HANDLE AND 12" 12 EACH
~ WIDE DUST BIN 12.60 151.20
1 .
Packaging: fea
MFG/Brand: Performance Pius Lobby Panw/ 36" Metal Handle
Product No: PP-LDPBK
Variances, if any:
82 12" DUST PAN, HAND HELD, ALL PLASTIC WITH NO 12 EACH
METAL, WITH HANDLE HOLE 4 04 48.48
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Hospeco Plastic Dust Pan 12"
Product No: 710-ea

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

- This Is Not An Order -—---

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Sophia Giézey
732-431-7370 x7381

Contact:

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 ‘

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
84 60" WOOD BROOM HANDLES,1-1/8" DIAMETER, 48 EACH
TAPERED 4.2667 | 204.8016
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: __Carlisle Tapered Wood Handle 60" x 1 1/8
Product No: CAR4026200
Variances, if any:
85 60" BROOM HANDLES, METAL THREAD, PUSH BROOM 48 EACH :
THREADED
4.2256 | 202.8288
. 1/ea
Packaging: :
MFG/Brand: _ABCO Tapered Wood Handle 60" w/ Metal Thread
Product No: 01114-ea
Variances, if any:
86 24" DUSTLESS MOPS, COMPLETE 48 EACH :
' ' 15.50 | 744.00
Packaging: 1/ea - -
MFG/Brand: ,O’'Cedar 24" Maxidust & Mopstick
Product No: - —OCEDARG516_OCED96024
Variances, if any:
87 24"' DUSTLESS MOP REPLACEMENT HEADS . 48 EACH
6.90 331.20
Packaging: 12/cs
MFG/Brand: __O'Cedar Maxidust
Product No: OCEDAR96024
Variances, if any:
88 DUSTLESS MOP HANDLE, 1" DIAMETER X 60" 48 EACH
FIBERGLASS SHAFT, 180 DEGREE SWIVEL ACTION 20.40 979.20
WITH SPRING CLIP/SNAP FOR FRAME
" Packaging: 1/ea _
MFG/Brand: Catlisle 60" Threaded Fiberglass Handle Yellow
Product No: CAR4022004

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: ‘Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM#

DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

90

DUSTLESS MOP FRAME, 36" X 5" METAL WIRE
FRAME, RUST RESISTANT AND POWDER COAT
PAINTED WITH SWIVEL SNAP-TO HANDLE

Packaging: 6/cs

MFG/Brand: Sheppard

Product No: GENMS9536-5x36 Heavy Duty Mop Frame

Variances, if any:

48 EACH

5.60

268.80

91

60" THREADED HANDLE - 1" DIAMETER, YELLOW
FIBERGLASS, MESH-VEILED TO PREVENT
SPLINTERING WITH SUPER TOUGH BLACK NYLON
PLASTIC STANDARD THREAD END

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

144 EACH

No Bid

92

60" MOP HANDLE, 1" DIAMETER, FIBERGLASS, LATCH
STYLE, QUICK CHANGE, HIGH IMPACT PLASTIC HEAD
(SNAP-N-GO)

1/ea

Packaging:

MFG/Brand: Hospeco Fiberglass Mop Handle Quick Change

Product No: 10044-00

Variances, if any:

48 EACH

12.80

614.40

93

MOP HEADS, 24 OZ., 8 PLY, RAYON, CLOSED LOOP

Packaging: 12/cs

MFG/Brand:

Professional Choice 240z Rayon Mop Heads

Product No: 97513

Variances, if any:

48 EACH

5.50

264.00

94

MOP HANDLES FOR 24 OZ. MOP HEAD, WHITE
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----= This Is Not An Order -

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

. FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION - QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Packaging: 1/ea '
MFG/Brand: mpact 60" Jaw fiberglass Mop Handle
Product No: IMPWHG0

Variances, if any:

95 MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CLOSED LOOP 1,776 EACH

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A

CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A N Bd
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE O bl
REQUESTED.
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
96 MOP HEADS, 20 OZ. 4 PLY RAYON, CUT END 48 EACH
4.25 204.00
Packaging: 12/cs :
MFG/Brand: _Professional Choice
Product No: PCMOP20B
Variances, if any:
97 WAX MOP HEAD, 24 0Z, 1" HEAD BAND, LOOPED END, 48 EACH
RAYON, BLUE/WHITE STRIPED, 4-PLY ‘
Packaging: No Bid
MFG/Brand: : ' :
Product No:
Variances, if any:
99 |LAMBS WOOL DUSTER, TELESCOPIC, EXTENDS 33" - 24 EACH
60 850  |204.00
Packaging: 1/ea:
MFG/Brand: _mpact Telescopic 30" to 45" Lambswool-Duster
Product No: 'MP310"5 -
Variances, if any: . 30°-45" length
100 PLASTIC POLYWbOL DUSTER - BRIGHT, MULTICOLOR 12 EACH
SYNTHETIC, FLEXIBLE POSITIONING HEAD, 10.80 129.60
TELESCOPIC HANDLE ‘
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
-—--- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH .
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Hospeco Extendable Polywool Duster 52"-84"
Product No: 3120-ea
Variances, if any:
101 INSTITUTIONAL BUCKET AND WRINGER, 35 QUART : . 11 EACH .
BUCKET AND ONE PIECE FUNNEL SHAPED WRINGER, ' 1 32 80 ’]'46080
NON-SCUFFING WHEELS, ALL PLASTIC, NO HANDLE :
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid Institution Wave Break Combo
Product No: EG759088YE|
Variances, if any:
102 STANDARD MOP BUCKET, 3“l CASTERS, 26 QT. ' 24 EACH
RUBBERMAID 2064914 OR EQUIVALENT . 9700 2328 OO
Packaging: . 4/cs
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid Wave Break Bucket & Casters 35qt
Product No: 2064914
Variances, if any:
103 MOP BUCKET, 14 QT. ’ 24 EACH ) ;
15.50 372.00
Packaging: 12/cs
MFG/Brang: _OCedar 14qt Gray Bucket w/ Handle
Product No: OCEDI6373
Variances, if any:
104 DOWNWARD PRESSURE WRINGERS FOR 26 QT. 12 EACH
BUCKET. ' : 163.00. | 1,956.00
Packaging: 1/ ea.
MFG/Brand:  Rubbermaid Wave Break Downpress Wringer
Product No: 2064959-ea ‘
. Variances, if any:
105 24" PUSH AND PULL SQUEEGEE . 12 EACH
960 11520
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FORBID

---=< This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

DESCRIPTION

ITEM# QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: 1/ea )
MFG/Brand: _Ettore 22" Wipe N' Dry Floor Squeegee
Product No: E171636
Variances, if any:
107 CARLISLE P/N 3656703 (OR EQUIVALENT) 20" FLOOR-_ 36 EACH
* SQUEEGEE HEAD, ALL PLASTIC, SOLID ONE PIECE
WITH THREADED END FOR HANDLE
Packaging: ‘ No Bid
MFG/Brand: '
Product No:
Variances, if any:
108 & GALLON WINDOW CLEANING BUCKET TO . 6 EACH :
ACCOMMODATE 18" WASHERS AND SQUEEGEES 30 50 ‘]8300
‘Packaging: 1/ea - -
MFG/Brand: _Sheppard 6gal Cleaning Bycket w/ Lid Gray
Product No: GENS19004
Variances, if any:
109 13' TELESCOPING POLE - 2 SECTIONS 6 EACH
5190 | 31140
Packaging: b/cs
MFG/Brand: __Ettore 12' 2 Section Extension Pole
Product No: ETT42112
Variances, if any: -
110 SQUEEGEE WITH 18" STRIP"WASHER 6 EACH
' 4390 |263.40
Packaging: 6/cs
MFG/Brand: _Ettore 18" Backflip Stainless Steel Squeegee
Product No: ETT71181
Variances, if any:
111 STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGE HANDLE WITH RUBBER 6 EACH
GRIP
7.50 45.00
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
—_— This Is Not An Order -—---

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging: 12/cs
MFG/Brand: Ettore Master Stainless Steel Window Squeegee Handle
Product No: ETT1330 —
Variances, if any:
112 18" STAINLESS STEEL SQUEEGEE _ ' 6 EACH -
_ 10.30 61.80
Packaging: 12/cs - ‘
MFEG/Brand: _Ettore 18" Stainless Steel Window Squeegee
Product No: ETT1181 :
Variances, if any: -
113 SPONGES, 4" X 6" X 2" 210 EACH
1.65 346.50
Packaging: 24/cs
MFG/Brand: _Sheppard 4x6x1 Yellow
Product No: PAD6G3
Variances, if any:
114 SCRUBBER SPONGES, SCRUBBER ON ONE SIDE AND 1,716- EACH
SPONGE ON OTHER, 3" X 6"
*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USEIN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A : 085 1 '45860
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED. ’
Packaging: 20/cs
MFG/Brand: _3M Niagara Scrubber & Sponge 3.3x6x1
Product No: 74N . _
Variances, if any:
115 MAGIC ERASER BATHROOM SCRUBBER,4-1/2" X 3-1/5" 24 EACH
2 EA/BOX 1.10 2640
Packaging: 6/6ct
MFG/Brand: _Mrt. Clean Magic Eraser
Product No: PGC79009

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION - QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
116 SCOURING PADS, HEAVY DUTY, 6" X 3.85" 24 ‘PAD(S)
0.65 15.60
Packaging: - 1/ea
MEG/Brand: Niagara Heavy Duty 6x9 Green Scouring
Product No;:, —86N
Variances, if any:
117 ALUMINUM LITTER STICKS, 36" 100 EACH
9.80 980.00
Packaging: 1/ea - -
MEG/Brand: Ettore Trash Picker Pointed w/ Safety Guard
Product No: ETT49042
Variances, if any:
119 NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 36" REACH 36 EACH
24.50 882.00
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Ettore Grip N' Grab 32"
Product No: EET24“9!036
Variances, if any: ength
120 NIFTYNABBER GRABBER, 51" HANDLE ' .62 EACH
2850 | 1.767.00
Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Ettore Gl'lp N' Grab 50"
Product No: - ETT4?1 0
Variances, if any: 30" length
]NSECT PESTICIDES AND RELATED ITEMS ,
121 ROACH AND ANT KILLER 2,880 OZ
20 0Z. . .
0.2272 | 654.336
Packaging: 12/150z
MFG/Brand: _Chase Ant & Roach Killer
Product No: 438-5107

Variances, if any:
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County of Monmouth

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing

REQUEST FOR BID
---== This Is Not An Order -----

Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE

TOTAL PRICE

122 HOUSE AND GARDEN SPRAY, MUST INCLUDE WASPS
& HORNETS
20 0Z.

12/200z

Packaging:

MFG/Brand: __Claire Jet Force Wasp / Hornet Killer Spray

Product No: 1005

Variances, if any:

4,080 0z

0.3313

1,351.704

123 FLYING INSECT SPRAY
200Z.

Packaging: 12/180z

MFG/Brand: __Chase Flying Insect Spray

Product No: 438-5102

Variances, if any:

3,060 OZ

0.2872

878.832

PERSONAL HYGIENE ITEMS

124 PAPER TOILET SEAT COVERS

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE [N A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: 20/250

MFG/Brand: _Empress Half-Fold Toilet Seat Cover

ETSC120500

Product No:
Variances, if any:

15,100 SHEET(S)

0.0073

110.23

MISCELLANEOUS SUPPLIES

126 | OOSE GRANULAR ABSORBENT FOR
PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, GREASES AND OTHER
LIKE LIQUID SPILLS, UNSCENTED, NON-FLAMMABLE
WHEN USED WITH PETROLEUM-BASED OILS, MEETS
OSHA STANDARDS
36 LBS/32QT/BAG

Packaging: 35lb Bag

MFG/Brand: Sheppard oil dri absorbent

Product No: OD35LB

Variances, if any:

14,636 LB(S)

0.5935

8686.466
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
---== This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# ' DESCRIPTION ' QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
127 ICE MELTING PELLETS 75,000 LB(S)
50 LB. BAGS : 0.3180 |23,850.00
Packaging: 50lb Bag
MFG/Brand: __Green Ice Melt
Product No: SSGICEMELT

Variances, if any:

128 WET FLOOR SIGNS - YELLOW, POLYPROPYLENE, 25" 12 EACH
HIGH, 2-SIDED, FOLDING

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A ’ 127.392

CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A ; 10.616
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: 10/cs

MFG/Brand: Janico Wet Floor Sign -

Product No: F1431070

Variances, if any:

129 PLASTIC SYPHON DRUM PUMP, HEAVY DUTY, MUST 12 EACH
FIT 55 GAL DRUM WITH 2" THREADED OPENING

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A

PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

REQUESTED. : No Bid

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

139 TWO-PLY POLY TWINE, 10 LB., NYLON 1 ROLL(S)

Packaging: : y No Bid
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

WASTE AND RECYCLING CONTAINERS
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

----- This Is Not An Order --—-

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-73;70 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

. DECEMBER 31, 2026
ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT . UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
142 RUBBERMAID (OR EQUIVALENT) WASTE BASKETS, 24 EACH

14.25" X 10.5" X 15", BLACK, MUST BE FLAME
RETARDANT

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

Packaging: 1/ea

MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid 28qt Fire Resistant Waste Basket

Product No; FG254300RI A-ea

Variances, if any:

63.50 1,524.00

143 13 QT. WASTE BASKET

Packaging: 1/ea

MFG/Brand: _Rubbermaid Small Waste Basket 13qt

Product No: G295500BlA-e

Variances, if any:

24 EACH

8.40 201.60

144 28 1/2 QT. WASTE BASKET

Packaging: 1/ea

MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid Medium Waste Basket 28 1/2 gt

Product No: FG295600BLA-ea

Variances, if any:

24 EACH

9.00 216.00

145 20 GALLON WHEELED TRASH CAN WITH LID

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

24 EACH

No Bid

146  RUBBERMAID (OR EQUIVALENT) 20 GALLON TRASH
CAN WITH LID, NO WHEELS .
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County of Monmouth
REQUEST FOR BID

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey

732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH

DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE
Packaging:
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:
148 SANITARY TILT TRUCK, BLACK, ERGONOMIC, 24 EACH

CONTOURED STRUCTURAL FOAM BODY,
10" WHEELS, 450 LBS CAPACITY, FLAME RETARDANT

Packaging: 1/ea
MFG/Brand: Rubbermaid 450ib Tilt Truck
Product No: FGQR30400BLA

Variances, if any:

530.00 [12,720.00

;ENVIROX BRAND PRODUCTS

149 ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117,
SANITIZER/VIRUCIDE CLEANER
4 GAL/CASE

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

1,200 GAL(S)

No Bid

150 ENVIROX H2 ORANGE2 CONCENTRATE 117,
SANITIZER/VIRUCIDE CLEANER - BULK

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE
REQUESTED.

55 GALLON DRUM

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

55 GAL(S)

No Bid

151 E2B2 WALL MOUNT DISPENSING SYSTEM
W/COLOR-CODED/ BI-LINGUAL SUPPORT MATERIALS

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:

Product No:

Variances, if any:

6 EACH

No Bid
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RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor

1 East Main Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
----=- This Is Not An Order -----

Contact: Sophia Giézey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026

ITEM# DESCRIPTION _ QUANTITY/UNIT UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

152 ENVIROX H2GO PORTABLE DISPENSER FOR USE 6 EACH :
WITH H20RANGE2 117 : _ ‘ ,

No Bid.

Packaging:
MFG/Brand: .
Product No:
Variances, if any:

153 ENVIROX (COLOR CODED-) GREEN'LABEL, EMPTY ‘ . 12 EACH
SPRAY BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H20RANGE2, 32 0Z .
CAPACITY

*THIS ITEM MUST BE APPROVED FOR USE IN A i
CORRECTIONAL INSTITUTION - PLEASE INCLUDE A ‘No Bid
PRODUCT SPEC SHEET. SAMPLES MAY BE

REQUESTED.

Packaging:

MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

154 ENVIROX (COLOR CODED) RED LABEL, EMPTY SPRAY 12 EACH
BOTTLE FOR USE OF #117 H20RANGE2 320Z

CAPACITY ' No Bid
Packaging: '
MFG/Brand:
Product No:
Variances, if any:

T?)TAL: 1D, g@é «BB2.

*PLEASE NOTE: ANY GAP IN ITEM NUMBERS SHOULD BE DISREGARDED. THE MONMOUTH COUNTY PURCHASING

SYSTEM DOES NOT RE-NUMBER THE BID WHEN ITEMS ARE NOT REQUISITIONED, CAUSING THE NUMBERING GAPS
BETWEEN ITEMS. .

Various:Delivery Locations:

Division of Highway

Public Works Complex

250 Center Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

Cassandra Deckle 732-431-6550
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County of Monmouth

REQUEST FOR BID
’ --=== This Is Not An Order ----~

RFB# F-16-2026

Monmouth County Purchasing
Hall of Records, 3rd Floor
- 1 East Main Street
Freehold, NJ 07728
(732) 431-7370 Fax (732) 431-7379

Contact: Sophia Giezey
732-431-7370 x7381

FURNISH AND DELIVER JANITORIAL SUPPLIES FOR VARIOUS MONMOUTH COUNTY
DEPARTMENTS ON-CALL, AS NEEDED FOR THE PERIOD JANUARY 1, 2026 THROUGH
DECEMBER 31, 2026 ' '

ITEM# DESCRIPTION QUANTITY/UNIT ' UNIT PRICE TOTAL PRICE

Department of Facilities Management
Special Services Complex

300 Halls Mill Road

Freehold, NJ 07728

Karen Retzer 732-431-7360 x2136

Department of Facilities Management
Special Services Complex '
300 Halls Mill Road

Freehold, NJ 07728

Karen Retzer 732-431-7360 x2136

Division of Fleet Services

Public Works Complex

250 Center Street

Freehold, NJ 07728

Joe Ponisi - x7165 or Kyle Dodig - x7164 732-431-7830

Sheriff's Office - Correctional Institution .
P.O. Box 5007

1 Waterworks Road

Freehold, NJ 07728

Jeff Sauter 732-431-7860 x1203
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